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LEGAL NOTICES
File No: 24-01007WA NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE Pursuant to RCW 61.24 et seq. 
Grantor(s) of Deed of Trust Brendan Jones 
Current Beneficiary NFM, Inc. dba NFM 
Lending Current Trustee Affinia Default 
Services, LLC Current Mortgage Servicer 
Dovenmuehle Mortgage, Inc. Deed of Trust 
Recording Number (Ref. #) 202206290382 
Parcel Number(s) 00401000002300 I. NO-
TICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the under-
signed Trustee will on November 1, 2024, 
at 10:00 AM sell at public auction located 
Outside The North Plaza Entrance to the 
Snohomish County Courthouse, 3000 Rock-
efeller Ave, Everett, WA 98201, to the high-
est and best bidder, payable at the time of 
sale, the following-described real property, 
situated in the County of Snohomish, State 
of Washington, to wit: LOT 23, CANYON 
FALLS PARK, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT 
THEREOF, RECORDED IN VOLUME 18 
OF PLATS, PAGES 118, 119 AND 120, RE-
CORDS OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASH-
INGTON. SITUATE IN THE COUNTY OF 
SNOHOMISH, STATE OF WASHINGTON 
Commonly known as: 19632 Canyon Drive, 
Granite Falls, WA 98252 The above property 
is subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
June 27, 2022, recorded June 29, 2022, 
under Auditor’s File No. 202206290382, re-
cords of Snohomish County, Washington, 
from Brendan Jones, as Grantor, to Chicago 
Title as Trustee, to secure an obligation in 
favor of Mortgage Electronic Registration 
Systems, Inc., as designated nominee for 
NFM, Inc. dba NFM Lending, beneficiary of 
the security instrument, its successors and 
assigns, as Beneficiary, the beneficial inter-
est in which was assigned to NFM, Inc. dba 
NFM Lending, under an Assignment record-
ed under Auditor’s File No. 202403150370. 
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s de-
fault on the obligation secured by the Deed 
of Trust. III. The defaults for which this fore-
closure is made are as follows: 1. Failure to 
pay when due the following amounts which 
are now in arrears: o $23,019.55 which in-
cluded the monthly payments, late charges, 
and accrued fees and costs. IV. The sum 
owing on the obligation secured by the 
Deed of Trust is: Principal $239,921.39, to-
gether with interest as provided in the Note 
or other instrument secured from September 
1, 2023, and such other costs and fees as 
are due under the Note or other instrument 
secured, and as are provided by statute. V. 
The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust as 
provided by statute. The sale will be made 
without warranty, express or implied, regard-
ing title, possession, or encumbrances on 
November 1, 2024. The default(s) referred 
to in paragraph III must be cured by Octo-
ber 21, 2024 (11 days before the sale date), 
to cause a discontinuance of the sale. The 
sale will be discontinued and terminated if 
at any time on or before October 21, 2024 
(11 days before the sale date), the default(s) 
as set forth in paragraph III are cured and 
the Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. The 
sale may be terminated any time after Octo-
ber 21, 2024 (11 days before the sale date), 
and before the sale by the Borrower, Grantor, 
any Guarantor, or the holder of any recorded 
junior lien or encumbrance paying the entire 
principal and interest secured by the Deed 
of Trust, plus costs, fees, and advances, if 
any, made pursuant to the terms of the ob-
ligation and/or Deed of Trust, and curing all 
other defaults. VI. A written notice of default 
was transmitted by the Trustee to the Bor-
rower and Grantor at the following address-
es: Brendan Jones 19632 Canyon Drive 
Granite Falls, WA 98252 Brendan Jones 
307 Mcrae Rd NW Arlington, WA 98223 by 
both first class and certified mail on May 10, 
2024; and the notice of default was person-
ally served upon the Borrower and Grantor, 
or was posted in a conspicuous place on 
the real property described in paragraph I 
above on May 11, 2024. The Trustee has 
possession of proof of mailing, and service 
or posting. VII. The Trustee whose name and 
address are set forth below will provide in 
writing to anyone requesting it, a statement 
of all costs and fees due at any time prior to 
the sale. VIII. The effect of the sale will be to 
deprive the Grantor and all those who hold 
by, through or under the Grantor of all their 
interest in the above-described property. IX. 
Anyone having an objection to the sale on 
any grounds whatsoever are afforded an op-
portunity to be heard as to those objections 
if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the sale pur-
suant to the RCW 61.24.130. Failure to bring 
such a lawsuit may result in a waiver of any 
proper grounds for invalidating the Trustee’s 
sale. X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TEN-
ANTS: The purchaser at the trustee’s sale is 
entitled to possession of the property on the 
20th day following the sale, as against the 
Grantor under the Deed of Trust (the owner) 
and anyone having an interest junior to the 
deed of trust, including occupants who are 
not tenants. After the 20th day following the 
sale, the purchaser has the right to evict oc-
cupants who are not tenants by summary 
proceedings chapter 59.12 RCW. For ten-
ant-occupied property, the purchaser shall 
provide a tenant with written notice in accor-
dance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE 
IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You 
have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 
the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trust-
ee Sale to be referred to mediation. If this 
is an amended Notice of Trustee Sale pro-
viding a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 

DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Telephone: 1-877-894-HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) Website: http://www.dfi.
wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/post_
purchase_counselors_foreclosure.htm The 
United States Department of Housing and 
Urban Development: Telephone: 1-800-569-
4287 Website: http://www.hud.gov/offices/
hsg/sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=s
earch&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The 
statewide civil legal aid hotline for assistance 
and referrals to other housing counselors 
and attorneys: Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 
Website: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear 
PURSUANT TO THE FAIR DEBT COL-
LECTION PRACTICES ACT, YOU ARE AD-
VISED THAT AFFINIA DEFAULT SERVIC-
ES, LLC MAY BE DEEMED TO BE A DEBT 
COLLECTOR AND ANY INFORMATION 
OBTAINED MAY BE USED FOR THAT PUR-
POSE. DATED June 25, 2024. By: Reina 
Rivas Name: Reina Rivas Title: Foreclosure 
Specialist of Affinia Default Services, LLC 
Current Address: 320 120th Ave. NE, Suite 
B203 Bellevue, WA 98005 *Please note that 
our offices are moving the Summer of 2024. 
To confirm our address, please contact our 
office by phone or email info@affiniadefault.
com. (425) 800-4703 NPP0461913 To: SNO-
HOMISH COUNTY TRIBUNE 10/02/2024, 
10/23/2024

French Slough Flood Control District (FS-
FCD) meets the second Thursday of every 
month at 6:30 am. Location: French Creek 
Hunt Club    12525 Old Snohomish Monroe 
Rd Snohomish, Wa. 98290. Attendees: con-
tact Scott Lane (Manager) scottlane11t@
gmail.com to confirm dates and time. Pub-
lished in the Snohomish County Tribune Oc-
tober 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON FOR COWLITZ 
COUNTY IN THE ESTATE OF BARBARA 
L. MCPHERSON, Deceased Case No. 24-
4-00331-08 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS The Personal Representative named 
below has been appointed and has qualified 
as the Personal Representative of this es-
tate.  Any person having a claim against the 
Decedent must present the claim: (a) Before 
the time when the claim would be barred by 
any applicable statute of limitations, and (b) 
In the manner provided in RCW 11.40.070: 
(i) By filing the original of the claim with the 
foregoing Court, and (ii) By serving on or 
mailing to me at the address below a copy 
of the claim.  The claim must be presented 
by the later of: (a) Thirty (30) days after I 
served or mailed this Notice as provided in 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c), or (b) Four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of this No-
tice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time period, the claim will be forever barred 
except as provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective for claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of First Publica-
tion: October 9, 2024 Personal Representa-
tive DEBORAH L. IVERSON, 264 Basswood 
DR, Silverlake, WA 98645. Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 
23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON FOR COWLITZ 
COUNTY IN THE ESTATE OF PERRY N. 
MCPHERESON, Deceased Case No. 24-4-
00330-08 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS The Personal Representative named 
below has been appointed and has qualified 
as the Personal Representative of this es-
tate.  Any person having a claim against the 
Decedent must present the claim: (a) Before 
the time when the claim would be barred by 
any applicable statute of limitations, and (b) 
In the manner provided in RCW 11.40.070: 
(i) By filing the original of the claim with the 
foregoing Court, and (ii) By serving on or 
mailing to me at the address below a copy 
of the claim.  The claim must be presented 
by the later of: (a) Thirty (30) days after I 
served or mailed this Notice as provided in 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c), or (b) Four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of this No-
tice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time period, the claim will be forever barred 
except as provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective for claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of First Publica-
tion: October 9, 2024 Personal Representa-
tive DEBORAH L. IVERSON, 264 Basswood 
DR, Silverlake, WA 98645. Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 
23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON FOR KING COUNTY Es-
tate of MATTHEW B. SIMPSON, Deceased. 
NO. 24-4-06677-0 SEA PROBATE NOTICE 
TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 The per-
sonal representative named below has been 
appointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 

attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed the 
notice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months after the 
date of first publication of the notice. If the 
claim is not presented within this time frame, 
the claim is forever barred, except as other-
wise provided in Section 11 of this act and 
RCW 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. Date of First Pub-
lication October 16, 2024 WENDY A. SIMP-
SON, Personal Representative Attorney for 
Personal Representative: Yvette O’Connell 
Address for Mailing or Service: 7801 Green 
Lake Dr. N. Seattle, WA 98103 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune October 16, 
23 & 30, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON FOR THE COUNTY 
OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter of the Es-
tate of John E. Cearfoss, Deceased, NO. 
24-4-02070-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The per-
sonal representative named below has been 
appointed and has qualified as Personal 
Representative of this estate.  Any Person 
having a claim against the decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred 
by any otherwise applicable statute of limi-
tations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on 
or mailing to the Personal Representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney, at 
the address stated below, a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of such claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of; (1) thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of this Notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 of this 
act and RCW 11.40.060. This bar is effective 
as to claims against both the decedent’s pro-
bate assets and nonprobate assets. Date of 
first publication: October 16, 2024 Personal 
Representative: Kristi Walker Attorney for 
Personal Representative: Randy M. Boyer 
WSBA 8665 Address for Mailing or Service: 
7017 196th St. S.W. Lynnwood, WA 98036 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
October 16, 23 & 30, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON FOR THE COUNTY OF 
SNOHOMISH In the Matter of the Estate 
of: ROSEMARY D. EDWARDS, Deceased. 
No. 24-4-02066-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS The Personal Representative 
named below has been appointed and has 
qualified as Personal Representative of this 
estate.  Persons having claims against the 
deceased must, prior to the time such claims 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the Personal 
Representative, the Resident Agent for the 
Personal Representative, or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing 
the original of the claim with the court.  The 
claim must be presented within the later of: 
(1) Thirty days after the Personal Represen-
tative served or mailed the notice to the cred-
itor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice.  If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  
This bar is effective as to claims against both 
the probate assets and nonprobate assets 
of the decedent. DATE OF FILING COPY 
OF NOTICE TO CREDITORS with Clerk of 
Court: October 15, 2024. DATE OF FIRST 
PUBLICATION: October 23, 2024 Personal 
Representative: Christopher R. Larson c/o 
Hickman Menashe, P.S. 4211 Alderwood 
Mall Blvd., Ste. 204 Lynnwood, WA  98036 
Attorney for Estate and for the Personal Rep-
resentative: William S. Hickman Address: 
Hickman Menashe, P.S. 4211 Alderwood 
Mall Blvd., Ste. 204 Lynnwood, WA  98036 
Telephone: (425) 744-5658 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 23, 30 & 
November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON FOR WHAT-
COM COUNTY In re the Estate of John R. 
Ascherl, deceased Case No. 24-4-00843-37 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) The Administrator named below 
has been appointed as Administrator of this 
estate. Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070, by 
serving on or mailing to the Administrator or 
the Administrator’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which 
the probate proceedings were commenced. 
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the Administrator 
served or mailed this notice to the credi-
tor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of this notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: October 9, 2024 

Anthony Erickson, Estate Administrator At-
torney for Estate Administrator: Emily Rose, 
WSBA# 46673 LIMITLESS LAW PLLC 1313 
E. MAPLE STREET, SUITE 400 BELLING-
HAM, WA 98225 (360) 685-0145 Published 
in the Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 
16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY LAKEVIEW LOAN 
SERVICING, LLC, Plaintiff, vs. DENIS Y. 
VAKULCHIK; ALL UNKNOWN HEIRS AND 
DEVISEES OF TYANNA L. VAKULCHIK, 
DECEASED; THE SECRETARY OF HOUS-
ING AND URBAN DEVELOPMENT; THE 
WASHINGTON STATE HOUSING FINANCE 
COMMISSION; AND OCCUPANTS OF THE 
PREMISES, Defendants. CASE NO.: 24-
2-05675-31 SUMMONS FOR PUBLICA-
TION (60 DAYS) TO THE DEFENDANT/
RESPONDENT(S) ALL UNKNOWN HEIRS 
AND DEVISEES OF TYANNA L. VAKUL-
CHIK, deceased: You are hereby summoned 
to appear within sixty days after the date of 
the first publication of this summons, to wit, 
within sixty days after the 18th day of Sep-
tember, 2024, and defend the above entitled 
action in the above entitled court, and answer 
the complaint of the plaintiff  NEWREZ LLC 
D/B/A SHELLPOINT MORTGAGE SERVIC-
ING and serve a copy of your answer upon 
the undersigned attorneys for plaintiff, ZBS 
Law, LLP, at their office below stated; and in 
case of your failure so to do, judgment will 
be rendered against you according to the 
demand of the complaint, which has been 
filed with the clerk of said court. This is a 
Complaint for Judicial Foreclosure of Deed 
of Trust. DATED: September 10, 2024 ZBS 
LAW, LLP.  By: /s/ Tom B. Pierce Tom B. 
Pierce, WSBA# 26730 Attorney for Plaintiff 
ZBS Law, LLP 11335 NE 122nd Way, Suite 
105 Kirkland, WA 98034 Ph. 206-209-0375 
Fax 206-260-8870 Published in the Snohom-
ish County Tribune September 18, 25, Octo-
ber 2, 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF KING In re the Estate 
of CHARLES LEE WILLIS, JR., Deceased. 
NO. 24-4-06803-9 SEA PROBATE NOTICE 
TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) PLEASE 
TAKE NOTICE The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
October 23, 2024 Personal Representative: 
Erik Haugen Willis Attorney for PR: Dianlyn 
G. Cenidoza, Llewellyn & Shafer, PLLC Ser-
vice Address: 4847 California Ave SW, Ste 
100, Seattle, WA 98116 Court of Probate/
Cause #: King County Superior Court, 24-
4-06803-9 SEA Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23, 30 & November 
6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF KING In the Matter of 
the Estate of Patrick M. Callan, Deceased 
CAUSE NO. 24-4-05241-8 SEA NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.020) The person 
named below has been appointed Admin-
istrator of this estate.  Any person having 
a claim against the Decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Administrator or the Administrator’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Administrator served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: October 23, 2024 ADMINISTRA-
TOR Laurie M. Callan 22712 1st Pl W Both-
ell, WA 98021 ATTORNEY FOR PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE Amber L. Hunt Woodin-
ville Law 13901 NE 175th St, Ste G Woodin-
ville, WA 98072 (425) 485-6600 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune October 23, 
30 & November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF PIERCE In re the Estate of: 
Jaelene Price, deceased. Case No. 24-4-
01154-7 NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) Walter S. Terry has been ap-
pointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 

the decedent that arose before the dece-
dent’s death must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (a) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed the 
notice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months after the 
date of first publication of the notice.  If the 
claim is not presented within this time frame, 
the claim will be forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
October 9, 2024. Personal Representative: 
Walter S. Terry Attorney for Estate: Date: 
October 2, 2024 /s/ Jason Giesler, WSBA 
No. 44390 Address for Mailing or Service: 
Madeline Gauthier Gauthier and Associates, 
2223 112th Avenue N.E., Suite 202 Bellevue, 
WA 98004 Phone: 425-637-3019 and Pierce 
County Superior Court Clerk of the Superior 
Court 930 Tacoma Ave S, #334, Tacoma, 
WA 98402516 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH DAN GAHN, 
JR. and CYNTHIA PASS, husband and wife, 
Plaintiffs v. THE ESTATE OF DAN GAHN 
SR.; J AND H TRUST; BENJAMIN GAHN in 
his personal capacity and in his capacity as a 
representative of the Estate of Dan Gahn Sr. 
and as a trustee of the J and H Trust; LORI 
BABCOCK, in her personal capacity and in 
her capacity a as representative of the Es-
tate of Dan Gahn Sr. and as a trustee of the 
J and H Trust; MICHAEL KNEPPER, ELISE 
RANDALL, an individual; MICHAEL RAN-
DALL, an individual and also all other per-
sons or parties unknown claiming any right, 
title, interest, estate, or lien in the subject 
property; Defendants. NO. 22-2-00559-31 
SUMMONS TO: The above-named defen-
dants.  A lawsuit has been started against 
you in the above-entitled court by Plaintiffs. 
Plaintiff’s claims  are stated in the Written 
Complaint, a copy of which is served upon 
you with this summons. In order to defend 
against this lawsuit, you must respond to the 
complaint by stating your defense in writing 
and by serving a copy upon the persons sign-
ing this summons within twenty (20) days 
after service of this summons, excluding the 
day of service, if you are served within the 
State of Washington, or within sixty (60) days 
after service of this summons, excluding the 
day of service, if you are served outside the 
State of Washington. If you do not respond, 
a default judgment may be entered against 
you without notice. A default judgment is one 
where plaintiffs are entitled to what they ask 
for because you have not responded.  If you 
serve a notice of appearance on the under-
signed persons, you are entitled to notice 
before a default judgment may be entered. 
Any response or notice of appearance which 
you serve on any party to this lawsuit must 
also be filed by you with the court, within 20 
days after the service of summons, exclud-
ing day of service. YOU may demand that 
the plaintiffs file this lawsuit with the court. 
If you do so, the demand must be in writ-
ing and must be served upon the persons 
signing this summons. Within fourteen (14) 
days after you serve the demand, the plain-
tiffs must file this lawsuit with the court, or 
the service of this summons and complaint 
will be void. If you wish to seek the advice 
of an attorney in this matter, you should do 
so promptly so that your written response, 
if any, may be served on time.  THIS SUM-
MONS is issued pursuant to Rule 4 of the 
Superior Court Civil Rules of the State of 
Washington. DATED this 31st day of Janu-
ary, 2022. SKYLINE LAW GROUP PLLC 
By Michele K. McNeill Attorneys for Plain-
tiffs SKYLINE LAW GROUP PLLC 40 Lake 
Bellevue Dr, Ste 100 Bellevue, WA  98005 
425-455-4307  Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 2, 9, 16, 23, 30 & 
November 6,  2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Estate 
of JOANNE LOUISE BRANCH Deceased. 
Case No.: 24-4-00362-31
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
October 9, 2024 Personal Representative: N 
Driggers Address for Mailing or Service: PO 
BOX 740093, Arvada, CO 80003 Court 
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of probate proceedings and case number: 
SNOHOMISH County; 24-4-00362-31 At-
torneys for Administrator: Warner Allen of 
WarrenAllen LLP.  Published in the Snohom-
ish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Estate 
of: BARBARA J. CHAPMAN, Deceased. NO.   
24-4-02115-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The Personal Represen-
tative named below has been appointed 
as Personal Representative of this estate.  
Any person having claims against decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the Personal Representa-
tive or the Personal Representative’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months after 
the date of first publication of the notice.  If 
the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of first publication: 
October 23, 2024 CRAIG A. CHAPMAN, 
Personal Representative c/o Sarah Duncan, 
Attorney 3128 Colby Avenue Everett, WA 
98201 425-339-8556 Published in the Sno-
homish County Tribune October 23, 30 & 
November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Es-
tate of: DUDLEY HUDSON GORDON, De-
ceased. NO.   24-4-01982-31 NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The Person-
al Representative named below has been 
appointed as Personal Representative of this 
estate.  Any person having claims against 
decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months after 
the date of first publication of the notice.  If 
the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of first publication: 
October 9, 2024 JEFFREY L. GORDON, 
Personal Representative c/o Maren Bene-
detti, Attorney 3128 Colby Avenue Everett, 
WA 98201 425-339-8556 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 
23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In Re the Estate 
of: EUGENE J. DOBSON, Decedent. Case 
No.: 24-4-01724-31 NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS The Personal Representative named 
below has been appointed and has qualified 
as the personal representative of this estate. 
Persons having claims against the deceased 
must, prior to the time such claims would 
be barred by any otherwise applicable stat-
ute of limitations, serve their claims on the 
personal representative or on the attorney of 
record at the address stated below and must 
file an executed copy of the claim with the 
Clerk of this Court within four months after 
the date of first publication of this Notice or 
within four months after the date of filing of 
the copy of this Notice with the Clerk of the 
Court, whichever is the later, or except under 
those provisions included in RCW 11.40.060, 
the claim will be forever barred. Date of filing 
copy of Notice to Creditors: August 20, 2024 
Date of first publication: October 16, 2024 
/s/ Andrea K. Dobson Personal Representa-
tive COGDILL NICHOLS REIN WARTELLE 
ANDREWS /s/ Douglas M. Wartelle, WSBA 
25267 Attorney for Personal Representative 
c/o Cogdill Nichols Rein Wartelle Andrews 
3232 Rockefeller Avenue Everett, WA 98201 
(425) 259-6111 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 16, 23 & 30, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter of 
the Estate of Donna A. McLeod, Deceased 
CAUSE NO. 24-4-02037-31 NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.020) The person 
named below has been appointed Personal 
Representative of this estate.  Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred 
by any otherwise applicable statute of limita-
tions, present the claim in the manner pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the Personal Representative or 
the Personal Representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 

against both the Decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: October 9, 2024 PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE Linda Chervenka 1015 
Breton Rd SE Grand Rapids, MI 49506 AT-
TORNEY FOR PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE Amber L. Hunt Woodinville Law 13901 
NE 175th St, Ste G Woodinville, WA 98072 
(425) 485-6600 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the 
Matter of the Estate of JEFFREY BRYAN 
PRIMM, Deceased. No. 24-4-02033-31 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS PURSUANT TO 
RCW 11.40.030 Joyce Primm Schweickert 
has been appointed and has qualified as 
Personal Representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time when the claim would 
be barred by any otherwise applicable stat-
ute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as pro-
vided under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of 
the notice. If the claim is not presented within 
one of these time frames, the claim is for-
ever barred, except as otherwise provided in 
RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the pro-
bate assets and non-probate assets of the 
decedent. DATE OF FILING COPY OF THE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS with the Clerk of 
the Court: October 7, 2024. DATE OF FIRST 
PUBLICATION: October 9, 2024. T. Jeffrey 
Keane, Attorney for Personal Representative 
Keane Law Offices 100 NE Northlake Way, 
Suite 200 Seattle, WA 98105 Personal Rep-
resentative: Joyce Primm Schweickert 3638 
Hunts Point Road Hunts Point, WA 98004 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter 
of the Estate of Mary Dodson, Deceased 
CAUSE NO. 24-4-02036-31 NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.020) The person 
named below has been appointed Personal 
Representative of this estate.  Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred 
by any otherwise applicable statute of limita-
tions, present the claim in the manner pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the Personal Representative or 
the Personal Representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: October 9, 2024 PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE Steve Dodson 12726 W 
Vista Paseo Dr Litchfield Park, AZ 85340 AT-
TORNEY FOR PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE Amber L. Hunt Woodinville Law 13901 
NE 175th St, Ste G Woodinville, WA 98072 
(425) 485-6600 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter 
of the Estate of MICHAEL J. DUFFY, De-
ceased. NO. 24-4-01943-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS The personal 
representative named below has been ap-
pointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. Date of first publica-
tion: 10/09/2024 Date of Filing Notice with 
Clerk: 09/30/2024 SHERYL A. STECKLY-
DUFFY, Personal Representative Blair J. 
Bennett, WSBA #50360 Bennett & Bennett, 
PLLC Attorneys at Law 400 Dayton, Suite A 
Edmonds, WA 98020 (425) 776-0139 Pub-
lished in the Snohomish County Tribune Oc-
tober 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the 
Matter of the Estate of ROCKY A. ALLEN, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-01912-31 NOTICE 
TO CREDITORS PURSUANT TO RCW 
11.40.030 Michelle (Allen) Abbott has been 
appointed and has qualified as Personal 

Representative of this estate. Any person 
having a claim against the decedent must, 
before the time when the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the Personal Representa-
tive at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the latter of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as pro-
vided under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of 
the notice. If the claim is not presented within 
one of these time frames, the claim is for-
ever barred, except as otherwise provided in 
RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the pro-
bate assets and non-probate assets of the 
decedent. DATE OF FILING COPY OF THE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS with the Clerk 
of the Court: October 14, 2024. DATE OF 
FIRST PUBLICATION: October 16, 2024. 
Personal Representative: Michelle (Allen) 
Abbott 6619 118th Dr SE, Snohomish, WA 
98290 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune October 16, 23 & 30, 2024.

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE 
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF: DOROTHY 
R. PORTER, Deceased. No. 24-4-02091-
31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney 
at the address stated below a copy of the 
claim and must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the personal repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020 
(3); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice . If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and non-probate assets. 
Date of filing of Notice to Creditors: Octo-
ber 4, 2024 Date of first publication: Octo-
ber 9, 2024 /s/ MELINDA L. PADDLEFORD 
Personal Representative of the Estate of 
DOROTHY R. PORTER ATTORNEY FOR 
ESTATE: PATRICK M. TRIVETT, WSBA 
#38906 LAW OFFICES OF P. TRIVETT, 
PLLC 1031 State Avenue, Suite 103 Marys-
ville, Washington 98270 Phone: (360) 653-
2525 Fax: (360) 653-6860 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 
23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter of 
the Estate of: ELIZABETH M. MEYER, De-
ceased. No. 24-4-02026-31 PROBATE NO-
TICE TO CREDITORS The Personal Repre-
sentative named below has been appointed 
and has qualified as the Personal Represen-
tatives of this estate.  Any person having a 
claim against the decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any other-
wise applicable statute of limitations, present 
the claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by (a) serving on or mailing to the 
Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and (b) filing 
the original of the claim with the court.  The 
claim must be presented within the latter of: 
(1) thirty days after the Personal Represen-
tative served or mailed the notice to the cred-
itor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of this notice.  If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  This bar 
is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
DATE OF FILING COPY OF NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS with Clerk of Court: October 
10, 2024. DATE OF FIRST PUBLICATION:  
October 16, 2024. Personal Representative: 
Leslie Sharkey 2923 95th St. SE Everett, WA 
98208 Attorney for the Personal Representa-
tive: Ceth D. Hickey Address for Mailing or 
Service: Ceth D. Hickey Hickman Menashe, 
P.S. 4211 Alderwood Mall Blvd., Ste 202 
Lynnwood, WA 98036 DATED:  October 9, 
2024. HICKMAN MENASHE, P.S. /s/ Ceth D. 
Hickey, WSBA #55590 Attorney for Personal 
Representative Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 16, 23 & 30, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter 
of the Estate of: GAYANN GALE SMITH, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02118-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS The Personal 
Representative named below has been ap-
pointed and has qualified as the Personal 
Representatives of this estate.  Any person 
having a claim against the decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred 
by any otherwise applicable statute of limi-
tations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by (a) serving 
on or mailing to the Personal Representative 
or the Personal Representative’s attorney 
at the address stated below a copy of the 
claim and (b) filing the original of the claim 
with the court.  The claim must be presented 
within the latter of: (1) thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-

ter the date of first publication of this notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. DATE OF FILING COPY 
OF NOTICE TO CREDITORS with Clerk of 
Court: October 17, 2024. DATE OF FIRST 
PUBLICATION: October 23, 2024. Personal 
Representative: Bruce J. Smith P.O. Box 304 
Conway, WA 98238 Attorney for the Personal 
Representative: Ceth D. Hickey Address for 
Mailing or Service: Ceth D. Hickey Hickman 
Menashe, P.S. 4211 Alderwood Mall Blvd., 
Ste 202 Lynnwood, WA 98036 DATED:  Oc-
tober 17, 2024. HICKMAN MENASHE, P.S. 
/s/ Ceth D. Hickey, WSBA #55590 Attorney 
for Personal Representative Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 23, 30 & 
November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter 
of the Estate of: GEORGE M. HADALLER, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02068-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS The Personal 
Representative named below has been ap-
pointed and has qualified as the Personal 
Representatives of this estate.  Any person 
having a claim against the decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred 
by any otherwise applicable statute of limi-
tations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by (a) serving 
on or mailing to the Personal Representative 
or the Personal Representative’s attorney 
at the address stated below a copy of the 
claim and (b) filing the original of the claim 
with the court.  The claim must be presented 
within the latter of: (1) thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of this notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. DATE OF FILING 
COPY OF NOTICE TO CREDITORS with 
Clerk of Court: October 17, 2024. DATE OF 
FIRST PUBLICATION: October 23, 2024. 
Personal Representative: James Hadaller 
4104 115th Pl SE Everett, WA 98208 Attor-
ney for the Personal Representative: Ceth D. 
Hickey Address for Mailing or Service: Ceth 
D. Hickey Hickman Menashe, P.S. 4211 Al-
derwood Mall Blvd., Ste 202 Lynnwood, WA 
98036 DATED: October 17, 2024. HICKMAN 
MENASHE, P.S. /s/ Ceth D. Hickey, WSBA 
#55590 Attorney for Personal Representa-
tive Published in the Snohomish County Tri-
bune October 23, 30 & November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE 
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF: SAM ED-
WARD DAVIS, Deceased. No. 24-4-02092-
31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty days after the personal representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor 
as provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) 
four months after the date of first publication 
of the notice. If the claim is not presented 
within this time frame, the claim is forever 
barred, except as otherwise provided in 
RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the de-
cedent’s probate and non- probate assets. 
Date of filing of Notice to Creditors: October 
4, 2024 Date of first publication: October 9, 
2024 /s/ DEBORAH JOANN DAVIS Personal 
Representative of the Estate of SAM ED-
WARD DAVIS ATTORNEY FOR ESTATE: 
PATRICK M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 LAW 
OFFICES OF P. TRIVETT, PLLC 1031 State 
Avenue, Suite 103 Marysville , Washington 
98270 Phone: (360) 653-2525 Fax: (360) 
653-6860 Published in the Snohomish Coun-
ty Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE MAT-
TER OF THE ESTATE OF: VIVIAN CLAIRE 
WELLS, Deceased. No. 24-4-02093-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney 
at the address stated below a copy of the 
claim and must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the personal repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40. 020 
(3); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  This bar 
is effective as to claims against both the de-
cedent’s probate and non-probate assets. 
Date of filing of Notice to Creditors: October 
4, 2024 Date of first publication: October 9, 
2024 /s/ DEBORAH CLAIRE BROWN Per-
sonal Representative of the Estate of VIVIAN 

CLAIRE WELLS ATTORNEY FOR ESTATE: 
PATRICK M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 LAW 
OFFICES OF P. TRIVETT, PLLC 1031 State 
Avenue, Suite 103 Marysville, Washington 
98270 Phone: (360) 653-2525 (360) 653-
6860 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE 
STATE OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH KNOLL 
AND SMITH LLC, a Washington limited li-
ability company, Plaintiff, vs. SHERRIE L. 
FLETCHER and JOHN DOE FLETCHER, 
and their marital community; JERIOD W. 
SIMMES and JANE DOE SIMMES, and 
their marital community; NIKOLETTA BURAI 
HAYES and JOHN DOE HAYES, and their 
marital community; ISTVANNE BURAI and 
JOHN DOE BURAI, and their marital com-
munity; KYLE BROULLETT and JANE DOE 
BROULLETT, and their marital community; 
and JOHN and JANE DOES 1-100 who 
may have a right or a claim of right in law 
or equity on behalf of any party associated 
with the subject matter of this Complaint, 
Defendants. No.  24-2-06593-31 SUM-
MONS TO THE DEFENDANTS: A lawsuit 
has been started against you in the above 
entitled court by KNOLL AND SMITH LLC, a 
Washington limited liability company, Plain-
tiff. Plaintiff’s claim is stated in the written 
complaint, a copy of which is served upon 
you with this summons.  In order to defend 
against this lawsuit, you must respond to the 
complaint by stating your defense in writ-
ing, and by serving a copy upon the person 
signing this summons within 20 days after 
the service of this summons, excluding the 
day of service, or a default judgment may be 
entered against you without notice. A default 
judgment is one where Plaintiff is entitled to 
what she or he asks for because you have 
not responded. If you serve a notice of ap-
pearance on the undersigned person, you 
are entitled to notice before a default judg-
ment may be entered. You may demand that 
the Plaintiff file this lawsuit with the court. If 
you do so, the demand must be in writing 
and must be served upon the person sign-
ing this summons. Within 14 days after you 
serve the demand, the Plaintiff must file this 
lawsuit with the court, or the service on you 
of this summons and complaint will be void. If 
you wish to seek the advice of an attorney in 
this matter, you should do so promptly so that 
your written response, if any, may be served 
on time. This summons is issued pursuant 
to rule 4 of the Superior Court Civil Rules of 
the State of Washington. DATED: August 22, 
2024 Peter C. Rudolf, WSBA #47791 Attor-
ney for Plaintiff P.O. Box 425 Lake Stevens, 
WA 98258 (425) 334-4400 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 2, 9, 16, 
23, 30 & November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH Wells Fargo 
Bank, N.A., Plaintiff, vs. GARY OLSON AKA 
GARY DEAN OLSON AKA GARY D. OL-
SON; UNKNOWN HEIRS AND DEVISEES 
OF LORI J. OLSON AKA LORI JEAN OL-
SON; GARY DEAN OLSON, JR; SHEILA 
OLSON; JENNIFER OLSON; TYLER OL-
SON; MAKAYLA OLSON; DAPHNE JONES; 
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA; HOME SO-
LUTIONS NORTHWEST LLC; JOHN AND/
OR JANE DOE, UNKNOWN OCCUPANTS/
CO-HABITANTS OF THE SUBJECT PREM-
ISES Defendants. No. 24-2-01532-31 CIVIL 
SUMMONS THE STATE OF WASHINGTON 
TO: Unknown Heirs & Devisees of Lori J. Ol-
son aka Lori Jean Olson, Gary Dean Olson 
Jr. and Makayla Olson You are hereby sum-
moned to appear within sixty days after the 
date of the first publication of this summons, 
to wit, within sixty days after the 23rd Day of 
October, 2024 , and defend the above en-
titled action in the above entitled court, and 
answer the complaint of the Plaintiff, Wells 
Fargo Bank, N.A., and serve a copy of your 
answer upon the undersigned attorneys for 
Plaintiff, LOGS Legal Group LLP, their office 
below stated; and in case of your failure so 
to do, judgment will be rendered against you 
according to the demand of the complaint, 
which has been filed with the clerk of said 
court.
The object of the complaint is to foreclose 
a deed of trust dated March 26, 2010 and 
recorded as Instrument No. 201005100147 
given by Lori J. Olson and Gary D. Olson, 
wife and husband on property commonly 
known as 219 135th Street SE, Everett, WA 
98208 and legally described as: LOT 12 OF 
SUNSET WEST NO. 3, ACCORDING TO 
THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOL-
UME 27 OF PLATS, PAGE 75, IN SNOHOM-
ISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON.
The complaint seeks to foreclose and termi-
nate all interest of Unknown Heirs & Devi-
sees of Lori J. Olson aka Lori Jean Olson, 
Gary Dean Olson Jr. and Makayla Olson and 
all other interests in the property.
If you are in the active military service of the 
United States, or believe that you may be en-
titled to protection of the SCRA, please con-
tact our office.  If you do not contact us, we 
will report to the court that we do not believe 
that you are protected under the SCRA.
If you have questions, you should see an at-
torney immediately. If you need help in find-
ing an attorney, you may contact the Wash-
ington State Bar’s Lawyer Referral Service 
online at www.wsba.org or by calling (206) 
443-9722 (in the Seattle metropolitan area) 
or toll-free elsewhere in Washington at (800) 
945-9722. Attorneys for Plaintiff, LOGS LE-
GAL GROUP LLP By: /s/ James A. Craft 
James A Craft WSBA#47763 [jcraft@logs.
com] 1499 SE Tech Center Place, Suite 255, 
Vancouver, WA 98683 (360) 260-2253; Fax 
(360) 260-2285 COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, 
WASHINGTON Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23, 30, November 6, 
13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
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OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH ZHIPING LIU 
also known as WILLIAM LIU and XIAOZHEN 
MENG also known as MARY ANNE MENG, 
Husband and Wife and the marital communi-
ty composed thereof, Plaintiffs, vs. MARY D. 
AHLALOOK, a single person, and All Other 
Occupants, Defendant(s). No. 24-2-03956-
31 SUMMONS (20 DAYS) PURSUANT TO 
CR 4(b)(2) TO THE DEFENDANT(S): A 
lawsuit has been started against you in the 
above entitled court by ZHIPING LIU also 
known as WILLIAM LIU and XIAOZHEN 
MENG also known as MARY ANNE MENG, 
Plaintiffs. Plaintiffs’ claim is stated in the 
written complaint, a copy of which is served 
upon you with this summons. In order to de-
fend against this lawsuit, you must respond 
to the complaint by stating your defense 
in writing, and by serving a copy upon the 
person signing this summons within 20 days 
after the service of this summons, exclud-
ing the day of service, or a default judgment 
may be entered against you without notice. 
A default judgment is one where plaintiff is 
entitled to what he asks for because you 
have not responded. If you serve a notice of 
appearance on the undersigned person, you 
are entitled to notice before a default judg-
ment may be entered. You may demand that 
the plaintiffs file this lawsuit with the court. 
If you do so, the demand must be in writing 
and must be served upon the person sign-
ing this summons. Within 14 days after you 
serve the demand, the plaintiffs must file this 
lawsuit with the court, or the service on you 
of this summons and complaint will be void. 
If you wish to seek the advice of an attorney 
in this matter, you should do so promptly so 
that your written response, if any, may be 
served on time. This summons is issued 
pursuant to rule 4 of the Superior Court Civil 
Rules of the State of Washington. DATED: 
This 21st day of MAY 2024. The notice of 
appearance or answer must be delivered to: 
PATRICK M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 Attor-
ney for Plaintiffs 1031 State Ave, Suite 103 
Marysville, Washington 98270 Phone: (360) 
659-8282 Facsimile: (360) 653-686027 NO-
TICE: State and federal law provide protec-
tions to defendants who are on active duty in 
the military service, and to their dependents. 
Dependents of a service member are the 
service member’s spouse, the service mem-
ber’s minor child, or an individual for whom 
the service member provided more than one 
half of the individual’s support for one hun-
dred eighty days immediately preceding an 
application for relief. One protection provided 
is the protection against the entry of a de-
fault judgment in certain circumstances. This 
notice only pertains to a defendant who is a 
dependent of a member of the national guard 
or a military reserve component under a call 
to active service for a period of more than 
thirty consecutive days. Other defendants in 
military service also have protections against 
default judgments not covered by this notice. 
If you are a dependent of a member of the 
national guard or a military reserve com-
ponent under a call to active service for a 
period of more than thirty consecutive days, 
you should notify the plaintiffs or the plain-
tiffs’ attorneys in writing of your status as 
such within twenty days of the receipt of this 
notice. If you fail to do so, then a court or an 
administrative tribunal may presume that you 
are not a dependent of an active duty mem-
ber of the national guard or reserves, and 
proceed with the entry of an order of default 
and/or a default judgment without further 
proof of your status. Your response to the 
plaintiffs or plaintiffs’ attorneys about your 
status does not constitute an appearance for 
jurisdictional purposes in any pending litiga-
tion nor a waiver of your rights. Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 
16, 23, 30, November 6 & 13, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR KING COUNTY In re the Estate 
of: RUSSELL J. WATKINS, Deceased. NO. 
24-4-06870-5 SEA PROBATE NOTICE  TO 
CREDITORS RCW 11.40 The Personal 
Representative named below has been ap-
pointed as Personal Representative of this 
Estate. Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or their attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing 
the original of the claim with the court in 
which the probate proceedings were com-
menced. The claim must be presented within 
the later of: (1) Thirty (30) days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. Dated this 16th day 
of October, 2024. /s/Megan Hansen Megan 
Hansen, Personal Representative Court of 
Probate Proceedings and Cause No: See 
Caption Above Date of First Publication: Oc-
tober 23, 2024. Attorney for Personal Rep-
resentative: Sherry Bosse Lueders, WSBA 
No. 39505 Address for Service and Mailing: 
Beresford Booth PLLC 145 Third Avenue 
South Edmonds, WA 98020 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 23, 30 & 
November 6, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In Re the 
Estate of: NANCY BOOTHROYD RUMMEL, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02073-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) 
(NTCRD) The person named below has been 
appointed as Personal Representative of this 
Estate. Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 

would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as pro-
vided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of 
the notice. If the claim is not presented within 
this time frame, the claim is forever barred, 
except as otherwise provided in RCW 
11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is effec-
tive as to claims against both the decedent’s 
probate and nonprobate assets. Date of First 
Publication: October 9, 2024. Personal Rep-
resentative Print Name: Pamela A. Rummel 
Justin K. Monro, WSBA# 44763 Attorneys 
for Personal Representative Address for 
Mailing or Service: The Monro Law Firm PS 
Inc. 1830 Bickford Ave. Ste 204 Snohomish, 
WA 98290 360-863-3728 Court of probate 
proceedings and cause number: Snohom-
ish County Superior Court Cause No.: 24-
4-02073-31 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASH-
INGTON IN AND FOR SKAGIT COUNTY 
IN Re: THE ESTATE OF ROBERT LEON-
ARD HUET, Deceased. NO. 24-4-00528-29 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.070) The Administrator named below 
has been appointed and has qualified as Ad-
ministrator of this estate. Any person having 
a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provid-
ed in RCW 11.40.070 by (a) serving on or 
mailing to the Executor/Administrator or the 
Executor/Administrator’s attorney at the ad-
dress stated below, a copy of the claim, and 
(b) filing of the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
with in the later of: 1.) thirty (30) days after 
the Administrator served or mailed the no-
tice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(1)(c); or 2.) four (4) months after 
the date of the first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Signed, Mark D. Nusz, 
attorney for Administrator , WSBA #50905 
DATE OF FILING WITH CLERK OF COURT: 
October 2, 2024 DATE OF FIRST PUBLICA-
TION: October 9, 2024 Administrator: Linda 
Jean Castell Address for Service: 1200 Old 
Fairhaven Pkwy., Ste 302 Bellingham, WA 
98225 Attorney For Administrator: Mark D. 
Nusz Address: 1200 Old Fairhaven Pkwy., 
Ste 302 Bellingham, WA 98225 COURT OF 
PROBATE PROCEEDING AND CAUSE 
NUMBER: 24-4-00528-29 SKAGIT COUN-
TY SUPERIOR COURT No. Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 
23, 2024

Loan No: ******1673 TS No: 24-11223 NO-
TICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE PURSUANT 
TO THE REVISED CODE OF WASHING-
TON CHAPTER 61.24 RCW Grantor: RYAN 
JACOB NICHOLS Current Beneficiary of 
Deed of Trust: SERVBANK, SB Current 
Mortgage Servicer for the Deed of Trust: 
Servbank Current Trustee for the Deed of 
Trust: MICHELLE R. GHIDOTTI, ESQ. 
Trustee’s address is 144 Railroad Avenue, 
Suite 236, Edmonds, WA 98020-4100 (206) 
331-3280 Trustee’s agent for service is Gary 
Krohn, Reg. Agent, whose address is 144 
Railroad Avenue, Suite 236 Edmonds, WA 
98020-4100 Phone: (206) 525-1925 If there 
are any questions regarding this Notice, 
please contact (206) 331-3280 Reference 
Number of Deed of Trust: 201701240733 
Parcel Number(s): 00426400001801 Abbr. 
Legal Description: LOT 19 AND PTN LOT 
18, PROSPECT POINT THIS NOTICE IS 
THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You 
have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 
the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trust-
ee Sale to be referred to mediation. If this is 
an amended Notice of Trustee Sale provid-
ing a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUNSEL-
OR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situa-
tion and refer you to mediation if you are eli-
gible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance in 
determining your rights and opportunities to 
keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission Telephone: 1-877-894-
HOME(1-877-894-4663) . Web site: http://
www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/homeowner-
ship/post_purchase_counselors_foreclo-
sure.htm The United States Department of 
Housing and Urban Development Tele-
phone: 1-800-569-4287 Web site: http://
www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/sfh/hcc/fc/index.cf
m?webListAction=search&searchstate=WA
&filterSvc=dfc The statewide civil legal aid 
hotline for assistance and referrals to other 
housing counselors and attorneys Tele-
phone: 1-800-606-4819 Web site: http://
nwjustice.org/what-clear I. NOTICE IS 
HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned Trust-
ee will on 11/1/2024, at 9:00 AM at Outside 
The North Plaza Entrance to the Snohomish 

County Courthouse, 3000 Rockefeller Ave, 
Everett, WA 98201 sell at public auction to 
the highest and best bidder, payable, in the 
form of cash, or cashier’s check or certified 
checks from federally or State chartered 
banks, at the time of sale the following de-
scribed real property, situated in the County 
of Snohomish, State of Washington, to-wit: 
LOT 19, AND THE WEST HALF OF LOT 18, 
PROSPECT POINT, ACCORDING TO THE 
PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 
31 OF PLATS, PAGE 89, RECORDS OF 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. 
SITUATE IN THE COUNTY OF SNOHOM-
ISH, STATE OF WASHINGTON. Commonly 
known as: 5113 200TH ST NE ARLINGTON 
WASHINGTON 98223 which is subject to 
that certain Deed of Trust dated 1/24/2017, 
recorded 1/24/2017, under Auditor’s File No. 
201701240733, in Book , Page records of 
Snohomish County, Washington, from RYAN 
JACOB NICHOLS, as Grantor(s), to RAINI-
ER TITLE, LLC, as Trustee, to secure an 
obligation in favor of MORTGAGE ELEC-
TRONIC REGISTRATION SYSTEMS, INC., 
AS NOMINEE FOR 1ST ALLIANCE LEND-
ING, LLC., A CONNECTICUT LIMITED LIA-
BILITY COMPANY, ITS SUCCESSORS 
AND ASSIGNS, as Beneficiary, the benefi-
cial interest in which was assigned to 
SERVBANK, SB. II. No action commenced 
by the Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust is now 
pending to seek satisfaction of the obligation 
in any Court by reason of the Borrower’s or 
Grantor’s default on the obligation secured 
by the Deed of Trust. III. The default(s) for 
which this foreclosure is made is/are as fol-
lows: Failure to pay when due the following 
amounts which are now in arrears: PAY-
MENT INFORMATION: FROM 12/1/2022 
THRU NO.PMT 19 AMOUNT $1,968.38 TO-
TAL $37,399.22 BENEFICIARY’S ADVANC-
ES, COSTS AND EXPENSES: DESCRIP-
TION ADVANCE AMOUNT: 5/8/2024 
Suspense Amount ($122.22) 5/8/2024 NSF 
Fee Amount: $75.00 5/8/2024 Recoverable 
Corp Adv Amount: $8,129.84 5/8/2024 Ac-
crued Late Charge Amount $876.42 5/8/2024 
Forecasted Late Charge Amount: $58.43 
6/12/2024 Payment Adjustment ($31.68) ES-
TIMATED FORECLOSURE FEES & 
COSTS: 04/24/2024 Trustee’s Fees $540.00 
04/25/2024 NOD Posting Fee $125.00 
04/25/2024 Record Substitution of Trustee 
$18.00 04/25/2024 T.S.G. Fee $1,015.00 
05/08/2024 Mailing Service Fee $83.38 TO-
TAL DUE AS OF: 6/12/2024 $48,166.39 IV. 
The sum owing on the obligation secured by 
the Deed of Trust is: The principal sum of 
$252,157.57, together with interest as pro-
vided in the Note or other instrument secured 
from 11/1/2022, and such other costs and 
fees as are due under the Note or other in-
strument secured and as are provided by 
statute. V. The above described real property 
will be sold to satisfy the expense of sale and 
the obligation secured by the Deed of Trust 
as provided by statute. The sale will be made 
without warranty, expressed or implied, re-
garding title, possession or encumbrances 
on 11/1/2024. The defaults referred to in 
Paragraph III must be cured by 10/21/2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a dis-
continuance of the sale. The sale will be dis-
continued and terminated if at any time be-
fore 10/21/2024 (11 days before the sale) the 
default as set forth in Paragraph III, together 
with any subsequent payments, late charg-
es, advances, costs and fees thereafter due, 
is/are cured and the Trustee’s fees and costs 
are paid. Payment must be in cash or with 
cashiers or certified checks from a State or 
federally chartered bank. The sale may be 
terminated any time after the 10/21/2024 (11 
days before the sale date) and before the 
sale, by the Borrower, or Grantor or any 
Guarantors or the holder of any recorded ju-
nior lien or encumbrance by paying the entire 
principal and interest secured by the Deed of 
Trust, plus costs, fees and advances, if any, 
made pursuant to the terms of the obligation 
and/or Deed of Trust and curing all other de-
faults. VI. A written Notice of Default was 
transmitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to 
the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) at the follow-
ing address(es): NAME ADDRESS RYAN 
JACOB NICHOLS 5113 200TH STREET 
N.E. ARLINGTON, WA 98223 by both first 
class and certified mail on 5/9/2024, proof of 
which is in the possession of the Trustee; 
and on 5/9/2024 the Borrower and Grantor 
were personally served, if applicable, with 
said written Notice of Default or the written 
Notice of Default was posted in a conspicu-
ous place on the real property described in 
Paragraph I above, and the Trustee has pos-
session of proof of such service or posting. 
VII. The Trustee whose name and address 
are set forth below will provide in writing to 
anyone requesting it, a statement of all costs 
and fees due at any time prior to the sale. 
VIII. The effect of the sale will be to deprive 
the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property. IX. Any-
one having any objections to this sale on any 
grounds whatsoever will be afforded an op-
portunity to be heard as to those objections if 
they bring a lawsuit to restrain the sale pur-
suant to RCW 61.24.130. Failure to bring 
such a lawsuit may result in a waiver of any 
proper grounds for invalidating the Trustee’s 
sale. X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TEN-
ANTS -  The purchaser at the trustee’s sale 
is entitled to possession of the property on 
the 20th day following the sale, as against 
the grantor under the Deed of Trust (the 
owner) and anyone having an interest junior 
to the Deed of Trust, including occupants 
who are not tenants. After the 20th day fol-
lowing the sale the purchaser has the right to 
evict occupants who are not tenants by sum-
mary proceedings under chapter 59.12 
RCW. For tenant-occupied property, the pur-
chaser shall provide a tenant with written 
notice in accordance with RCW 61.24.060. If 
you are a servicemember or a dependent of 
a servicemember, you may be entitled to cer-
tain protections under the federal Service-

members Civil Relief Act and any compara-
ble state laws regarding the risk of 
foreclosure. If you believe you may be enti-
tled to these protections, please contact our 
office immediately. Additional disclaimers 
provided by the Trustee: If you have previ-
ously been discharged through bankruptcy, 
you may have been released of personal li-
ability for this loan in which case this letter is 
intended to exercise the noteholders rights 
against the real property only. Service of Pro-
cess should be sent to: Michelle Ghidotti, 
Esq., c/o Gary Krohn, Reg. Agent, 144 Rail-
road Avenue, Suite 236, Edmonds, WA 
98020-4100 and faxed to (949) 427-2732. If 
there are any questions regarding this No-
tice, please contact (206) 331-3280. SALE 
INFORMATION CAN BE OBTAINED ON-
LINE AT www.auction.com FOR AUTOMAT-
ED SALES INFORMATION PLEASE CALL: 
(800) 793-6107 THIS IS AN ATTEMPT TO 
COLLECT A DEBT AND ANY INFORMA-
TION OBTAINED WILL BE USED FOR 
THAT PURPOSE. DATED: 06/12/2024 Mi-
chelle Ghidotti, Esq. 144 Railroad Avenue, 
Suite 236 Edmonds, WA 98020-4100 Phone: 
(206) 331-3280 Fax: (949) 427-2732 Mi-
chelle R. Ghidotti, Esq., as Trustee A notary 
public or other officer completing this certifi-
cate verifies only the identity of the individual 
who signed the document, to which this cer-
tificate is attached, and not the truthfulness, 
accuracy, or validity of that document. State 
of California ) )ss County of Orange ) On 
06/12/2024 before me, Tina Suihkonen, No-
tary Public personally appeared Michelle 
Ghidotti-Gonsalves, Esq as Trustee who 
proved to me on the basis of satisfactory evi-
dence to be the person(s) whose name(s) is/
are subscribed to the within instrument and 
acknowledged to me that he/she/they exe-
cuted the same in his/her/their authorized 
capacity(ies), and that by his/her/their 
signature(s) on the instrument the person(s), 
or the entity upon behalf of which the 
person(s) acted, executed the instrument. I 
certify under PENALTY OF PERJURY under 
the laws of the State of California that the 
foregoing paragraph is true and correct. 
WITNESS my hand and official seal. Signa-
ture Tina Suihkonen (Seal) TINA SUIH-
KONEN Notary Public California Orange 
County Commission # 2453258 My Comm. 
Expires Jul 15, 2027 NPP0462075 To: SNO-
HOMISH COUNTY TRIBUNE 10/02/2024, 
10/23/2024

NOTICE OF DISSOLUTION
Please take notice that AUSTIN IRRIGA-
TION, INC., a Washington Corporation filed 
Articles of Dissolution with the Secretary of 
State of Washington. It ceased doing busi-
ness on or around March 31, 2023.
This notice is published pursuant to RCW 
23B.14.030. If you have a claim against  
AUSTIN IRRIGATION INC., you are hereby 
requested to present such claim in accor-
dance with the following:
1. The claim should include a written state-
ment setting forth: (a) the amount of the 
claim, (b) a detailed description of the basis 
of the claim, (c) the date the claim was in-
curred, (d) whether the claim is secured or 
unsecured, (e) if the claim is secured, a de-
scription of the collateral, and (f) any other in-
formation that would assist in identifying and 
determining the nature, amount, and validity 
of the claim.  
2. If the claim includes charges in addition to 
the principal amount of the claim, the claim 
should include an itemized statement of all 
such additional charges. 
3. Any claim must be mailed to the following 
address:
AUSTIN IRRIGATION, INC.
c/o WHC Attorneys, PLLC
12209 E Mission Ave, Suite 5
Spokane Valley, WA 99206
NOTE: CLAIMS AGAINST AUSTIN IRRI-
GATION, INC. MAY BE BARRED IN AC-
CORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF 
RCW 23B.14 IF NOT TIMELY ASSERTED. 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
October 16, 23 & 30, 2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE 108 1st Ave 
South, Suite 450 Seattle, WA 98104 TS No.: 
WA-24-973290-RM APN No.: 003933-000-
010-02 Title Order No.: 8789032 AMENDED 
Pursuant to the Revised Code of Washing-
ton 61.24.130(4) Reference Number of Deed 
of Trust: Instrument No. 202203160520 
Parcel Number(s): 003933-000-010-02 
Grantor(s) for Recording Purposes under 
RCW 65.04.015: ALL GONE LLC, A WASH-
INGTON LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY 
ORGANIZED AND EXISTING UNDER THE 
LAWS OF WASHINGTON Current Benefi-
ciary of the Deed of Trust and Grantee (for 
Recording Purposes under RCW 65.04.015): 
Wilmington Savings Fund Society, FSB, as 
Owner Trustee of the Residential Credit Op-
portunities Trust VIII-B Current Trustee of the 
Deed of Trust: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION Current Loan Mortgage 
Servicer of the Deed of Trust: FCI Lender 
Services, Inc. As the federal bankruptcy 
stay has been lifted, this an amended notice 
as to the Notice of Trustee’s Sale recorded 
3/22/2024 under SNOHOMISH County Au-
ditor Instrument Number 202403220032. 
I. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that QUAL-
ITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION, the 
undersigned Trustee, will on 11/22/2024 , at 
10:00 AM Outside The North Plaza Entrance 
to the Snohomish County Courthouse, lo-
cated at 3000 Rockefeller Ave, Everett, WA 
98201 sell at public auction to the highest 
and best bidder, payable in the form of credit 
bid or cash bid in the form of cashier’s check 
or certified checks from federally or State 
chartered banks, at the time of sale the fol-
lowing described real property, situated in 
the County of SNOHOMISH, State of Wash-
ington, THE NORTHERLY 100 FEET OF 
LOT 10, BEVERLY HILLS DIVISION NO. 5, 
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RE-
CORDED IN VOLUME 11 OF PLATS, PAGE 
70, RECORDS OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY, 

WASHINGTON; EXCEPT THAT PORTION 
AS DEEDED TO THE CITY OF EVERETT 
BY RECORDING NO. 2132517. SITUATE 
IN THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, STATE 
OF WASHINGTON. More commonly known 
as: 624 MADISON ST, EVERETT, WA 98203 
which is subject to that certain Deed of Trust 
dated 3/11/2022, recorded 3/16/2022, under 
Instrument No. 202203160520 records of 
SNOHOMISH County, Washington , from 
ALL GONE LLC, A WASHINGTON LIMITED 
LIABILITY COMPANY ORGANIZED AND 
EXISTING UNDER THE LAWS OF WASH-
INGTON , as g rantor(s), to CHICAGO TITLE 
COMPANY OF WASHINGTON , as original 
t rustee, to secure an obligation in favor of 
CIVIC FINANCIAL SERVICES, LLC, A CALI-
FORNIA LIMITED LIAIBILITY COMPANY , 
as original b eneficiary, the beneficial inter-
est in which was subsequently assigned to 
Wilmington Savings Fund Society, FSB, 
as Owner Trustee of the Residential Credit 
Opportunities Trust VIII-B , the Beneficiary, 
under an assignment recorded under Audi-
tors File Number 202405160241 II. No action 
commenced by the Beneficiary of the Deed 
of Trust as referenced in RCW 61.21.030(4) 
is now pending to seek satisfaction of the 
obligation in any Court by reason of the Bor-
rower’s or Grantor’s default on the obligation 
secured by the Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. 
The default(s) for which this foreclosure is 
made is/are as follows: Failure to pay when 
due the following amounts which are now in 
arr ears: $57,659.92 . IV. The sum owing on 
the obligation secured by the Deed of Trust 
is: The principal sum of $312,000.00 , to-
gether with interest as provided in the Note 
from 10/1/2023 on, and such other costs 
and fees as are provided by statute. V. The 
above-described real property will be sold to 
satisfy the expense of sale and the obligation 
secured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute. Said sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on 11/22/2024 
. The defaults referred to in Paragraph III 
must be cured by 11/11/2024 (11 days be-
fore the sale date), subject to the terms 
of the Note and Deed of Trust, to cause a 
discontinuance of the sale. The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if at any time 
before 11/11/2024 (11 days before the sale), 
subject to the terms of the Note and Deed of 
Trust, the default as set forth in Paragraph 
III is cured and the Trustee’s fees and costs 
are paid. Payment must be in cash or with 
cashier s or certified checks from a State or 
federally chartered bank. The sale may be 
terminated any time after the 11/11/2024 
(11 days before the sale date) and before 
the sale, by the Borrower or Grantor or the 
holder of any recorded junior lien or encum-
brance by paying the principal and interest, 
plus costs, fees and advances, if any, made 
pursuant to the terms of the obligation and/or 
Deed of Trust, and curing all other defaults. 
VI. A written Notice of Default was transmit-
ted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the Bor-
rower (s) and Grantor (s) by both first class 
and certified mail, proof of which is in the 
possession of the Trustee; and the Borrower 
and Grantor were personally served, if ap-
plicable, with said written Notice of Default 
or the written Notice of Default was posted 
in a conspicuous place on the real property 
described in Paragraph I above, and the 
Trustee has possession of proof of such ser-
vice or posting. The list of recipients of the 
Notice of Default is listed within the Notice 
of Foreclosure provided to the Borrower(s) 
and Grantor(s). These requirements were 
completed as of 2/13/2024 . VII. The Trustee 
whose name and address are set forth below 
will provide in writing to anyone requesting 
it, a statement of all costs and fees due at 
any time prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of 
the sale will be to deprive the Grantor and 
all those who hold by, through or under the 
Grantor of all their interest in the above-
described property. IX. Anyone having any 
objections to this sale on any grounds what-
soever will be afforded an opportunity to be 
heard as to those objections if they bring a 
lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant to RCW 
61.24.130. Failure to bring such a lawsuit 
may result in a waiver of any proper grounds 
for invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. NO-
TICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS -  The 
purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is entitled to 
possession of the property on the 20 th day 
following the sale, as against the Grantor un-
der the deed of trust (the owner) and anyone 
having an interest junior to the deed of trust, 
including occupants who are not tenants. Af-
ter the 20 th day following the sale the pur-
chaser has the right to evict occupants who 
are not tenants by summary proceedings 
under Chapter 59.12 RCW. For tenant-oc-
cupied property, the purchaser shall provide 
a tenant with written notice in accordance 
with RCW 61.24.060. Additional Information 
provided by the Trustee: If you have previ-
ously been discharged through bankruptcy, 
you may have been released of personal li-
ability for this loan, in which case this letter is 
intended to exercise the Note holders right’s 
against the real property only. The Trustee’s 
Sale Number is WA-24-973290-RM. . Dat-
ed: 10/3/2024 QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION, as Trustee By: Jeff Sten-
man, President Trustee’s Address: QUALITY 
LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION 108 1 st 
Ave South, Suite 450, Seattle, WA 98104 
For questions call toll-free: (866) 925-0241 
Trustee Sale Number: WA-24-973290-RM 
Sale Line: 916-939-0772 or Login to: http://
www. qualityloan.com IDSPub #0224706

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursuant to 
the Revised Code of Washington 61.24, et 
seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 Seattle, 
WA 98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-23-966145-
SW Title Order No.: 230434413-WA-MSI 
Reference Number of Deed of Trust: Instru-
ment No. 202005180223 Parcel Number(s): 
00533900001300 Grantor(s) for Recording 
Purposes under RCW 65.04.015: JAMES 
ROBERT ALBEN, A SINGLE MAN Current 
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Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust and Grantee 
(for Recording Purposes under RCW 
65.04.015): AmeriHome Mortgage Compa-
ny, LLC Current Trustee of the Deed of Trust: 
QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION 
Current Loan Mortgage Servicer of the Deed 
of Trust: Cenlar FSB I.NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION, the undersigned Trustee, 
will on 11/1/2024, at 9:00 AM On the Steps in 
Front of the North Entrance to the Snohom-
ish County Superior Courthouse, located at 
3000 Rockefeller Avenue, Everett, WA 
98201 sell at public auction to the highest 
and best bidder, payable in the form of credit 
bid or cash bid in the form of cashier’s check 
or certified checks from federally or State 
chartered banks, at the time of sale the fol-
lowing described real property, situated in 
the County of SNOHOMISH, State of Wash-
ington, to-wit: LOT 13, O’CONNOR AND 
CRONIN’S MIDLAND GARDENS, DIVISION 
NO. 3, A REPLAT OF LOT 3, PORTIONS OF 
7, 8, 9, 10, 11 AND 12, ARCADIA GAR-
DENS, ACCORDING TO PLAT THEREOF 
RECORDED IN VOLUME 13 OF PLATS, 
PAGE 94, RECORDS OF SNOHONISH 
COUNTY, WASHINGTON; SITUATE IN THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, STATE OF 
WASHINGTON. More commonly known as: 
719 93RD STREET SW, EVERETT, WA 
98204 Subject to that certain Deed of Trust 
dated 5/4/2020, recorded 5/18/2020, under 
Instrument No. 202005180223 records of 
SNOHOMISH County, Washington, from 
JAMES ROBERT ALBEN, A SINGLE MAN, 
as grantor(s), to FIDELITY NATIONAL TITLE 
COMPANY, as original trustee, to secure an 
obligation in favor of MORTGAGE ELEC-
TRONIC REGISTRATION SYSTEMS, INC., 
AS NOMINEE FOR SEATTLE’S BEST 
MORTGAGE, INC., ITS SUCCESSORS 
AND ASSIGNS, as original beneficiary, the 
beneficial interest in which was subsequently 
assigned to AmeriHome Mortgage Compa-
ny, LLC, the Beneficiary, under an assign-
ment recorded under Auditors File Number 
202306140093 II. No action commenced by 
the Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust as refer-
enced in RCW 61.21.030(4) is now pending 
to seek satisfaction of the obligation in any 
Court by reason of the Borrower’s or Grant-
or’s default on the obligation secured by the 
Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. The default(s) 
for which this foreclosure is made is/are as 
follows: Failure to pay when due the follow-
ing amounts which are now in arrears: 
$56,315.99. IV. The sum owing on the obli-
gation secured by the Deed of Trust is: The 
principal sum of $312,968.99, together with 
interest as provided in the Note from 
5/1/2022 on, and such other costs, fees, and 
charges as are due under the Note, Deed of 
Trust, or other instrument secured, and as 
are provided by statute. V. The above-de-
scribed real property will be sold to satisfy 
the expense of sale and the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute. Said sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on 11/1/2024. 
The defaults referred to in Paragraph III must 
be cured by 10/21/2024 (11 days before the 
sale date), or by other date as permitted in 
the Note or Deed of Trust, to cause a discon-
tinuance of the sale. The sale will be discon-
tinued and terminated if at any time before 
10/21/2024 (11 days before the sale), or by 
other date as permitted in the Note or Deed 
of Trust, the default as set forth in Paragraph 
III is cured and the Trustee’s fees and costs 
are paid. Payment must be in cash or with 
cashiers or certified checks from a State or 
federally chartered bank. The sale may be 
terminated any time after the 10/21/2024 (11 
days before the sale date) and before the 
sale, by the Borrower or Grantor or the hold-
er of any recorded junior lien or encum-
brance by paying the principal and interest, 
plus costs, fees and advances, if any, made 
pursuant to the terms of the obligation and/or 
Deed of Trust, and curing all other defaults. 
VI. A written Notice of Default was transmit-
ted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) by both first 
class and certified mail, proof of which is in 
the possession of the Trustee; and the Bor-
rower and Grantor were personally served, if 
applicable, with said written Notice of Default 
or the written Notice of Default was posted in 
a conspicuous place on the real property de-
scribed in Paragraph I above, and the Trust-
ee has possession of proof of such service or 
posting. The list of recipients of the Notice of 
Default is listed within the Notice of Foreclo-
sure provided to the Borrower(s) and 
Grantor(s). These requirements were com-
pleted as of 9/28/2023. VII. The Trustee 
whose name and address are set forth below 
will provide in writing to anyone requesting it, 
a statement of all costs and fees due at any 
time prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of the 
sale will be to deprive the Grantor and all 
those who hold by, through or under the 
Grantor of all their interest in the above-de-
scribed property. IX. Anyone having any ob-
jections to this sale on any grounds whatso-
ever will be afforded an opportunity to be 
heard as to those objections if they bring a 
lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant to RCW 
61.24.130. Failure to bring such a lawsuit 
may result in a waiver of any proper grounds 
for invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. NO-
TICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS -  The 
purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is entitled to 
possession of the property on the 20th day 
following the sale, as against the Grantor un-
der the deed of trust (the owner) and anyone 
having an interest junior to the deed of trust, 
including occupants who are not tenants. Af-
ter the 20th day following the sale the pur-
chaser has the right to evict occupants who 
are not tenants by summary proceedings 
under Chapter 59.12 RCW. For tenant-occu-
pied property, the purchaser shall provide a 
tenant with written notice in accordance with 
RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE IS THE FI-
NAL STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE 
SALE OF YOUR HOME. You may be eligible 

for mediation. You have only until 90 calen-
dar days BEFORE the date of sale listed in 
this Notice of Trustee Sale to be referred to 
mediation. If this is an amended Notice of 
Trustee Sale providing a 45-day notice of the 
sale, mediation must be requested no later 
than 25 calendar days BEFORE the date of 
sale listed in this amended Notice of Trustee 
Sale. DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A HOUS-
ING COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LI-
CENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if 
you are eligible and it may help you save 
your home. See below for safe sources of 
help. SEEKING ASSISTANCE Housing 
counselors and legal assistance may be 
available at little or no cost to you. If you 
would like assistance in determining your 
rights and opportunities to keep your house, 
you may contact the following: The statewide 
foreclosure hotline for assistance and refer-
ral to housing counselors recommended by 
the Housing Finance Commission: Toll-free: 
1-877-894-HOME (1-877-894-4663) or Web 
site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/
homeownership/post_purchase_counsel-
ors_foreclosure.htm The United States De-
partment of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment: Toll-free: 1-800-569-4287 or National 
Web Site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudportal/
HUD or for Local counseling agencies in 
Washington: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/
sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search
&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The state-
wide civil legal aid hotline for assistance and 
referrals to other housing counselors and at-
torneys: Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 or Web 
site: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear Addition-
al information provided by the Trustee: If you 
have previously been discharged through 
bankruptcy, you may have been released of 
personal liability for this loan in which case 
this letter is intended to exercise the note-
holders rights against the real property only. 
The Trustee’s Sale Number is WA-23-
966145-SW. Dated: 6/14/2024 QUALITY 
LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION, as Trust-
ee By: Jeff Stenman, President Trustee’s Ad-
dress: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPO-
RATION 108 1 st Ave South, Suite 450, 
Seattle, WA 98104 For questions call toll-
free: (866) 925-0241 Trustee Sale Number: 
WA-23-966145-SW Sale Line: 800-280-
2832 or Login to: http://www. qualityloan.com 
IDSPub #0202927 10/2/2024 10/23/2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursuant to 
the Revised Code of Washington 61.24, et 
seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 Seattle, 
WA 98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-24-984414-
SW Title Order No.: FIN-24001415 Refer-
ence Number of Deed of Trust: Instrument 
No. 200701311583 Parcel Number(s): 
00866700003400 Grantor(s) for Recording 
Purposes under RCW 65.04.015: Ilene M 
Johnson, an unmarried woman Current Ben-
eficiary of the Deed of Trust and Grantee (for 
Recording Purposes under RCW 65.04.015): 
DEUTSCHE BANK NATIONAL TRUST 
COMPANY, as Trustee for BCAP TRUST 
LLC 2007-AA2 MORTGAGE PASS-
THROUGH CERTIFICATES SERIES 2007-
AA2 Current Trustee of the Deed of Trust: 
QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION 
Current Loan Mortgage Servicer of the Deed 
of Trust: Nationstar Mortgage LLC I.NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN that QUALITY LOAN 
SERVICE CORPORATION, the undersigned 
Trustee, will on 11/22/2024, at 10:00 AM Out-
side The North Plaza Entrance to the Sno-
homish County Courthouse, 3000 Rockefell-
er Ave, Everett, WA 98201 sell at public 
auction to the highest and best bidder, pay-
able in the form of credit bid or cash bid in the 
form of cashier’s check or certified checks 
from federally or State chartered banks, at 
the time of sale the following described real 
property, situated in the County of SNO-
HOMISH, State of Washington, to-wit: Unit 
34, Country Manor One, a Condominium, 
Survey Map and Plans Recorded in Volume 
63 of Plats, Pages 98 through 103 Inclusive; 
Condominium Declaration recorded under 
Auditor’s File No. 9703180267, and amend-
ments recorded under Auditor’s File Number 
200011080439, 200011130471, 
200310130359 and 200409090123 records 
of Snohomish County, Washington. Situate 
in the County of Snohomish, State of Wash-
ington More commonly known as: 16709 
41ST DR NE #B, ARLINGTON, WA 98223-
8432 Subject to that certain Deed of Trust 
dated 1/25/2007, recorded 1/31/2007, under 
Instrument No. 200701311583 records of 
SNOHOMISH County, Washington, from 
Ilene M Johnson, an unmarried woman, as 
grantor(s), to Chicago Title Insurance Com-
pany, Everett, as original trustee, to secure 
an obligation in favor of Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, Inc. as designated 
nominee for Countrywide Bank, N A., benefi-
ciary of the security instrument, its succes-
sors and assigns, as original beneficiary, the 
beneficial interest in which was subsequently 
assigned to DEUTSCHE BANK NATIONAL 
TRUST COMPANY, as Trustee for BCAP 
TRUST LLC 2007-AA2 MORTGAGE PASS-
THROUGH CERTIFICATES SERIES 2007-
AA2, the Beneficiary, under an assignment 
recorded under Auditors File Number 
202402200297 II. No action commenced by 
the Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust as refer-
enced in RCW 61.21.030(4) is now pending 
to seek satisfaction of the obligation in any 
Court by reason of the Borrower’s or Grant-
or’s default on the obligation secured by the 
Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. The default(s) 
for which this foreclosure is made is/are as 
follows: Failure to pay when due the follow-
ing amounts which are now in arrears: 
$19,161.27. IV. The sum owing on the obli-
gation secured by the Deed of Trust is: The 
principal sum of $118,156.36, together with 
interest as provided in the Note from 
9/1/2023 on, and such other costs, fees, and 
charges as are due under the Note, Deed of 
Trust, or other instrument secured, and as 
are provided by statute. V. The above-de-
scribed real property will be sold to satisfy 

the expense of sale and the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute. Said sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on 11/22/2024. 
The defaults referred to in Paragraph III must 
be cured by 11/11/2024 (11 days before the 
sale date), or by other date as permitted in 
the Note or Deed of Trust, to cause a discon-
tinuance of the sale. The sale will be discon-
tinued and terminated if at any time before 
11/11/2024 (11 days before the sale), or by 
other date as permitted in the Note or Deed 
of Trust, the default as set forth in Paragraph 
III is cured and the Trustee’s fees and costs 
are paid. Payment must be in cash or with 
cashiers or certified checks from a State or 
federally chartered bank. The sale may be 
terminated any time after the 11/11/2024 (11 
days before the sale date) and before the 
sale, by the Borrower or Grantor or the hold-
er of any recorded junior lien or encum-
brance by paying the principal and interest, 
plus costs, fees and advances, if any, made 
pursuant to the terms of the obligation and/or 
Deed of Trust, and curing all other defaults. 
VI. A written Notice of Default was transmit-
ted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) by both first 
class and certified mail, proof of which is in 
the possession of the Trustee; and the Bor-
rower and Grantor were personally served, if 
applicable, with said written Notice of Default 
or the written Notice of Default was posted in 
a conspicuous place on the real property de-
scribed in Paragraph I above, and the Trust-
ee has possession of proof of such service or 
posting. The list of recipients of the Notice of 
Default is listed within the Notice of Foreclo-
sure provided to the Borrower(s) and 
Grantor(s). These requirements were com-
pleted as of 6/11/2024. VII. The Trustee 
whose name and address are set forth below 
will provide in writing to anyone requesting it, 
a statement of all costs and fees due at any 
time prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of the 
sale will be to deprive the Grantor and all 
those who hold by, through or under the 
Grantor of all their interest in the above-de-
scribed property. IX. Anyone having any ob-
jections to this sale on any grounds whatso-
ever will be afforded an opportunity to be 
heard as to those objections if they bring a 
lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant to RCW 
61.24.130. Failure to bring such a lawsuit 
may result in a waiver of any proper grounds 
for invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. NO-
TICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS -  The 
purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is entitled to 
possession of the property on the 20th day 
following the sale, as against the Grantor un-
der the deed of trust (the owner) and anyone 
having an interest junior to the deed of trust, 
including occupants who are not tenants. Af-
ter the 20th day following the sale the pur-
chaser has the right to evict occupants who 
are not tenants by summary proceedings 
under Chapter 59.12 RCW. For tenant-occu-
pied property, the purchaser shall provide a 
tenant with written notice in accordance with 
RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE IS THE FI-
NAL STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE 
SALE OF YOUR HOME. You may be eligible 
for mediation. You have only until 90 calen-
dar days BEFORE the date of sale listed in 
this Notice of Trustee Sale to be referred to 
mediation. If this is an amended Notice of 
Trustee Sale providing a 45-day notice of the 
sale, mediation must be requested no later 
than 25 calendar days BEFORE the date of 
sale listed in this amended Notice of Trustee 
Sale. DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A HOUS-
ING COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LI-
CENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if 
you are eligible and it may help you save 
your home. See below for safe sources of 
help. SEEKING ASSISTANCE Housing 
counselors and legal assistance may be 
available at little or no cost to you. If you 
would like assistance in determining your 
rights and opportunities to keep your house, 
you may contact the following: The statewide 
foreclosure hotline for assistance and refer-
ral to housing counselors recommended by 
the Housing Finance Commission: Toll-free: 
1-877-894-HOME (1-877-894-4663) or Web 
site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/
homeownership/post_purchase_counsel-
ors_foreclosure.htm The United States De-
partment of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment: Toll-free: 1-800-569-4287 or National 
Web Site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudportal/
HUD or for Local counseling agencies in 
Washington: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/
sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search
&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The state-
wide civil legal aid hotline for assistance and 
referrals to other housing counselors and at-
torneys: Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 or Web 
site: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear Addition-
al information provided by the Trustee: If you 
have previously been discharged through 
bankruptcy, you may have been released of 
personal liability for this loan in which case 
this letter is intended to exercise the note-
holders rights against the real property only. 
The Trustee’s Sale Number is WA-24-
984414-SW. Dated: 7/12/2024 QUALITY 
LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION, as Trust-
ee By: Rodica M Cirstioc, Assistant Secre-
tary Trustee’s Address: QUALITY LOAN 
SERVICE CORPORATION 108 1 st Ave 
South, Suite 450, Seattle, WA 98104 For 
questions call toll-free: (866) 925-0241 Trust-
ee Sale Number: WA-24-984414-SW Sale 
Line: 855 238-5118 or Login to: http://www. 
qualityloan.com IDSPub #0203270 
10/23/2024 11/13/2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursuant to 
the Revised Code of Washington 61.24, et 
seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 Seattle, 
WA 98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-24-989492-
SW Title Order No.: 8791233 Reference 
Number of Deed of Trust: Instrument No. 
200903200520 Parcel Number(s): 310606-
002-024-00 Grantor(s) for Recording Pur-
poses under RCW 65.04.015: DWAYNE D. 

WILSON, AN UNMARRIED MAN Current 
Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust and Grantee 
(for Recording Purposes under RCW 
65.04.015): PHH Mortgage Corporation Cur-
rent Trustee of the Deed of Trust: QUALITY 
LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION Current 
Loan Mortgage Servicer of the Deed of Trust: 
PHH Mortgage Corporation I.NOTICE IS 
HEREBY GIVEN that QUALITY LOAN SER-
VICE CORPORATION, the undersigned 
Trustee, will on 11/22/2024, at 10:00 AM Out-
side The North Plaza Entrance to the Sno-
homish County Courthouse, located at 3000 
Rockefeller Ave, Everett, WA 98201 sell at 
public auction to the highest and best bidder, 
payable in the form of credit bid or cash bid 
in the form of cashier’s check or certified 
checks from federally or State chartered 
banks, at the time of sale the following de-
scribed real property, situated in the County 
of SNOHOMISH, State of Washington, to-
wit: A PORTION OF THE NORTHEAST 
QUARTER OF THE NORTHWEST QUAR-
TER OF SECTION 6, TOWNSHIP 31 
NORTH, RANGE 6 EAST, W.M., IN SNO-
HOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON, BEING 
MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED AS 
FOLLOWS. BEGINNING AT THE NORTH-
EAST CORNER OF SAID SUBDIVISION; 
THENCE SOUTH 2 DEGREES 53’16” 
WEST ALONG THE EAST LINE OF SAID 
SUBDIVISION A DISTANCE OF 1,300.03 
FEET TO THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF 
SAID SUBDIVISION; THENCE NORTH 85 
DEGREES 24’05” WEST ALONG THE 
SOUTH LINE OF SAID SUBDIVISION A 
DISTANCE OF 9.43 FEET; THENCE 
NORTH 39 DEGREES 58’56” WEST A DIS-
TANCE OF 339.10 FEET TO THE TRUE 
POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE NORTH 
85 DEGREES 24’05” WEST PARALLEL TO 
THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID SUBDIVISION 
A DISTANCE OF 793.15 FEET; THENCE 
NORTH 1 DEGREES 00’23” EAST PARAL-
LEL TO THE WEST LINE OF SAID SUBDI-
VISION A DISTANCE OF 323.74 FEET; 
THENCE SOUTH 84 DEGREES 53’40” 
EAST A DISTANCE OF 669.82 FEET; 
THENCE SOUTH 3 DEGREES 07’34” EAST 
A DISTANCE OF 200.95 FEET; THENCE 
SOUTH 39 DEGREES 58’56” EAST A DIS-
TANCE OF 166.23 FEET TO THE TRUE 
POINT OF BEGINNING; TOGETHER WITH 
AN EASEMENT FOR INGRESS AND 
EGRESS AND UTILITIES OVER, UNDER 
AND ACROSS A 60 FOOT WIDE STRIP OF 
LAND THE CENTERLINE OF WHICH IS 
DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: BEGINNING 
AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF THE 
NORTHEAST QUARTER OF THE NORTH-
WEST QUARTER OF SECTION 6, TOWN-
SHIP 31 NORTH, RANGE 6 EAST, W.M., IN 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON; 
THENCE SOUTH 2 DEGREES 53’16” 
WEST ALONG THE EAST LINE OF SAID 
SUBDIVISION A DISTANCE OF 1,297.92 
FEET TO THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF 
SAID SUBDIVISION; THENCE NORTH 85 
DEGREES 19’55” WEST ALONG THE 
SOUTH LINE OF SAID SUBDIVISION A 
DISTANCE OF 11.13 FEET TO THE POINT 
OF BEGINNING OF SAID CENTERLINE; 
THENCE NORTH 39 DEGREES 58’56” 
WEST A DISTANCE OF 502.83 FEET, 
THENCE NORTH 3 DEGREES 07’34” 
WEST A DISTANCE OF 268.33 FEET; 
THENCE NORTH 41 DEGREES 24’42” 
WEST A DISTANCE OF 205.46 FEET; 
THENCE NORTH 28 DEGREES 52’37” 
WEST A DISTANCE OF 318.46 FEET; 
THENCE NORTH 2 DEGREES 20’25” EAST 
A DISTANCE OF 271.60 FEET TO THE 
TERMINATION POINT OF SAID CENTER-
LINE; SAID TERMINATION POINT LYING 
ON THE NORTH LINE OF SAID SUBDIVI-
SION A DISTANCE OF 695.59 FEET FROM 
THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF SAID 
SUBDIVISION; (ALSO KNOWN AS LOT 23 
OF SURVEY RECORDED UNDER RE-
CORDING NUMBER 7605050238.) More 
commonly known as: 23308 MARANATHA 
WAY, ARLINGTON, WA 98223 Subject to 
that certain Deed of Trust dated 2/20/2009, 
recorded 3/20/2009, under Instrument No. 
200903200520 records of SNOHOMISH 
County, Washington, from DWAYNE D. WIL-
SON, AN UNMARRIED MAN, as grantor(s), 
to NORTHWEST TRUSTEE SERVICES, 
INC, as original trustee, to secure an obliga-
tion in favor of BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., A 
NATIONAL BANKING ASSOCIATION, as 
original beneficiary, the beneficial interest in 
which was subsequently assigned to PHH 
Mortgage Corporation, the Beneficiary, un-
der an assignment recorded under Auditors 
File Number 202405170172 II. No action 
commenced by the Beneficiary of the Deed 
of Trust as referenced in RCW 61.21.030(4) 
is now pending to seek satisfaction of the ob-
ligation in any Court by reason of the Bor-
rower’s or Grantor’s default on the obligation 
secured by the Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. 
The default(s) for which this foreclosure is 
made is/are as follows: BORROWER(S) 
HAVE DIED AND THE PROPERTY IS NOT 
THE PRINCIPAL RESIDENCE OF AT 
LEAST ONE SURVIVING BORROWER 
AND, AS A RESULT, ALL SUMS DUE UN-
DER THE NOTE HAVE BECOME DUE AND 
PAYABLE. IV. The total sum owing on the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust is: 
the principal sum of $441,877.38, together 
with interest as provided in the Note, Deed of 
Trust, or other instrument secured from 
2/20/2009 on, and such other costs, fees, 
and charges as are due under the Note, 
Deed of Trust, or other instrument secured, 
and as are provided by statute. V. The 
above-described real property will be sold to 
satisfy the expense of sale and the obligation 
secured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute. Said sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on 11/22/2024. 
The default(s) referred to in Paragraph III 
must be cured before this sale date (if cur-
able) to cause a discontinuance of the sale. 
The sale will be discontinued and terminated 
if the default as set forth in Paragraph III is 

cured. For monetary defaults, payments 
must be in cash or with cashiers or certified 
checks from a State or Federally chartered 
bank. The sale may also be terminated any 
time before the sale date set forth in this 
Paragraph if the Borrower, Grantor or holder 
of any recorded junior lien or encumbrance 
pays the entire principal and interest, plus 
costs, charges, fees and advances, if any, 
made pursuant to the terms of the Note, 
Deed of Trust and/or other instrument se-
cured, and cures all other defaults. VI. A writ-
ten Notice of Default was transmitted by the 
Beneficiary or Trustee to the Borrower(s) and 
Grantor(s) by both first class and certified 
mail, proof of which is in the possession of 
the Trustee; and the Borrower and Grantor 
were personally served, if applicable, with 
said written Notice of Default or the written 
Notice of Default was posted in a conspicu-
ous place on the real property described in 
Paragraph I above, and the Trustee has pos-
session of proof of such service or posting. 
The list of recipients of the Notice of Default 
is listed within the Notice of Foreclosure pro-
vided to the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s). 
These requirements were completed as of 
6/10/2024. VII. The Trustee whose name 
and address are set forth below will provide 
in writing to anyone requesting it, a state-
ment of all costs and fees due at any time 
prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of the sale 
will be to deprive the Grantor and all those 
who hold by, through or under the Grantor of 
all their interest in the above-described prop-
erty. IX. Anyone having any objections to this 
sale on any grounds whatsoever will be af-
forded an opportunity to be heard as to those 
objections if they bring a lawsuit to restrain 
the sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130. Failure 
to bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s sale. X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS 
OR TENANTS -  The purchaser at the Trust-
ee’s Sale is entitled to possession of the 
property on the 20th day following the sale, 
as against the Grantor under the deed of 
trust (the owner) and anyone having an inter-
est junior to the deed of trust, including oc-
cupants who are not tenants. After the 20th 
day following the sale the purchaser has the 
right to evict occupants who are not tenants 
by summary proceedings under Chapter 
59.12 RCW. For tenant-occupied property, 
the purchaser shall provide a tenant with 
written notice in accordance with RCW 
61.24.060. THIS NOTICE IS THE FINAL 
STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE 
SALE OF YOUR HOME. You may be eligible 
for mediation. You have only until 90 calen-
dar days BEFORE the date of sale listed in 
this Notice of Trustee Sale to be referred to 
mediation. If this is an amended Notice of 
Trustee Sale providing a 45-day notice of the 
sale, mediation must be requested no later 
than 25 calendar days BEFORE the date of 
sale listed in this amended Notice of Trustee 
Sale. DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A HOUS-
ING COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LI-
CENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if 
you are eligible and it may help you save 
your home. See below for safe sources of 
help. SEEKING ASSISTANCE Housing 
counselors and legal assistance may be 
available at little or no cost to you. If you 
would like assistance in determining your 
rights and opportunities to keep your house, 
you may contact the following: The statewide 
foreclosure hotline for assistance and refer-
ral to housing counselors recommended by 
the Housing Finance Commission: Toll-free: 
1-877-894-HOME (1-877-894-4663) or Web 
site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/
homeownership/post_purchase_counsel-
ors_foreclosure.htm The United States De-
partment of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment: Toll-free: 1-800-569-4287 or National 
Web Site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudportal/
HUD or for Local counseling agencies in 
Washington: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/
sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search
&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The state-
wide civil legal aid hotline for assistance and 
referrals to other housing counselors and at-
torneys: Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 or Web 
site: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear Addition-
al information provided by the Trustee: If you 
have previously been discharged through 
bankruptcy, you may have been released of 
personal liability for this loan in which case 
this letter is intended to exercise the note-
holders rights against the real property only. 
The Trustee’s Sale Number is WA-24-
989492-SW. Note: This form has been modi-
fied to account for the breach type. Dated: 
7/15/2024 QUALITY LOAN SERVICE COR-
PORATION, as Trustee By: Rodica M Cirsti-
oc, Assistant Secretary Trustee’s Address: 
QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION 
108 1 st Ave South, Suite 450, Seattle, WA 
98104 For questions call toll-free: (866) 925-
0241 Trustee Sale Number: WA-24-989492-
SW Sale Line: 916-939-0772 or Login to: 
http://www. qualityloan.com IDSPub 
#0203326 10/23/2024 11/13/2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursu-
ant to the Revised Code of Washington 
61.24, et seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 
Seattle, WA 98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-
24-993895-SW Title Order No.: 8792667 
Reference Number of Deed of Trust: Instru-
ment No. 200911060055 Parcel Number(s): 
29063500100401, 29063500100400 
Grantor(s) for Recording Purposes under 
RCW 65.04.015: CAROL M. O’CONNOR, 
AS HER SEPARATE ESTATE Current Ben-
eficiary of the Deed of Trust and Grantee (for 
Recording Purposes under RCW 65.04.015): 
Wilmington Savings Fund Society, FSB, not 
in its individual capacity but solely in its ca-
pacity as Owner Trustee for Ocwen Loan 
Acquisition Trust 2024-HB1 Current Trustee 
of the Deed of Trust: QUALITY LOAN SER-
VICE CORPORATION Current Loan Mort-
gage Servicer of the Deed of Trust: PHH 
Mortgage Corporation I.NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
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CORPORATION, the undersigned Trustee, 
will on 2/21/2025, at 10:00 AM Outside The 
North Plaza Entrance to the Snohomish 
County Courthouse, located at 3000 Rock-
efeller Ave, Everett, WA 98201 sell at public 
auction to the highest and best bidder, pay-
able in the form of credit bid or cash bid in the 
form of cashier’s check or certified checks 
from federally or State chartered banks, at 
the time of sale the following described real 
property, situated in the County of SNOHOM-
ISH, State of Washington, to-wit: THE EAST 
HALF OF THE NORTHWEST QUARTER 
OF THE NORTHEAST QUARTER OF SEC-
TION 35, TOWNSHIP 29 NORTH, RANGE 6 
EAST, W M, EXCEPT ROAD, AND EXCEPT 
THAT PORTION OF THE NORTH 660 FEET 
OF SAID EAST HALF OF THE NORTH-
WEST QUARTER OF THE NORTHEAST 
QUARTER LYING WEST OF THE CENTER-
LINE OF THE EXISTING CREEK SITUATE 
IN THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, STATE 
OF WASHINGTON More commonly known 
as: 17320 DUBUQUE ROAD, SNOHOMISH, 
WA 98290 Subject to that certain Deed of 
Trust dated 10/26/2009, recorded 11/6/2009, 
under Instrument No. 200911060055 
and modified as per Modification Agree-
ment recorded 11/1/2018 as Instrument 
No. 201811010164 records of SNOHOM-
ISH County, Washington, from CAROL M. 
O’CONNOR, AS HER SEPARATE ESTATE, 
as grantor(s), to NORTHWEST TRUSTEE 
SERVICES, as original trustee, to secure an 
obligation in favor of WELLS FARGO BANK, 
N.A., as original beneficiary, the beneficial 
interest in which was subsequently assigned 
to Wilmington Savings Fund Society, FSB, 
not in its individual capacity but solely in its 
capacity as Owner Trustee for Ocwen Loan 
Acquisition Trust 2024-HB1, the Beneficiary, 
under an assignment recorded under Audi-
tors File Number 202404020010 Corrective 
II. No action commenced by the Benefi-
ciary of the Deed of Trust as referenced in 
RCW 61.21.030(4) is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court 
by reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s 
default on the obligation secured by the 
Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. The default(s) 
for which this foreclosure is made is/are as 
follows: BORROWER(S) HAVE DIED AND 
THE PROPERTY IS NOT THE PRINCIPAL 
RESIDENCE OF AT LEAST ONE SURVIV-
ING BORROWER AND, AS A RESULT, 
ALL SUMS DUE UNDER THE NOTE HAVE 
BECOME DUE AND PAYABLE. IV. The to-
tal sum owing on the obligation secured by 
the Deed of Trust is: the principal sum of 
$281,926.79, together with interest as pro-
vided in the Note, Deed of Trust, or other 
instrument secured from 10/26/2009 on, and 
such other costs, fees, and charges as are 
due under the Note, Deed of Trust, or other 
instrument secured, and as are provided by 
statute. V. The above-described real proper-
ty will be sold to satisfy the expense of sale 
and the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust as provided by statute. Said sale will 
be made without warranty, expressed or 
implied, regarding title, possession or en-
cumbrances on 2/21/2025. The default(s) 
referred to in Paragraph III must be cured 
before this sale date (if curable) to cause a 
discontinuance of the sale. The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if the default as 
set forth in Paragraph III is cured. For mon-
etary defaults, payments must be in cash or 
with cashiers or certified checks from a State 
or Federally chartered bank. The sale may 
also be terminated any time before the sale 
date set forth in this Paragraph if the Bor-
rower, Grantor or holder of any recorded 
junior lien or encumbrance pays the entire 
principal and interest, plus costs, charges, 
fees and advances, if any, made pursuant to 
the terms of the Note, Deed of Trust and/or 
other instrument secured, and cures all other 
defaults. VI. A written Notice of Default was 
transmitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to 
the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) by both first 
class and certified mail, proof of which is in 
the possession of the Trustee; and the Bor-
rower and Grantor were personally served, if 
applicable, with said written Notice of Default 
or the written Notice of Default was posted 
in a conspicuous place on the real property 
described in Paragraph I above, and the 
Trustee has possession of proof of such ser-
vice or posting. The list of recipients of the 
Notice of Default is listed within the Notice 
of Foreclosure provided to the Borrower(s) 
and Grantor(s). These requirements were 
completed as of 9/13/2024. VII. The Trustee 
whose name and address are set forth below 
will provide in writing to anyone requesting 
it, a statement of all costs and fees due at 
any time prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of 
the sale will be to deprive the Grantor and 
all those who hold by, through or under the 
Grantor of all their interest in the above-
described property. IX. Anyone having 
any objections to this sale on any grounds 
whatsoever will be afforded an opportunity 
to be heard as to those objections if they 
bring a lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant 
to RCW 61.24.130. Failure to bring such a 
lawsuit may result in a waiver of any proper 
grounds for invalidating the Trustee’s sale. 
X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS 
-  The purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is en-
titled to possession of the property on the 
20th day following the sale, as against the 
Grantor under the deed of trust (the owner) 
and anyone having an interest junior to the 
deed of trust, including occupants who are 
not tenants. After the 20th day following the 
sale the purchaser has the right to evict oc-
cupants who are not tenants by summary 
proceedings under Chapter 59.12 RCW. 
For tenant-occupied property, the purchaser 
shall provide a tenant with written notice in 
accordance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NO-
TICE IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE 
FORECLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. 
You may be eligible for mediation. You have 
only until 90 calendar days BEFORE the 
date of sale listed in this Notice of Trustee 
Sale to be referred to mediation. If this is 

an amended Notice of Trustee Sale provid-
ing a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Toll-free: 1-877-894-HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) or Web site: http://www.
dfi.wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/
post_purchase_counselors_foreclosure.htm 
The United States Department of Housing 
and Urban Development: Toll-free: 1-800-
569-4287 or National Web Site: http://portal.
hud.gov/hudportal/HUD or for Local counsel-
ing agencies in Washington: http://www.hud.
gov/offices/hsg/sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webL
istAction=search&searchstate=WA&filterS
vc=dfc The statewide civil legal aid hotline 
for assistance and referrals to other housing 
counselors and attorneys: Telephone: 1-800-
606-4819 or Web site: http://nwjustice.org/
what-clear Additional information provided 
by the Trustee: If you have previously been 
discharged through bankruptcy, you may 
have been released of personal liability for 
this loan in which case this letter is intended 
to exercise the noteholders rights against the 
real property only. The Trustee’s Sale Num-
ber is WA-24-993895-SW. Note: This form 
has been modified to account for the breach 
type. Dated: 10/15/2024 QUALITY LOAN 
SERVICE CORPORATION, as Trustee By: 
Rodica M Cirstioc, Assistant Secretary Trust-
ee’s Address: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION 108 1 st Ave South, Suite 
450, Seattle, WA 98104 For questions call 
toll-free: (866) 925-0241 Trustee Sale Num-
ber: WA-24-993895-SW Sale Line: 916-939-
0772 or Login to: http://www. qualityloan.com 
IDSPub #0224941 10/23/2024 10/30/2024 
11/6/2024

ORIGINAL TRUSTEE SALE RECORDED 
ON 6/20/2024 IN THE OFFICE OF THE 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY RECORDER. AF-
TER RECORDING RETURN TO: Aztec 
Foreclosure Corporation of Washington 
1499 SE Tech Center Place, Suite 255 Van-
couver, WA 98683 (360) 253-8017 / (877) 
430-4787 NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE 
File No.:24-129385 Title Order 
No.:240126071 Grantor: Ronald J. Hansen, 
as a separate estate Current beneficiary of 
the deed of trust: Nationstar Mortgage LLC 
Current trustee of the deed of trust: Aztec 
Foreclosure Corporation of Washington Cur-
rent mortgage servicer of the deed of trust: 
Nationstar Mortgage LLC Reference number 
of the deed of trust: 202001170375 Parcel 
number(s): 00439149502800 Abbreviated 
legal description: PORTION OF LOT 28 AND 
ALL OF LOT 29, BLOCK 495, PLAT OF EV-
ERETT, VOLUME 3 OF PLATS, PAGE 32, 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. 
Commonly known as: 2308 McDougall Ave, 
Everett, WA 98201 I. NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that the undersigned Trustee, AZTEC 
FORECLOSURE CORPORATION OF 
WASHINGTON will on November 1, 2024, at 
the hour of 10:00 AM at outside the North 
Plaza Entrance to the Snohomish County 
Courthouse, located at 3000 Rockefeller Av-
enue, in the City of Everett, WA, State of 
Washington, sell at public auction to the 
highest and best bidder, payable at time of 
sale, the following described real property, 
situated in the County of Snohomish, State 
of Washington, to-wit: The North half of Lot 
28 and all of Lot 29, Block 495, PLAT OF EV-
ERETT, according to the plat thereof record-
ed in Volume 3 of Plats, page 32, in Snohom-
ish County, Washington. SITUATE in the 
County of Snohomish, State of Washington 
which is the subject of that certain Deed of 
Trust dated January 13, 2020, recorded Jan-
uary 17, 2020, under Auditor’s File No. 
202001170375, records of Snohomish 
County, Washington, from Ronald J. Han-
sen, as a separate estate as Grantor, to Old 
Republic Title Ltd. as Trustee, to secure an 
obligation in favor of Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, Inc., as nominee for 
On Q Financial, Inc., its successors and as-
signs as Beneficiary, which as assigned by 
Mortgage Electronic Registration Systems, 
Inc., as designated nominee for On Q Finan-
cial, Inc., beneficiary of the security instru-
ment, its successors and assigns to Nation-
star Mortgage LLC under an assignment 
recorded at Instrument No. 202403250096. 
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default 
on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust. III. The Default(s) for which this fore-
closure is made is/are as follows: Failure to 
pay when due the following amounts which 
are now in arrears: Delinquent monthly pay-
ments from the November 1, 2023 install-
ment on in the sum of $14,247.92 together 
with all fees, costs and or disbursements in-
curred or paid by the beneficiary and or trust-
ee, their employees, agents or assigns. The 
Trustee’s fees and costs are estimated at 
$3,048.32 as of June 20, 2024. The amount 
to cure the default payments as of the date of 
this notice is $17,851.43. Payments and late 
charges may continue to accrue and addi-
tional advances to your loan may be made. It 
is necessary to contact the beneficiary or 
Trustee prior to the time you tender the rein-
statement amount so that you may be ad-
vised of the exact amount you would be re-
quired to pay. IV. The sum owing on the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust is: 

Principal Balance $244,259.04, together with 
interest in the Note or other instrument se-
cured from October 1, 2023, and such other 
costs and fees as are due under the Note or 
other instrument secured, and as are pro-
vided by statute. The amount necessary to 
pay off the entire obligation secured by your 
Deed of Trust as the date of this notice is 
$256,505.95. Interest and late charges may 
continue to accrue and additional advances 
to your loan may be made. It is necessary to 
contact the beneficiary or Trustee prior to the 
time you tender the payoff amount so that 
you may be advised of the exact amount you 
would be required to pay. V. The above-de-
scribed real property will be sold to satisfy 
the expense of sale and the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute. The sale will be made without war-
ranty express or implied regarding title, pos-
session, or encumbrances on November 1, 
2024. The default(s) referred to in paragraph 
III, together with any subsequent payments, 
late charges, advances, costs and fees 
thereafter due, must be cured by October 21, 
2024 (11 days before the sale date), to cause 
a discontinuance of the sale. The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if at any time on 
or before October 21, 2024 (11 days before 
the sale date), the default(s) as set forth in 
paragraph III, together with any subsequent 
payments, late charges, advances, costs 
and fees thereafter due, is/are cured and the 
Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. The sale 
may be terminated any time after October 
21, 2024 (11 days before the sale date), and 
before the sale by the Borrower, Grantor, any 
Guarantor or the holder of any recorded ju-
nior lien or encumbrance paying the entire 
principal and interest secured by the Deed of 
Trust, plus costs, fees and advances, if any, 
made pursuant to the terms of the obligation 
and/or Deed of Trust, and curing all other de-
faults. VI. A written notice of default was 
transmitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to 
the Borrower and Grantor at the following ad-
dresses: Ronald J. Hansen 2308 McDougall 
Ave Everett, WA 98201 Unknown Spouse 
and/or Domestic Partner of Ronald J. Han-
sen 2308 McDougall Ave Everett, WA 98201 
Occupant(s) 2308 McDougall Ave Everett, 
WA 98201 by both first class and certified 
mail on May 20, 2024 proof of which is in the 
possession of the Trustee; and the Borrower 
and Grantor were personally served on May 
20, 2024 with said written notice of default or 
the written notice of default was posted in a 
conspicuous place on the real property de-
scribed in paragraph I above, and the Trust-
ee has possession of proof of such service or 
posting. The declaration by the beneficiary 
pursuant to RCW 61.24.030(7)(a) was trans-
mitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower and Grantor at the above address-
es on May 20, 2024, proof of which is in pos-
session of the Trustee. VII. The Trustee 
whose name and address are set forth 
above, and whose telephone number is 
(360) 253-8017 / (877) 430-4787 will provide 
in writing to anyone requesting it, a state-
ment of all costs and fees due at any time 
prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of the sale 
will be to deprive the Grantor and all those 
who hold by, through or under the Grantor of 
all their interest in the above-described prop-
erty. IX. Anyone having an objection to the 
sale on any grounds whatsoever will be af-
forded an opportunity to be heard as to those 
objections if they bring a lawsuit to restrain 
the sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130. Failure 
to bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s sale. X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS 
OR TENANTS The purchaser at the trustee’s 
sale is entitled to possession of the property 
on the 20th day following the sale, as against 
the grantor under the deed of trust (the own-
er) and anyone having an interest junior to 
the deed of trust, including occupants, who 
are not tenants. After the 20th day following 
the sale the purchaser has the right to evict 
occupants who are not tenants by summary 
proceedings under Chapter 59.12 RCW. For 
tenant-occupied property, the purchaser 
shall provide a tenant with written notice in 
accordance with RCW 61.24.60. XI. THIS 
NOTICE IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE 
FORECLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. 
You have only 90 calendar days BEORE the 
date of sale listed in the Notice of Trustee’s 
Sale. If an amended Notice of Sale is record-
ed providing a 45-day notice of the sale, me-
diation must be requested no later than 25 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in the 
amended Notice of Trustee’s Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUNSEL-
OR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situa-
tion and refer you to mediation if you are eli-
gible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance in 
determining your rights and opportunities to 
keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Telephone (Toll-free): 1-877-
894-HOME (1-877-894-4663) or Web site: 
http://www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/homeown-
ership/post_purchase_counselors_foreclo-
sure.htm. The United States Department of 
Housing and Urban Development: Tele-
phone (Toll-free): 1-800-569-4287 or Nation-
al Web site: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/
sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search
&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc. The state-
wide civil legal aid hotline for assistance and 
referrals to other housing counselors and at-
torneys: Telephone (Toll-Free): 1-800-606-
4819 or Web site: http://nwjustice.org/what-
clear XII. FAIR DEBT COLLECTION 
PRACTICES ACT NOTICE: AZTEC FORE-
CLOSURE CORPORATION OF WASHING-
TON is attempting to collect a debt and any 
information obtained will be used for that 
purpose. If a discharge has been obtained by 

any party through bankruptcy proceedings, 
this shall not be construed to be an attempt 
to collect the outstanding indebtedness or to 
hold you personally liable for the debt. DAT-
ED this 20th day of June, 2024 AZTEC 
FORECLOSURE CORPORATION OF 
WASHINGTON By: Inna D. Fabyanchuk 
President 1499 SE Tech Center Place, Suite 
255 Vancouver, WA 98683 (360) 253-8017 / 
(877) 430-4787 ADDRESS FOR PERSON-
AL SERVICE Aztec Foreclosure Corporation 
of Washington 1499 SE Tech Center Place, 
Suite 255 Vancouver, WA 98683 STATE OF 
WASHINGTON ) ) SS. COUNTY OF CLARK 
) This instrument was acknowledged before 
me this 20th day of June, 2024, by Inna D. 
Fabyanchuk, President. Kira Lynch Notary 
Public in and for the State of Washington My 
Commission Expires: 10/6/2024 KIRA 
LYNCH Notary Public State of Washington 
License Number 188037 My Commission 
Expires October 06, 2024 NPP0462246 To: 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY TRIBUNE 
10/02/2024, 10/23/2024

Service by Publication
In the District court of the State of Washing-
ton for the county of Snohomish. Columbia 
Collectors, Inc. Plaintiff vs. Joshua Winter, 
Defendant Case No. C23-2501 The State of 
Washington to the said Joshua Winter; You 
are hereby summoned to appear within six 
weeks of the first publication of this sum-
mons, to wit, within six weeks after the Octo-
ber 23, 2024, and defend the above entitled 
action in the above entitled court, and an-
swer the complaint of the plaintiff, Columbia 
Collectors, Inc, and serve a copy of your 
answer upon the undersigned attorney for 
plaintiff, John Holtmann, at his office below 
stated; and in case of your failure to do so, 
judgment will be rendered against you ac-
cording the demand of the complaint, which 
has been filed with the clerk of the court. The 
nature of the action for services rendered. 
John Holtmann WBN: 17186 1014 Franklin 
St Vancouver, WA 98660 (360) 750-7547 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
October 23, 30, November 6, 13, 20 & 27, 
2024

Superior Court of Washington County of 
Pacific Estate of: WILLIAM R. MILLER, De-
ceased No. 24-4-00081-25 SUMMONS TO 
ANY UNKNOWN HEIRS OF THE ESTATE 
OF WILLIAM R. MILLER: An Amended Peti-
tion for Family Award has been started the 
above entitled court by Sharon Miller, Peti-
tioner. Petitioner’s claim is stated in the writ-
ten petition, a copy of which is served upon 
you with this summons.
In order to defend against this lawsuit, you 
must respond to the petition by stating your 
defense in writing, and by serving a copy 
upon the person signing this summons 
within 60 days (60 days if you are served 
outside the state of Washington) after the 
service of this summons, excluding the day 
of service, or a default judgment may be en-
tered against you without notice. A default 
judgment is one where plaintiff is entitled to 
what he asks for because you have not re-
sponded. If you serve a notice of appearance 
on the undersigned person, you are entitled 
to notice before a default judgment may be 
entered.
You may demand that the plaintiff file this 
lawsuit with the court. If you do so, the de-
mand must be in writing and must be served 
upon the person signing this summons. 
Within 14 days after you serve the demand, 
the plaintiff must file this lawsuit with the 
court, or the service on you of this summons 
and complaint will be void.
If you wish to seek the advice of an attor-
ney in this matter, you should do so promptly 
so that your written response, if any, may 
be served on time. This summons is issued 
pursuant to rule 4 of the Superior Court Civil 
Rules of the State of Washington. DATED: 
September 25, 2024. /s/ Joel Penoyar JOEL 
PENOYAR, WSBA #6407 Attorney for Estate 
File original of your answer and other docu-
ments with the clerk of the court at: Pacific 
County Superior Court Clerk 300 Memorial 
Drive P.O. Box 67 South Bend, WA  98586 
(360) 875-9320 Serve a copy of your answer 
and other documents on: Joel Penoyar At-
torney at Law P.O. Box 425 South Bend, WA  
98586 (360) 875-5321 Published in the Sno-
homish County Tribune October 2, 9, 16, 23, 
30 & November 6, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE MAT-
TER OF THE ESTATE OF RANDY CLAR-
ENCE PFEIFER DECEASED. NO. 24-
4-02099-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Per-
sonal Representative named below has been 
appointed and has qualified as the Personal 
Representative of the above-entitled estate; 
that all persons having claims against said 
deceased must, prior to the time such claims 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, serve their claims on 
the Personal Representative or the attorneys 
of record at the address stated below and file 
an executed copy of the claim with the Clerk 
of this Court within four months after the date 
of the filing of the first publication of this No-
tice or within four months after the date of 
the filing of the copy of this notice with the 
Clerk of the Court, whichever is later, or ex-
cept under those provisions included in RCW 
11.40.011 or RCW 11 .40.013, the claim will 
be forever barred. Date of filing a copy of this 
Notice with the Clerk of the Court: October 7, 
2024. Date of first publication: October 16, 
2024. DATED this 7 day of October, 2024. 
/s/ JEFFREY P. GILBERT, WSBA #20435 At-
torney for Personal Representative c/o GIL-
BERT LAW FIRM 8490 Mukilteo Speedway, 
Suite #215 Mukilteo, WA 98275 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune October 16, 
23 & 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR KING COUNTY Estate of GERALD LEE 

STIFFLER, Deceased. NO. 24-4-06978-7 
SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
RCW 11.40.030 The co-personal represen-
tative’s (“personal representative”) named 
below have been appointed as personal rep-
resentative of this estate. Any person having 
a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the personal representative or the personal 
representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing 
the original of the claim with the court. The 
claim must be presented within the later of: 
(1) Thirty days after the personal representa-
tive served or mailed the notice to the credi-
tor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: October 23, 2024 
Co-Personal Representatives: Lisa Anne 
Stiffler and Kristine Elaine Stiffler Attorney 
for Personal Representative: Eric J. Fahl-
man, WSBA # 19888 Address for Mailing & 
Service: Fahlman Little Wheeler, PLLC 3023 
80th Ave SE, Suite 300 Mercer Island, WA 
98040 Court of probate proceedings: King 
County Superior Court Cause number: 24-
4-06978-7 SEA Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23, 30 & November 
6, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR KING COUNTY IN RE THE ESTATE 
OF BRUCE A. BUCK, Deceased. NO. 24-4-
05513-1 SEA NOTICE OF VACANCY AND 
SUCCESSION OF NOTICE AGENT AND 
APPOINTMENT OF PERSONAL REPRE-
SENTATIVE ANDREA L. BUCK, the Notice 
Agent of the above-refenced estate has 
been appointed as the Personal Represen-
tative of this estate.  Any person having a 
claim against the decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any oth-
erwise applicable statute of limitations, pres-
ent the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
below stated a photocopy of the claim and 
filing the original of the claim with the court 
in which the probate proceedings were com-
menced.  The claim must be presented with 
the later of: (1) thirty days after the Personal 
Representative served or mailed the no-
tice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months after 
the date of first publication of the notice by 
the original Notice Agent as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(b), together with the time 
between the creation of the vacancy and 
the first publication of the Notice of Vacancy 
and Succession, as provided under RCW 
11.40.150(2).  If the claim is not presented 
within this time frame, the claim is forever 
barred, except as otherwise provided in 
RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the dece-
dent’s probate and nonprobate assets. Date 
of First Publication: August 14, 2024 Date 
Vacancy Created: October 10, 2024 Date of 
First Publication of this Notice: October 23, 
2024 Personal Representative: Andrea L. 
Buck c/o Karr Tuttle Campbell 701 Fifth Ave-
nue, Suite 3300 Seattle, WA 98104 Attorney 
for the Personal Representative: KIRSTEN 
L. AMBACH, WSBA #35447 Address for 
Mailing or Service: Karr Tuttle Campbell 701 
Fifth Avenue, Suite 3300 Seattle, WA 98104 
Court of probate proceedings King County 
Superior Court and cause number: No.   24-
4-05513-1 SEA Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23 & 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of 
ROBERT LAWRENCE NOSER, Deceased. 
NO. 22-4-02289-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) PLEASE 
TAKE NOTICE The above Court has ap-
pointed me Personal Representative of De-
cedent’s estate. Any person having a claim 
against Decedent must present the claim: 
•  Before the time when the claim would be 
barred by any applicable statute of limita-
tions, and •  In the manner provided in RCW 
11.40.070: •  By filing with the Court the origi-
nal of the signed Creditor’s Claim, and •  By 
serving upon or mailing by first class mail to 
me at the address provided below a copy 
of the signed Creditor’s Claim. The Credi-
tor’s Claim must be presented by the later 
to occur of: •  Thirty (30) days after I served 
or mailed this Notice to you as provided in 
RCW 11.40.020(3), or •  Four (4) months af-
ter the date of first publication of this Notice. 
If the Creditor’s Claim is not presented within 
the foregoing time period, the claim will be 
forever barred except as provided in RCW 
11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is effec-
tive for claims against both the Decedent’s 
probate and non-probate assets. Date of fil-
ing copy of Notice to Creditors with Clerk of 
Court: October 4, 2024 Date of First Publica-
tion of this Notice: October 9, 2024 Signed: 
CLAUDIA TURNEY, Personal Representa-
tive Address for Mailing of Service: c/o Law 
Office of Karen H. Nakagawa, PLLC 801 
Second Ave, Ste 1200 Seattle, WA 98104 
(206)545-0070 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY Es-
tate of WILLIAM ANTHONY REESE, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02014-31 PRO-
BATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS RCW 
11.40.030 The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. 
Any person having a claim against the 
decedent must, before the time the claim 



TribunePage 12 October 23, 2024

would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provid-
ed under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of 
the notice. If the claim is not presented within 
this time frame, the claim is forever barred, 
except as otherwise provided in RCW 
11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is effec-
tive as to claims against both the decedent’s 
probate and nonprobate assets. Date of First 
Publication: October 9, 2024 Personal Rep-
resentative: ROGER REESE Attorney for the 
Personal Representative: Paul A. Barrera, 
WSBA No. 51990 and Charles W. Capp, 
WSBA No. 62271 of North City Law, PC 
Address for Mailing or Service:  17713 15th 
Ave. NE, Suite 101 Shoreline, WA 98155 
Court of probate proceedings and cause 
number: Snohomish County Superior Court 
Cause No. 24-4-02014-31 DATED: October 
2, 2024. NORTH CITY LAW, PC /s/ Paul A. 
Barrera Paul A. Barrera, WSBA No. 51990 
paul@northcitylaw.com Charles W. Capp, 
WSBA No. 62271 charlie@northcitylaw.com 
NORTH CITY LAW, PC 17713 Fifteenth Av-
enue Northeast, Suite 101 Shoreline, WA 
98155-3839 Telephone: 206.413.7288 Fac-
simile: 206.367.0120 Attorneys for Personal 
Representative Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of: 
TERI LYNN ROWE, and MITCHELL L. 
ROWE SR., Deceased. NO. 24-4-01880-
31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
RCW 11.40.030 The person named below 
has been appointed as Administrator of this 
Estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the 
claim would be barred by any otherwise ap-
plicable statute of limitations, present the 
claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
Administrator or the Administrator’s attor-
ney at the address stated below, a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (i) thirty days 
after the Administrator served or mailed the 
notice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(1)(c); or (ii) four months after the 
date of first publication of this notice.  If the 
claim is not presented within this time frame, 
the claim is forever barred, except as other-
wise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and RCW 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. MATTHEW L. ROWE, 
Administrator Court of Probate Proceedings 
and Cause No:  See Caption Above Date of 
First Publication:  October 16th, 2024. Attor-
ney for Administrator: MICHAEL P. JACOBS, 
WSBA #22855 Riach Gese Jacobs, PLLC 
7331 196th Street SW / PO Box 1067 Lyn-
nwood, Washington 98046-1067 Telephone 
(425) 776-3191 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 16, 23 & 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In re the Es-
tate of MARGARET C. LAUDERDALE, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02012-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) 
THE PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE 
NAMED BELOW has been appointed as 
Personal Representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.20.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representa-
tive or the personal representative’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.20.020(3); or (2) four months after 
the date of the first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. DATE OF FIRST 
PUBLICATION October 9, 2024 /s/ Kevin 
R Lauderdale Personal Representative Jim 
Johanson, WSBA #18072 Attorney at Law 
7009 212th St S.W. #203 Edmonds, Wash-
ington 98026 (425) 776-5547 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 
16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In re the Es-
tate of MARY CHRISTENSEN ANDERSON, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02059-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) 
THE PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE 
NAMED BELOW has been appointed as 
Personal Representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.20.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representa-
tive or the personal representative’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of:(1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.20.020(3); or (2) four months after 

the date of the first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: October 9, 2024 /s/ Scott Colin 
Anderson Personal Representative Jim 
Johanson, WSBA #18072 Attorney at Law 
7009 212th St. S.W. #203 Edmonds, Wash-
ington 98026 (425) 776-5547 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 
16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In Re the Es-
tate of: Barbara J. Olson Deceased. No. 24-
4-02148-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS The personal representative named 
below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any persons 
having a claim against the decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred 
by any otherwise applicable statute of limi-
tations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on 
or mailing to the personal representative or 
the personal representative’s attorney at the 
addresses stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
Court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: October 23, 2024 Allison Adair 
Personal Representative 3417 32nd Way 
NW Olympia, WA 98502 ATTORNEY FOR 
THE ESTATE: /s/ Dennis Jordan WSBA 
#4904 4202 Hoyt Ave Suite A Everett, WA 
98203 LAW OFFICES OF Dennis Jordan 
& Associates Inc. P.S. 4202 Hoyt Avenue, 
Suite A, Everett, WA 98203 (425)252-5554 
(425)258-4060 Fax Published in the Sno-
homish County Tribune October 23, 30 & 
November 6, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In Re the Es-
tate of: GERALD L. CAMPBELL, Deceased. 
NO. 24-4-02111-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 The Personal 
Representative named below has been ap-
pointed as Personal Representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months after 
the date of first publication of the notice.  If 
the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publica-
tion: October 23, 2024 Lisa D. Carroll, Per-
sonal Representative Attorney for Personal 
Representative: Paige Buurstra, WSBA# 
40500 Buurstra Law PLLC 21 Avenue A, Ste 
C Snohomish, WA 98290 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 23, 30 
& November 6, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In Re the Es-
tate of: Linda Louise Pope, Deceased. NO. 
24-4-00550-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) thirty (30) days after 
the personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. DATE OF FIL-
ING COPY OF NOTICE TO CREDITORS: 
10/10/2024 DATE OF FIRST PUBLICATION: 
10/16/2024 /s/ Priya Schmid Mark T. Patter-
son II Attorney for Estate Newton Kight LLP 
PO Box 79 Everett, Washington 98206 Court 
of Probate Proceedings and Cause Number: 
Superior Court of Washington for Snohomish 
County, No. 24-4-00550-31 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 16, 23 
& 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter 
of the AMENDED AND RESTATED SURVI-
VOR’S TRUST DATED OCTOBER 18, 1996 
FOR DOROTHY MARION MORRIS, An Irre-
vocable (inter vivos) Trust. No. 24-4-02167-
31 NOTICE AGENT’S NONPROBATE NO-

TICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.42.030) 
The Notice Agent named below has elected 
to give notice to creditors of the Decedent, 
DOROTHY MARION MORRIS, and related 
Trust, the AMENDED AND RESTATED 
SURVIVOR’S TRUST DATED OCTOBER 
18, 1996 FOR DOROTHY MARION MOR-
RIS, an irrevocable (inter vivos Trust), as 
amended. As of the date of filing of a copy of 
this notice with the Court, the Notice Agent 
has no knowledge of any other person act-
ing as Notice Agent or of the appointment of 
a personal representative of the Decedent’s 
Estate in the State of Washington.  According 
to the records of the Court as are available 
on the date of the filing of this Notice with the 
Court, a cause number regarding the Dece-
dent has not been issued to any other Notice 
Agent and a personal representative of the 
Decedent’s Estate has not been appointed.  
Any person having a claim against the De-
cedent and/or the above-described Trust 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.42.070 by serv-
ing on or mailing to the Notice Agent or the 
Notice Agent’s attorney at the address stated 
below a copy of the claim and filing the origi-
nal of the claim with the Court in which the 
Notice Agent’s declaration and oath were 
filed. The claim must be presented within the 
later of: (1) Thirty days after the Notice Agent 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor 
as provided under RCW 11.42.020(2)(c); 
or, (2) four (4) months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.42.050 and 11.42.060. The 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
Decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: October 23, 2024. 
The Notice Agent declares under penalty of 
perjury under the laws of the State of Wash-
ington on October 16, 2024, at Everett, 
Washington that the foregoing is true and 
correct. NOTICE AGENT: /s/ VIRGINIA C. 
ANTIPOLO-UTT, as President of Antipolo 
& Paul Law Firm, P.S. NOTICE AGENT: Vir-
ginia C. Antipolo-Utt, President ANTIPOLO & 
PAUL LAW FIRM, P.S. 2825 Colby Avenue, 
Suite 203 Everett, WA  98201 ATTORNEY 
FOR NOTICE AGENT: Virginia C. Antipolo-
Utt, WSBA No. 14696 ANTIPOLO & PAUL 
LAW FIRM, P.S. 2825 Colby Avenue, Suite 
203 Everett, WA  98201 ADDRESS FOR 
MAILING OR SERVICE: ANTIPOLO & PAUL 
LAW FIRM, P.S. c/o Virginia C. Antipolo-Utt 
2825 Colby Avenue, Suite 203 Everett, WA  
98201 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune October 23, 30 & November 6, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter 
of the Estate of BARBARA J. CALLAGHAN, 
Deceased. No. 24-4-02032-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 
The personal representatives named below 
have been appointed as personal represen-
tatives of this estate. Any person having a 
claim against the decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any other-
wise applicable statute of limitations, present 
the claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
personal representative or the personal rep-
resentative’s attorney at the address stated 
below a copy of the claim and filing the origi-
nal of the claim with the court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced. The 
claim must be presented within the later of: 
(1) Thirty days after the personal representa-
tive served or mailed the notice to the credi-
tor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); 
or (2) four (4) months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
DATE OF FILING COPY OF NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS with Clerk of Court: September 
27, 2024 DATE OF FIRST PUBLICATION: 
October 9, 2024 PERSONAL REPRESEN-
TATIVES: RUSSELL C. CALLAGHAN and 
JEANETTE CALLAGHAN POSTMA AT-
TORNEY FOR PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVES: Jeffrey H. Capeloto, WSBA #16238 
Anderson Hunter Law Firm, P.S. 2707 Colby 
Avenue, Suite 1001 Everett, WA 98201 
COURT OF PROBATE PROCEEDINGS: 
Snohomish County Superior Court AND 
CAUSE NUMBER: 24-4-02032-31 Pub-
lished in the Snohomish County Tribune Oc-
tober 9, 16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Mat-
ter of the Estate Of FRANK J. ARCURI 
Deceased. NO. 24-4-02112-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 
The personal representative named below 
has been appointed as personal represen-
tative of this estate. Any person having a 
claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mail-
ing to the personal representative or the 
personal representative’s attorney at the 
address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Personal Representa-
tive: DATE OF FIRST PUBLICATION OF 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS: 10/16/2024 PUB-
LICATION: Snohomish County Tribune /s/ 
ANDREA SZALDA MANZANARES aka AN-
DREA MANZANARES SZALDA PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE Attorney for Personal 
Representative: THOMAS D. BIGSBY, PLLC 
Address for Mailing or Service:  1907 Everett 
Avenue Everett, WA 98201 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 16, 23 
& 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Mat-
ter of the FRANK MORRIS DECEDENT’S 
TRUST, An Irrevocable (inter vivos) Trust. 
No.  24-4-02166-31 NOTICE AGENT’S 
NONPROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.42.030) The Notice Agent named 
below has elected to give notice to creditors 
of the Decedent, DOROTHY MARION MOR-
RIS, and related Trust, the FRANK MORRIS 
DECEDENT’S TRUST, an irrevocable (inter 
vivos Trust), as amended. As of the date of 
filing of a copy of this notice with the Court, 
the Notice Agent has no knowledge of any 
other person acting as Notice Agent or of 
the appointment of a personal representa-
tive of the Decedent’s Estate in the State 
of Washington.  According to the records of 
Sthe Court as are available on the date of the 
filing of this Notice with the Court, a cause 
number regarding the Decedent has not 
been issued to any other Notice Agent and 
a personal representative of the Decedent’s 
Estate has not been appointed. Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent and/or 
the above-described Trust must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any oth-
erwise applicable statute of limitations, pres-
ent the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.42.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Notice Agent or the Notice Agent’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of the 
claim and filing the original of the claim with 
the Court in which the Notice Agent’s decla-
ration and oath were filed.  The claim must 
be presented within the later of: (1) Thirty 
days after the Notice Agent served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.42.020(2)(c); or, (2) four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.42.050 and 
11.42.060.  The bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
October 23, 2024. The Notice Agent declares 
under penalty of perjury under the laws of the 
State of Washington on October 16, 2024, at 
Everett, Washington that the foregoing is true 
and correct. NOTICE AGENT: /s/ VIRGINIA 
C. ANTIPOLO-UTT, as President of Antipolo 
& Paul Law Firm, P.S. NOTICE AGENT: Vir-
ginia C. Antipolo-Utt, President ANTIPOLO & 
PAUL LAW FIRM, P.S. 2825 Colby Avenue, 
Suite 203 Everett, WA  98201 ATTORNEY 
FOR NOTICE AGENT: Virginia C. Antipolo-
Utt, WSBA No. 14696 ANTIPOLO & PAUL 
LAW FIRM, P.S. 2825 Colby Avenue, Suite 
203 Everett, WA  98201 ADDRESS FOR 
MAILING OR SERVICE: ANTIPOLO & PAUL 
LAW FIRM, P.S. c/o Virginia C. Antipolo-Utt 
2825 Colby Avenue, Suite 203 Everett, WA  
98201 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune October 23, 30 & November 6, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY TAIH, LLC, 
a Washington limited liability company, 
Plaintiff, vs. JERRY HAUGSTAD, ROB-
ERT HAUGSTAD, and KENNETH HAUG-
STAD, as the named heirs and devisees 
of ORVILLE EDWARD HAUGSTAD and 
BERNICE M. HAUGSTAD, deceased, and 
UNKNOWN HEIRS and DEVISEES OF OR-
VILLE EDWARD HAUGSTAD, deceased, 
Defendants. No. 24-2-08282-31 SUMMONS 
BY PUBLICATION The State of Washington 
to the said UNKNOWN HEIRS AND DEVI-
SEES OF ORVILLE EDWARD HAUGSTAD: 
You are hereby summoned to appear within 
sixty days after the date of the first publi-
cation of this summons, to wit, within sixty 
days after the 23rd day of October, 2024, 
and defend the above entitled action in the 
above entitled court, and answer the com-
plaint of the plaintiff TAIH, LLC, and serve a 
copy of your answer upon the undersigned 
attorneys for plaintiff TAIH, LLC, at her (or 
their) office below stated; and in case of 
your failure so to do, judgment will be ren-
dered against you according to the demand 
of the complaint, which has been filed with 
the clerk of said court. This matter involves 
a Complaint to Quiet Title to Real Property. 
Dated this 18th day of October 2024. CAR-
SON LAW GROUP, PLLC /s/Holly Shannon 
Holly Shannon, WSBA #44957 Attorney for 
Plaintiff CARSON LAW GROUP, PLLC 3113 
ROCKEFELLER AVE EVERETT, WASH-
INGTON 98201 (425) 493-5000 (425) 493-
5004 (FAX) Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23, 30, November 
6, 13, 20, 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR KING COUNTY IN THE MATTER 
OF THE ESTATE OF CARITA RAE HOZ-
JAN, Deceased. Probate No. 24-4-06679-6 
SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REP-
RESENTATIVE NAMED BELOW has been 
appointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal 
representative or the personal representa-
tive’s attorney at the address stated below 
a copy of the claim and filing the original of 
the claim with the court in which the probate 
proceedings were commenced.  The claim 
must be presented within the later of:  (1) 
Thirty days after the personal representa-
tive served or mailed the notice to the credi-
tor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)

(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice.  If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  
This bar is effective as to claims against both 
the Decedent’s probate and nonprobate as-
sets. Date of first publication: October 16, 
2024 Personal Representative: Cynthia Kay 
Wikstrom Attorney for Personal Representa-
tive: Henry W. Grenley, WSBA #1321 MUL-
LAVEY, PROUT, GRENLEY & FOE, LLP 
2401 NW 65TH P.O. BOX 70567 SEATTLE, 
WA  98127-0567 (206) 789-2511 FAX: (206) 
789-4484 Published in the Snohomish Coun-
ty Tribune October 16, 24 & 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR KING COUNTY IN THE MATTER 
OF THE ESTATE OF DELORMA M. KO-
SIBA, Deceased. Probate No. 24-4-06682-6 
SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REP-
RESENTATIVE NAMED BELOW has been 
appointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in 
the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of:  (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provid-
ed under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of 
the notice.  If the claim is not presented with-
in this time frame, the claim is forever barred, 
except as otherwise provided in RCW 
11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  This bar is effec-
tive as to claims against both the Decedent’s 
probate and nonprobate assets. Date of 
first publication: October 16, 2024 Personal 
Representative: Raymond Kosiba, Jr. Attor-
ney for Personal Representative: Henry W. 
Grenley, WSBA #1321 MULLAVEY, PROUT, 
GRENLEY & FOE, LLP 2401 NW 65TH P.O. 
BOX 70567 SEATTLE, WA  98127-0567 
(206) 789-2511 FAX: (206) 789-4484 Pub-
lished in the Snohomish County Tribune Oc-
tober 16, 23 & 30, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY IN THE 
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF HENRY H. 
JAEGER, DECEASED. No. 24-4-00249-
31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representa-
tive named below has been appointed as 
personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representa-
tive or the personal representative’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months after 
the date of first publication of the notice. If 
the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of first publication: 
October 9, 2024 PERSONAL REPRESEN-
TATIVE JacLynn A. Romine Attorney for Per-
sonal Representative: Gary L. Baker Baker 
Law Firm, P.S. (360) 659-7800 Address for 
Mailing or Service: Baker Law Firm, P.S. 
1802 Grove Street Marysville, Washington 
98270 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune October 9, 16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of 
the Estate of AMANDA D. MICHAELS, De-
ceased. No. 24-4-02062-31 AMENDED 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) The person named below has 
been appointed as Personal Representa-
tive of this estate. Any person having a 
claim against the Decedent must before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mail-
ing to the Personal Representative or the 
Personal Representative’s attorney at the 
address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four months after 
the date of first publication of the notice. If 
the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. Date of first publi-
cation 10-16-2024 Personal Representative 
Angelia Olson a/k/a Angelia Marcoe Attor-
ney for the Personal Representative Patrick 
K. McKenzie Address for Mailing or Service 
4220 132nd Street SE, Suite 201 Mill Creek, 
WA 98012 Court of probate proceedings and 
cause no. Snohomish County Superior Court 
Cause No. 24-4-02062-31 /s/ Angelia Olson 
a/k/a Angelia Marcoe Personal Representa-
tive MARSH MUNDORF PRATT SULLIVAN 
+ McKENZIE, P.S.C. /s/ Patrick K. McKen-
zie, WSBA #19273 Attorney for Personal 
Representative Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 16, 23 & 30, 2024
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SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of 
the Estate of AMANDA D. MICHAELS, De-
ceased. No. 24-4-02062-31 PROBATE NO-
TICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) 
The person named below has been ap-
pointed as Personal Representative of this 
estate. Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. Date of first publi-
cation October 9, 2024 Personal Represen-
tative Angelia Olson Attorney for the Per-
sonal Representative Patrick K. McKenzie 
Address for Mailing or Service 4220 132nd 
Street SE, Suite 201 Mill Creek, WA 98012 
Court of probate proceedings and cause no. 
Snohomish County Superior Court Cause 
No. 24-4-02062-31 /s/ Angelia Olson Per-
sonal Representative MARSH MUNDORF 
PRATT SULLIVAN + McKENZIE, P.S.C. /s/ 
Patrick K. McKenzie, WSBA #19273 Attor-
ney for Personal Representative Published 
in the Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 
16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of DANIEL H. HARRIS, Deceased. 
No. 24-4-01952-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The per-
son named below has been appointed as 
Personal Representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the Decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the Personal Representa-
tive or the Personal Representative’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of first publica-
tion October 9, 2024 Personal Representa-
tive Karen Kay Harris Attorney for the Per-
sonal Representative Patrick K. McKenzie 
Address for Mailing or Service 4220 132nd 
Street SE, Suite 201 Mill Creek, WA 98012 
Court of probate proceedings and cause no. 
Snohomish County Superior Court Cause 
No. 24-4-01952-31 /s/ Karen Kay Harris Per-
sonal Representative MARSH MUNDORF 
PRATT SULLIVAN + McKENZIE, P.S.C. /s/ 
Patrick K. McKenzie WSBA #19273 Attorney 
for Personal Representative Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune October 9, 16 & 
23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of LeROY W. HOEHNE, Deceased. 
No. 24-4-02160-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The per-
son named below has been appointed as 
Personal Representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the Decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner 
as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the Personal Representa-
tive or the Personal Representative’s attor-
ney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of first publication 
10/23/2024 Personal Representative Steven 
G. Hoehne Attorney for the Personal Repre-
sentative Jeffrey E. Pratt Address for Mailing 
or Service 4220 132nd Street SE, Suite 201 
Mill Creek, WA 98012 Court of probate pro-
ceedings and cause no. Snohomish County 
Superior Court Cause No. 24-4-02160-31 /s/ 
Steven G. Hoehne Personal Representative 
MARSH MUNDORF PRATT SULLIVAN + 
McKENZIE, P.S.C. /s/ Jeffrey E. Pratt, WSBA 
#10702 Attorney for Personal Representa-
tive Published in the Snohomish County Tri-
bune October 23, 30 & November 6, 2024

Superior Court of Washington, County 
of SNOHOMISH In re: Petitioner: JOHN 
KRETZSCHMAR And Respondent: ORI-
FRO ISOLINA GABRIEL KRETZSCHMAR 
No. 24-3-01650-31 Summons Served by 
Publication (SMPB) Summons Served by 
Publication To: ORIFRO KRETZSCHMAR 
I have started a court case by filing a peti-

tion. The name of the Petition is: PETITION 
FOR DIVORCE You must respond in writing 
if you want the court to consider your side. 
Deadline! Your Response must be filed and 
served within 60 days of the date this Sum-
mons is published: September 18, 2024. If 
you do not file and serve your Response or a 
Notice of Appearance by the deadline: •  No 
one has to notify you about other hearings 
in this case, and •  The court may approve 
the requests in the Petition without hearing 
your side (called a default judgment). Follow 
these steps: 1. Read the Petition and any 
other documents that were filed at court with 
this Summons. Those documents explain 
what the other party is asking for. 2. Fill out a 
Response on this form (check the Response 
that matches the Petition): FL Divorce 211, 
Response to Petition about a Marriage You 
can get the Response form and other forms 
you may need at: •  The ‘Washington State 
Courts’ website: www.courts.wa.gov/forms 
•  Washington LawHelp: www.washington-
lawhelp.org, or •  The Superior Court Clerk’s 
office or county law library (for a fee). 3. 
Serve (give) a copy of your Response to the 
person who filed this Summons at the ad-
dress below, and to any other parties. You 
may use certified mail with return receipt 
requested. For more information on how to 
serve, read Superior Court Civil Rule 5. 4. 
File your original Response with the court 
clerk at this address:
Superior Court Clerk, SNOHOMISH County 
MS-605, 3000 Rockefeller Everett, WA, 
98201 5. Lawyer not required: It is a good 
idea to talk to a lawyer, but you may file and 
serve your Response without one. Person 
filing this Summons or his/her lawyer fills 
out below: /s/ G. Geoffrey Gibbs WSBA No. 
6146 Date 9-4-24 I agree to accept legal 
papers for this case at Lawyer’s address: 
2707 Colby Ave., Ste. 1001 Everett WA 
98201Email: ggibbs@andersonhunterlaw.
com This Summons is issued according to 
Rule 4.1 of the Superior Court Civil Rules 
of the state of Washington. Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune September 18, 
25, October 2, 9, 16 & 23, 2024

Superior Court of Washington, County of 
SNOHOMISH In re: Petitioner: MAXX E. 
PINORINI And Respondent: BRITTANY NI-
COLE PENNINGTON No. 24-3-01269-31 
Summons Served by Publication (SMPB) 
Summons Served by Publication To: BRIT-
TANY PENNINGTON I have started a court 
case by filing a petition. The name of the 
Petition is: Petition for Divorce You must re-
spond in writing if you want the court to con-
sider your side. Deadline! Your Response 
must be filed and served within 60 days of 
the date this Summons is published: Sep-
tember 18, 2024. If you do not file and serve 
your Response or a Notice of Appearance 
by the deadline: •  No one has to notify you 
about other hearings in this case, and •  The 
court may approve the requests in the Peti-
tion without hearing your side (called a de-
fault judgment). Follow these steps: 1. Read 
the Petition and any other documents that 
were filed at court with this Summons. Those 
documents explain what the other party is 
asking for. 2. Fill out a Response on this 
form (check the Response that matches the 
Petition): FL Divorce 211, Response to Peti-
tion about a Marriage You can get the Re-
sponse form and other forms you may need 
at: •  The Washington State Courts’ website: 
www.courts.wa.gov/forms •  Washington 
LawHelp: www.washingtonlawhelp.org, or •  
The Superior Court Clerk’s office or county 
law library (for a fee). 3. Serve (give) a copy 
of your Response to the person who filed this 
Summons at the address below, and to any 
other parties. You may use certified mail with 
return receipt requested. For more informa-
tion on how to serve, read Superior Court 
Civil Rule 5. 4. File your original Response 
with the court clerk at this address: Superior 
Court Clerk, SNOHOMISH County MS-605, 
3000 Rockefeller Everett, WA, 98201 5. 
Lawyer not required: It is a good idea to talk 
to a lawyer, but you may file and serve your 
Response without one. Person filing this 
Summons or his/her lawyer fills out below: 
/s/ LAURIE UMMEL WSBA No. 35407 Date 
9/3/24 I agree to accept legal papers for this 
case at Lawyer’s address: 2707 Colby Av-
enue, Suite 1001 Everett WA 98201 Email: 
lummel@andersonhunterlaw.com This Sum-
mons is issued according to Rule 4.1 of the 
Superior Court Civil Rules of the state of 
Washington. Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune September 18, 25, October 
2, 9, 16 & 23, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT, STATE OF WASHING-
TON, COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH ROBERT 
M. BRITT and LISA J. BRITT, individually and 
as husband and wife and the marital commu-
nity comprised thereof, Plaintiffs, V. ERNEST 
(ERNST) BOHL and LINA BOHL, husband 
and wife, if living and if deceased and the 
unknown heirs at law, SEATTLE CEDAR 
LUMBER MANUFACTURING COMPANY, 
a corporation, WISCONSIN TIMBER COM-
PANY, EBEY LOGGING COMPANY, O.P. 
KNUDSON, individually, EYRE SHINGLE 
COMPANY, ALBERT J. HENDRICKSON, 
individually, J.E.J INC. a Washington State 
Corporation, ORVID L SWEARENGIN and 
MURIEL D. SWEARENGIN individually and 
husband and wife and the marital community 
comprised thereof, if living and if deceased 
their unknown heirs at law, ELDON W. 
HURST and LUCILLE R. HURST, individu-
ally and as husband and wife and the marital 
community comprised thereof, if living and if 
deceased, the unknown heirs at law; AND 
ALL OTHER PERSONS OR PARTIES UN-
KNOWN CLAIMING ANY RIGHT, TITLE ES-
TATE, LIEN, OR INTEREST IN THE REAL 
ESTATE DESCRIBED IN THE COMPLAINT 
HEREIN, Defendants. NO. 24-2-07176-31 
SUMMONS BY PUBLICATION THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON TO THE DEFENDANTS:
ERNEST (ERNST) BOHL and LINA BOHL, 
husband and wife, if living and if deceased 

and the unknown heirs at law, SEATTLE CE-
DAR LUMBER MANUFACTURING COM-
PANY, a corporation, WISCONSIN TIMBER 
COMPANY, EBEY LOGGING COMPANY, 
O.P. KNUDSON, individually, EYRE SHIN-
GLE COMPANY, ALBERT J. HENDRICK-
SON, individually, J.E.J INC. a Washington 
State Corporation, ORVID L SWEARENGIN 
and MURIEL D. SWEARENGIN individu-
ally and husband and wife and the marital 
community comprised thereof, if living and 
if deceased their unknown heirs at law, EL-
DON W. HURST and LUCILLE R. HURST, 
individually and as husband and wife and 
the marital community comprised thereof, if 
living and if deceased, the unknown heirs at 
law; AND ALL OTHER PERSONS OR PAR-
TIES UNKNOWN CLAIMING ANY RIGHT, 
TITLE ESTATE, LIEN, OR INTEREST IN 
THE REAL ESTATE DESCRIBED IN THE 
COMPLAINT HEREIN.
You are hereby summoned to appear within 
sixty days after the date of the first publica-
tion of this summons, to wit, within sixty days 
after the 2nd day October 2024, and defend 
the above entitled action in the above en-
titled court, and answer the complaint of the 
plaintiffs, Robert M. Britt and Lisa J. Britt, and 
serve a copy of your answer upon the under-
signed attorneys for plaintiff Robert M. Britt 
and Lisa J. Britt, at their office at 1830 Bick-
ford Ave. Ste 204, Snohomish, WA 98290; 
and in case of your failure to do so, judg-
ment will be rendered against you according 
to the demand of the complaint, which has 
been fi led with the clerk of said court. This is 
an action for Quiet Title of that real property 
that you own with Robert M. Britt and Lisa 
J. Britt. DATED this 26th day of September, 
2024. /s/ Justin K. Monro, WSBA #44763 At-
torney for Plaintiffs The Monro Law Firm PS 
Inc. 1830 Bickford Ave. Ste 204 Snohomish, 
WA 98290 P:360-863-3728 F:360-863-3985 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
October 2, 9, 16, 23, 30 & November 6, 2024

TS #: 23-67112 Title Order #: 2975811 NO-
TICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE
Grantor: REGINALD STEPHEN PERRY, 
UNMARRIED MAN Current beneficiary of 
the deed of trust: NewRez LLC, D/B/A Shell-
point Mortgage Servicing
Current trustee of the deed of trust: North 
Star Trustee, LLC Current mortgage servicer 
for the deed of trust: NewRez LLC, D/B/A 
Shellpoint Mortgage Servicing Reference 
number of the deed of trust: 201809070293 
Parcel Number(s): 009122-000-011-00
I. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the un-
dersigned Trustee, North Star Trustee, LLC 
will on 11/1/2024, at 9:00 AM at the North 
Entrance Plaza, Snohomish County Supe-
rior Courthouse, 3000 Rockefeller Avenue, 
Everett, WA 98201 sell at public auction to 
the highest and best bidder, payable at the 
time of sale, the following described real 
property, situated in the County of Snohom-
ish, State of Washington, to-wit: LOT 11, 
COUNTRY WOODS 1, ACCORDING TO 
THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED UNDER 
RECORDING NUMBER 200008305005, 
RECORDS OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY, 
WASHINGTON. SITUATE IN THE COUNTY 
OF SNOHOMISH, STATE OF WASHING-
TON Commonly known as: 927 183RD PL 
SE BOTHELL, WASHINGTON 98012 which 
is subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
9/4/2018, recorded 9/7/2018, as Instrument 
No. 201809070293, The Deed of Trust was 
modified under Loan Modification Agree-
ment recorded 5/31/2022 under Instrument 
No. 202205310484 records of Snohom-
ish County, Washington, from REGINALD 
STEPHEN PERRY, UNMARRIED MAN, as 
Grantor(s), to CHICAGO TITLE, as Trustee, 
to secure an obligation in favor of  MORT-
GAGE ELECTRONIC REGISTRATION 
SYSTEMS, INC. (“MERS”), AS DESIGNAT-
ED NOMINEE FOR WMS SERIES LLC., 
BENEFICIARY OF THE SECURITY IN-
STRUMENT, ITS SUCCESSORS AND AS-
SIGNS, as Beneficiary, the beneficial inter-
est in which was assigned to  NewRez LLC, 
D/B/A Shellpoint Mortgage Servicing, under 
an Assignment recorded under Auditor’s File 
No. 202309120025.
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default 
on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust.
III. The default(s) for which this foreclosure is 
made is/are as follows: Failure to pay when 
due the following amounts which are now in 
arrears: PAYMENT INFORMATION
FROM    THRU       NO.PMT AMOUNT  TO-
TAL
4/1/2023  08/31/2023  5      $3,271.07  
$16,355.35
9/1/2023  10/31/2023  2      $3,536.25  
$7,072.50
11/1/2023 01/31/2024  3      $3,239.33  
$9,717.99
2/1/2024  06/28/2024  5     $3,264.01   
$16,320.05
Legal Fee Balance: $3,531.50
Unapplied Balance: ($1,654.51)
Other Fees Balance: $269.00
LATE CHARGE INFORMATION
TOTAL LATE CHARGES
TOTAL $1,364.61
PROMISSORY NOTE INFORMATION
Note Dated: 9/4/2018
Note Amount: $555,750.00
Interest Paid To: 3/1/2023
Next Due Date: 4/1/2023
IV. The sum owing on the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust is:  Principal   
$567,470.87, together with interest as pro-
vided in the note or other instrument se-
cured from 3/1/2023, and such other costs 
and fees as are due under the note or other 
instrument secured, and as are provided by 
statute.
V. The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust as 
provided by statute. The sale will be made 

without warranty, express or implied, re-
garding title, possession, or encumbrances 
on 11/1/2024.  The default(s) referred to in 
Paragraph III must be cured by 10/21/2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a dis-
continuance of the sale.  The sale will be dis-
continued and terminated if at any time be-
fore 10/21/2024 (11 days before the sale) the 
default as set forth in Paragraph III is cured 
and the Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. 
Payment must be in cash or with cashiers 
or certified checks from a State or federally 
chartered bank.  The sale may be terminated 
any time after the 10/21/2024 (11 days be-
fore the sale date) and before the sale, by 
the Borrower or Grantor or the holder of any 
recorded junior lien or encumbrance paying 
the entire principal and interest secured by 
the Deed of Trust, plus costs, fees, and ad-
vances, if any, made pursuant to the terms 
of the obligation and/or Deed of Trust, and 
curing all other defaults.
VI. A written Notice of Default was trans-
mitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower and Grantor at the following ad-
dresses:
NAME  ADDRESS
REGINALD STEPHEN PERRY AKA REGI-
NALD STEPHE PERRY AKA REGINALD S 
PERRY
927 183RD PL SE
BOTHELL, WA 98012
REGINALD STEPHEN PERRY AKA REGI-
NALD STEPHE PERRY AKA REGINALD S 
PERRY
927 183RD PL SE
BOTHELL, WA 98012-6805
REGINALD STEPHEN PERRY AKA REGI-
NALD STEPHE PERRY AKA REGINALD S 
PERRY
927 183RD PLACE SE
BOTHELL, WA 98012
by both first class and certified mail on 
5/22/2024, proof of which is in the possession 
of the Trustee; and the Borrower and Grantor 
were personally served 5/22/2024, with said 
written Notice of Default or the written Notice 
of Default was posted in a conspicuous place 
on the real property described in Paragraph 
I above, and the Trustee has possession of 
proof of such service or posting.
VII. The Trustee whose name and address 
are set forth below will provide in writing to 
anyone requesting it, a statement of all costs 
and fees due at any time prior to the sale.
VIII. The effect of the sale will be to de-
prive the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property.
IX. Anyone having any objections to this sale 
on any grounds whatsoever will be afforded 
an opportunity to be heard as to those ob-
jections if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the 
sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130.  Failure to 
bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s sale.
X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS 
-  The purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is enti-
tled to possession of the property on the 20th 
day following the sale, as against the Grantor 
under the deed of trust (the owner) and any-
one having an interest junior to the deed of 
trust, including occupants and tenants.  After 
the 20th day following the sale the purchaser 
has the right to evict occupants and tenants 
by summary proceedings under the Unlawful 
Detainer Act, Chapter 59.12 RCW.  For ten-
ant-occupied property, the purchaser shall 
provide a tenant with written notice in accor-
dance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE 
IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You 
have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 
the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trust-
ee Sale to be referred to mediation. If this 
is an amended Notice of Trustee Sale pro-
viding a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE - Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission:  Telephone: 1-877-894HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) Web site: http://www.dfi.
wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/ The 
United States Department of Housing and 
Urban Development: Telephone: 1-800-569-
4287 Web site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudpor-
tal/HUD The statewide civil legal aid hotline 
for assistance and referrals to other housing 
counselors and attorneys Telephone: 1-800-
606-4819 Web site: http://www.ocla.wa.gov/ 
This office is enforcing a security interest of 
your creditor. To the extent that your obliga-
tion has been discharged by a bankruptcy 
court or is subject to an automatic stay of 
bankruptcy, this notice is for informational 
purposes only and does not constitute a de-
mand for payment or any attempt to collect 
such obligation. DATED: 07/01/2024 North 
Star Trustee, LLC, as Trustee Lisa Hackney, 
Vice President of Trustee Operations Ad-
dress for service: North Star Trustee, LLC 
6100 219th ST SW, Suite 480 Mountlake 
Terrace, Washington 98043 Trustee Phone 
No: (206) 866-5345 Trustee Fax No: (206) 
374-2252 Beneficiary / Servicer Phone:  
800-365-7107 STATE OF WASHINGTON 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH ))) ss.  I certify 
that I know or have satisfactory evidence that 
Lisa Hackney is the person who appeared 
before me, and said person acknowledged 
that (he/she) signed this instrument, on oath 
stated that (he/she) was authorized to ex-
ecute the instrument and acknowledged it 
as the Vice President of Trustee Operations 

of North Star Trustee, LLC to be the free 
and voluntary act of such party for the uses 
and purposes mentioned in the instrument. 
Dated: 07/01/2024 Jasmine Turner NOTARY 
PUBLIC in and for the State of Washington, 
residing at Everett, Washington My com-
mission expires 3/14/2028 EPP 40550 Pub 
Dates 10/02 && 10/23/2024

TS #: 24-68216 Title Order #:  
240130428-WA-MSI NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE
Grantor:  DANIEL E. CHEENEY AND ANA 
L. CHEENEY, HUSBAND AND WIFE Cur-
rent beneficiary of the deed of trust: U.S. 
BANK TRUST NATIONAL ASSOCIATION, 
NOT IN ITS INDIVIDUAL CAPACITY BUT 
SOLELY AS OWNER TRUSTEE FOR RCAF 
ACQUISITION TRUST Current trustee of 
the deed of trust: North Star Trustee, LLC 
Current mortgage servicer for the deed of 
trust: Selene Finance, LP Reference number 
of the deed of trust: 200712040305 Parcel 
Number(s): 00648000001600
I. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the un-
dersigned Trustee, North Star Trustee, LLC 
will on 11/1/2024, at 10:00 AM at Outside 
The North Plaza Entrance to the Snohom-
ish County Courthouse, 3000 Rockefeller 
Ave, Everett, WA sell at public auction to 
the highest and best bidder, payable at the 
time of sale, the following described real 
property, situated in the County of Sno-
homish, State of Washington, to-wit: LOT 
16, FIRDALE, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT 
THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 35 
OF PLATS, PAGE(S) 94, RECORDS OF 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. 
Commonly known as: 9822 240TH ST SW 
EDMONDS, WASHINGTON 98020 which is 
subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
11/16/2007, recorded 12/4/2007, as Instru-
ment No. 200712040305, records of Sno-
homish County, Washington, from DANIEL 
E. CHEENEY AND ANA L. CHEENEY, HUS-
BAND AND WIFE, as Grantor(s), to FANLA 
- SUBESCROW, as Trustee, to secure an 
obligation in favor of  Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, Inc. (“MERS”), as 
designated nominee for QUICKEN LOANS 
INC., beneficiary of the security instrument, 
its successors and assigns, as Beneficiary, 
the beneficial interest in which was assigned 
to  U.S. BANK TRUST NATIONAL ASSOCI-
ATION, NOT IN ITS INDIVIDUAL CAPACITY 
BUT SOLELY AS OWNER TRUSTEE FOR 
RCAF ACQUISITION TRUST , under an As-
signment recorded under Auditor’s File No. 
202311160080.
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default 
on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust.
III. The default(s) for which this foreclosure is 
made is/are as follows: Failure to pay when 
due the following amounts which are now in 
arrears: PAYMENT INFORMATION
Total Monthly Payments Due: TOTAL
May 1, 2023 -  June 17, 2024 $35,196.58
Corporate Advances: $2,863.26
LATE CHARGE INFORMATION
TOTAL LATE CHARGES
TOTAL $905.10
PROMISSORY NOTE INFORMATION
Note Dated: 11/16/2007
Note Amount: $375,400.00
Interest Paid To: 4/1/2023
Next Due Date: 5/1/2023
IV. The sum owing on the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust is:  Principal   
$352,808.68, together with interest as pro-
vided in the note or other instrument se-
cured from 4/1/2023, and such other costs 
and fees as are due under the note or other 
instrument secured, and as are provided by 
statute.
V. The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust as 
provided by statute. The sale will be made 
without warranty, express or implied, re-
garding title, possession, or encumbrances 
on 11/1/2024.  The default(s) referred to in 
Paragraph III must be cured by 10/21/2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a 
discontinuance of the sale.  The sale will 
be discontinued and terminated if at any 
time before 10/21/2024 (11 days before the 
sale) the default as set forth in Paragraph 
III is cured and the Trustee’s fees and 
costs are paid. Payment must be in cash 
or with cashiers or certified checks from 
a State or federally chartered bank.  The 
sale may be terminated any time after the 
10/21/2024 (11 days before the sale date) 
and before the sale, by the Borrower or 
Grantor or the holder of any recorded ju-
nior lien or encumbrance paying the entire 
principal and interest secured by the Deed 
of Trust, plus costs, fees, and advances, 
if any, made pursuant to the terms of the 
obligation and/or Deed of Trust, and cur-
ing all other defaults.
VI. A written Notice of Default was trans-
mitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower and Grantor at the following ad-
dresses:
NAME  ADDRESS
ANA L. CHEENEY
9822 240TH ST SW
EDMONDS, WA 98020
ANA L. CHEENEY
9822 240TH STREET S W
EDMONDS, WA 98020
ANA L. CHEENEY, PR OF THE ESTATE 
OF DANIEL E. CHEENEY AKA DANIEL 
E.A. CHEENEY AKA DANIEL EDWIN AL-
FRED CHEENEY C/O BOUNTIFUL LAW 
ATTN: BRAD PUFFPAFF, ESQ. 
4620 200TH ST SW STE D
LYNNWOOD, WA 98036
DANIEL E. CHEENEY AKA DANIEL E.A. 
CHEENEY AKA DANIEL EDWIN ALFRED 
CHEENEY
9822 240TH ST SW
EDMONDS, WA 98020
DANIEL E. CHEENEY AKA DANIEL E.A. 



TribunePage 14 October 23, 2024

CHEENEY AKA DANIEL EDWIN ALFRED 
CHEENEY
9822 240TH STREET S W
EDMONDS, WA 98020
HEIRS AND DEVISEES OF DANIEL E. 
CHEENEY AKA DANIEL E.A. CHEENEY 
AKA DANIEL EDWIN ALFRED CHEENEY
9822 240TH ST SW
EDMONDS, WA 98020
HEIRS AND DEVISEES OF DANIEL E. 
CHEENEY AKA DANIEL E.A. CHEENEY 
AKA DANIEL EDWIN ALFRED CHEENEY
9822 240TH STREET S W
EDMONDS, WA 98020
THE ESTATE OF DANIEL E. CHEENEY 
AKA DANIEL E.A. CHEENEY AKA DANIEL 
EDWIN ALFRED CHEENEY
9822 240TH ST SW
EDMONDS, WA 98020
THE ESTATE OF DANIEL E. CHEENEY 
AKA DANIEL E.A. CHEENEY AKA DANIEL 
EDWIN ALFRED CHEENEY
9822 240TH STREET S W
EDMONDS, WA 98020
by both first class and certified mail on 
5/10/2024, proof of which is in the possession 
of the Trustee; and the Borrower and Grantor 
were personally served 5/10/2024, with said 
written Notice of Default or the written Notice 
of Default was posted in a conspicuous place 
on the real property described in Paragraph 
I above, and the Trustee has possession of 
proof of such service or posting.
VII. The Trustee whose name and address 
are set forth below will provide in writing to 
anyone requesting it, a statement of all costs 
and fees due at any time prior to the sale.
VIII. The effect of the sale will be to de-
prive the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property.
IX. Anyone having any objections to this sale 
on any grounds whatsoever will be afforded 
an opportunity to be heard as to those ob-
jections if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the 
sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130.  Failure to 
bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s sale.
X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS 
-  The purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is enti-
tled to possession of the property on the 20th 
day following the sale, as against the Grantor 
under the deed of trust (the owner) and any-
one having an interest junior to the deed of 
trust, including occupants and tenants.  After 
the 20th day following the sale the purchaser 
has the right to evict occupants and tenants 
by summary proceedings under the Unlawful 
Detainer Act, Chapter 59.12 RCW.  For ten-
ant-occupied property, the purchaser shall 
provide a tenant with written notice in accor-
dance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE 
IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You 
have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 
the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trust-
ee Sale to be referred to mediation. If this 
is an amended Notice of Trustee Sale pro-
viding a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE - Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission:  Telephone: 1-877-894HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) Web site: http://www.dfi.
wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/ The 
United States Department of Housing and 
Urban Development: Telephone: 1-800-569-
4287 Web site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudpor-
tal/HUD The statewide civil legal aid hotline 
for assistance and referrals to other housing 
counselors and attorneys Telephone: 1-800-
606-4819 Web site: http://www.ocla.wa.gov/ 
This office is enforcing a security interest of 
your creditor. To the extent that your obliga-
tion has been discharged by a bankruptcy 
court or is subject to an automatic stay of 
bankruptcy, this notice is for informational 
purposes only and does not constitute a de-
mand for payment or any attempt to collect 
such obligation. DATED: 07/01/2024 North 
Star Trustee, LLC, as Trustee Lisa Hackney, 
Vice President of Trustee Operations Ad-
dress for service: North Star Trustee, LLC 
6100 219th ST SW, Suite 480 Mountlake 
Terrace, Washington 98043 Trustee Phone 
No: (206) 866-5345 Trustee Fax No: (206) 
374-2252 Beneficiary / Servicer Phone:  
(877) 735-3637 STATE OF WASHINGTON 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH ))) ss. I certify 
that I know or have satisfactory evidence that 
Lisa Hackney is the person who appeared 
before me, and said person acknowledged 
that (he/she) signed this instrument, on oath 
stated that (he/she) was authorized to ex-
ecute the instrument and acknowledged it 
as the Vice President of Trustee Operations 
of North Star Trustee, LLC to be the free 
and voluntary act of such party for the uses 
and purposes mentioned in the instrument. 
Dated: 07/01/2024 Jasmine Turner NOTARY 
PUBLIC in and for the State of Washington, 
residing at Everett, Washington My com-
mission expires 3/14/2028 EPP 40548 Pub 
Dates 10/02 & 10/23/2024

TS #: 24-68262 Title Order #:  
240136019-WA-MSI NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE
Grantor: KYLE A COOPER, AN UNMAR-
RIED MAN Current beneficiary of the deed 
of trust: Lakeview Loan Servicing, LLC Cur-
rent trustee of the deed of trust: North Star 
Trustee, LLC Current mortgage servicer for 
the deed of trust: LoanCare, LLC Reference 

number of the deed of trust: 202210060608 
Parcel Number(s): 00628300008000
I. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the un-
dersigned Trustee, North Star Trustee, LLC 
will on 11/1/2024, at 9:00 AM at the North 
Entrance Plaza, Snohomish County Superior 
Courthouse, 3000 Rockefeller Avenue, Ever-
ett, WA 98201 sell at public auction to the 
highest and best bidder, payable at the time 
of sale, the following described real property, 
situated in the County of Snohomish, State 
of Washington, to-wit: LOT 80, WHISPER-
ING FIRS, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT 
THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 29 
OF PLATS, PAGES 48 AND 49, RECORDS 
OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHING-
TON. SITUATE IN THE CITY OF MARYS-
VILLE, COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, STATE 
OF WASHINGTON. Commonly known 
as: 4408 123RD PL NE MARYSVILLE, 
WASHINGTON 98271 which is subject to 
that certain Deed of Trust dated 10/4/2022, 
recorded 10/6/2022, as Instrument No. 
202210060608, records of Snohomish 
County, Washington, from KYLE A COO-
PER, AN UNMARRIED MAN, as Grantor(s), 
to WFG NATIONAL TITLE COMPANY OF 
WASHINGTON, LLC., as Trustee, to se-
cure an obligation in favor of  MORTGAGE 
ELECTRONIC REGISTRATION SYSTEMS, 
INC. (“MERS”), AS DESIGNATED NOMI-
NEE FOR EVERGREEN MONEYSOURCE 
MORTGAGE COMPANY, BENEFICIARY 
OF THE SECURITY INSTRUMENT, ITS 
SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS, as Ben-
eficiary, the beneficial interest in which was 
assigned to Lakeview Loan Servicing, LLC 
, under an Assignment recorded under Audi-
tor’s File No. 202402260285.
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default 
on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust.
III. The default(s) for which this foreclosure is 
made is/are as follows: Failure to pay when 
due the following amounts which are now in 
arrears: PAYMENT INFORMATION
Total Monthly Payments Due: TOTAL
October 1, 2023 - June 3, 2024 $31,592.01
Corporate Advances: $5,400.23
NSF Fees: $45.00
LATE CHARGE INFORMATION
TOTAL LATE CHARGES
TOTAL $794.71
PROMISSORY NOTE INFORMATION
Note Dated: 10/4/2022
Note Amount: $432,030.00
Interest Paid To: 9/1/2023
Next Due Date: 10/1/2023
IV. The sum owing on the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust is:  Principal   
$428,305.39, together with interest as pro-
vided in the note or other instrument se-
cured from 9/1/2023, and such other costs 
and fees as are due under the note or other 
instrument secured, and as are provided by 
statute.
V. The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust as 
provided by statute. The sale will be made 
without warranty, express or implied, re-
garding title, possession, or encumbrances 
on 11/1/2024.  The default(s) referred to in 
Paragraph III must be cured by 10/21/2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a dis-
continuance of the sale.  The sale will be dis-
continued and terminated if at any time be-
fore 10/21/2024 (11 days before the sale) the 
default as set forth in Paragraph III is cured 
and the Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. 
Payment must be in cash or with cashiers 
or certified checks from a State or federally 
chartered bank.  The sale may be terminated 
any time after the 10/21/2024 (11 days be-
fore the sale date) and before the sale, by 
the Borrower or Grantor or the holder of any 
recorded junior lien or encumbrance paying 
the entire principal and interest secured by 
the Deed of Trust, plus costs, fees, and ad-
vances, if any, made pursuant to the terms 
of the obligation and/or Deed of Trust, and 
curing all other defaults.
VI. A written Notice of Default was trans-
mitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower and Grantor at the following ad-
dresses:
NAME  ADDRESS
KYLE COOPER AKA KYLE A COOPER
4408 123RD PL NE
MARYSVILLE, WA 98271
KYLE COOPER AKA KYLE A COOPER
4408 123RD PL NE
MARYSVILLE, WA 98271-8565
KYLE COOPER AKA KYLE A COOPER
4408 123RD PLACE NE
MARYSVILLE, WA 98271
by both first class and certified mail on 
4/25/2024, proof of which is in the possession 
of the Trustee; and the Borrower and Grantor 
were personally served 4/24/2024, with said 
written Notice of Default or the written Notice 
of Default was posted in a conspicuous place 
on the real property described in Paragraph 
I above, and the Trustee has possession of 
proof of such service or posting.
VII. The Trustee whose name and address 
are set forth below will provide in writing to 
anyone requesting it, a statement of all costs 
and fees due at any time prior to the sale.
VIII. The effect of the sale will be to de-
prive the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property.
IX. Anyone having any objections to this sale 
on any grounds whatsoever will be afforded 
an opportunity to be heard as to those ob-
jections if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the 
sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130.  Failure to 
bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s sale.
X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS 
-  The purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is enti-
tled to possession of the property on the 20th 
day following the sale, as against the Grantor 
under the deed of trust (the owner) and any-

one having an interest junior to the deed of 
trust, including occupants and tenants.  After 
the 20th day following the sale the purchaser 
has the right to evict occupants and tenants 
by summary proceedings under the Unlawful 
Detainer Act, Chapter 59.12 RCW.  For ten-
ant-occupied property, the purchaser shall 
provide a tenant with written notice in accor-
dance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE 
IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You 
have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 
the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trust-
ee Sale to be referred to mediation. If this 
is an amended Notice of Trustee Sale pro-
viding a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE - Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Telephone: 1-877-894HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) Web site: http://www.dfi.
wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/ The 
United States Department of Housing and 
Urban Development: Telephone: 1-800-569-
4287 Web site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudpor-
tal/HUD The statewide civil legal aid hotline 
for assistance and referrals to other housing 
counselors and attorneys Telephone: 1-800-
606-4819 Web site: http://www.ocla.wa.gov/ 
This office is enforcing a security interest of 
your creditor. To the extent that your obliga-
tion has been discharged by a bankruptcy 
court or is subject to an automatic stay of 
bankruptcy, this notice is for informational 
purposes only and does not constitute a de-
mand for payment or any attempt to collect 
such obligation. DATED: 06/28/2024 North 
Star Trustee, LLC, as Trustee Lisa Hackney, 
Vice President of Trustee Operations Ad-
dress for service: North Star Trustee, LLC 
6100 219th ST SW, Suite 480 Mountlake 
Terrace, Washington 98043 Trustee Phone 
No: (206) 866-5345 Trustee Fax No: (206) 
374-2252 Beneficiary / Servicer Phone:  
(800)909-9525 STATE OF WASHINGTON 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH ))) ss. I certify 
that I know or have satisfactory evidence that 
Lisa Hackney is the person who appeared 
before me, and said person acknowledged 
that (he/she) signed this instrument, on oath 
stated that (he/she) was authorized to ex-
ecute the instrument and acknowledged it 
as the Vice President of Trustee Operations 
of North Star Trustee, LLC to be the free 
and voluntary act of such party for the uses 
and purposes mentioned in the instrument. 
Dated: 06/28/2024 Jasmine Turner NOTARY 
PUBLIC in and for the State of Washington, 
residing at Everett, Washington My com-
mission expires 3/14/2028 EPP 40527 Pub 
dates 10/02 & 10/23/2024

TS #: 24-68715 Title Order #:  
240201490-WA-MSI NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE
Grantor: ALISHA BOND, A MARRIED 
WOMAN. Current beneficiary of the deed 
of trust: New American Funding, LLC Cur-
rent trustee of the deed of trust: North Star 
Trustee, LLC Current mortgage servicer 
for the deed of trust: New American Fund-
ing, LLC Reference number of the deed of 
trust: 202203140708 Parcel Number(s): 
00560500000203
I. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the un-
dersigned Trustee, North Star Trustee, LLC 
will on 11/1/2024, at 10:00 AM at Outside 
The North Plaza Entrance to the Snohom-
ish County Courthouse, 3000 Rockefeller 
Ave, Everett, WA sell at public auction to the 
highest and best bidder, payable at the time 
of sale, the following described real prop-
erty, situated in the County of Snohomish, 
State of Washington, to-wit: BEGINNING 
AT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF LOT 
2, ROSE ARMSTRONG’S SUBURBAN 
ACRE TRACTS; THENCE NORTH ALONG 
EAST LINE OF SAID SUBDIVISION 69.4 
FEET; THENCE WEST PARALLEL WITH 
THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID SUBDIVISION 
104 FEET; THENCE PARALLEL TO SAID 
EAST LINE 69.4 FEET; THENCE EAST 
ALONG SAID SOUTH LINE TO POINT 
OF BEGINNING, ACCORDING TO THE 
PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 
6 OF PLATS, PAGE 18, RECORDS OF 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. 
SITUATE IN THE COUNTY OF SNOHOM-
ISH, STATE OF WASHINGTON. Com-
monly known as: 517 HILLCREST DR AR-
LINGTON, WASHINGTON 98223 which is 
subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
3/8/2022, recorded 3/14/2022, as Instrument 
No. 202203140708, records of Snohomish 
County, Washington, from ALISHA BOND, 
A MARRIED WOMAN., as Grantor(s), to 
CHICAGO TITLE OF WASHINGTON, as 
Trustee, to secure an obligation in favor of  
Mortgage Electronic Registration Systems, 
Inc. (“MERS”), as designated nominee for 
BROKER SOLUTIONS, INC,. DBA NEW 
AMERICAN FUNDING, beneficiary of the 
security instrument, its successors and as-
signs, as Beneficiary, the beneficial interest 
in which was assigned to New American 
Funding, LLC, under an Assignment record-
ed under Auditor’s File No. 202302210497.
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default 
on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust.
III. The default(s) for which this foreclosure is 
made is/are as follows: Failure to pay when 

due the following amounts which are now in 
arrears: PAYMENT INFORMATION
FROM    THRU       NO.PMT  AMOUNT     TO-
TAL
12/1/2023 06/28/2024 7      $2,622.42  
$18,356.94
Corporate Advances: $3,722.00
Bad Check: $15.00
LATE CHARGE INFORMATION
TOTAL LATE CHARGES
TOTAL $550.76
PROMISSORY NOTE INFORMATION
Note Dated: 3/8/2022
Note Amount: $382,580.00
Interest Paid To: 11/1/2023
Next Due Date: 12/1/2023
IV. The sum owing on the obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust is:  Principal   
$372,778.97, together with interest as pro-
vided in the note or other instrument secured 
from 11/1/2023, and such other costs and 
fees as are due under the note or other in-
strument secured, and as are provided by 
statute.
V. The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the 
obligation secured by the Deed of Trust as 
provided by statute. The sale will be made 
without warranty, express or implied, re-
garding title, possession, or encumbrances 
on 11/1/2024.  The default(s) referred to in 
Paragraph III must be cured by 10/21/2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a dis-
continuance of the sale.  The sale will be dis-
continued and terminated if at any time be-
fore 10/21/2024 (11 days before the sale) the 
default as set forth in Paragraph III is cured 
and the Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. 
Payment must be in cash or with cashiers 
or certified checks from a State or federally 
chartered bank.  The sale may be terminated 
any time after the 10/21/2024 (11 days be-
fore the sale date) and before the sale, by 
the Borrower or Grantor or the holder of any 
recorded junior lien or encumbrance paying 
the entire principal and interest secured by 
the Deed of Trust, plus costs, fees, and ad-
vances, if any, made pursuant to the terms 
of the obligation and/or Deed of Trust, and 
curing all other defaults.
VI. A written Notice of Default was trans-
mitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the 
Borrower and Grantor at the following ad-
dresses:
NAME  ADDRESS
ALISHA BOND AKA ALISHA MARIE BOND 
NKA ALISHA GRAHAM NKA ALISHA MARIE 
GRAHAM
517 HILLCREST DR
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
ALISHA BOND AKA ALISHA MARIE BOND 
NKA ALISHA GRAHAM NKA ALISHA MARIE 
GRAHAM
517 HILLCREST ST
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
ALISHA BOND AKA ALISHA MARIE BOND 
NKA ALISHA GRAHAM NKA ALISHA MARIE 
GRAHAM C/O JENNIFER M. BITNER CAN-
FIELD MADOW LAW GROUP A PROFES-
SIONAL LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY
3102 ROCKEFELLER AVENUE
EVERETT, WA 98201
SPOUSE OF ALISHA BOND AKA ALISHA 
MARIE BOND NKA ALISHA GRAHAM NKA 
ALISHA MARIE GRAHAM
517 HILLCREST DR
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
SPOUSE OF ALISHA BOND AKA ALISHA 
MARIE BOND NKA ALISHA GRAHAM NKA 
ALISHA MARIE GRAHAM
517 HILLCREST ST
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
SPOUSE OF ALISHA BOND AKA ALISHA 
MARIE BOND NKA ALISHA GRAHAM NKA 
ALISHA MARIE GRAHAM C/O JENNIFER 
M. BITNER CANFIELD MADOW LAW 
GROUP A PROFESSIONAL LIMITED LI-
ABILITY COMPANY
3102 ROCKEFELLER AVENUE
EVERETT, WA 98201
SPOUSE OF STEPHEN BOND AKA STE-
PHEN M BOND
1458 PILCHUCK DR
CAMANO ISLAND, WA 98282-8200
SPOUSE OF STEPHEN BOND AKA STE-
PHEN M BOND
517 HILLCREST DR
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
SPOUSE OF STEPHEN BOND AKA STE-
PHEN M BOND
517 HILLCREST ST
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
STEPHEN BOND AKA STEPHEN M BOND
1458 PILCHUCK DR
CAMANO ISLAND, WA 98282-8200
STEPHEN BOND AKA STEPHEN M BOND
517 HILLCREST DR
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
STEPHEN BOND AKA STEPHEN M BOND
517 HILLCREST ST
ARLINGTON, WA 98223
by both first class and certified mail on 
5/13/2024, proof of which is in the possession 
of the Trustee; and the Borrower and Grantor 
were personally served 5/11/2024, with said 
written Notice of Default or the written Notice 
of Default was posted in a conspicuous place 
on the real property described in Paragraph 
I above, and the Trustee has possession of 
proof of such service or posting.
VII. The Trustee whose name and address 
are set forth below will provide in writing to 
anyone requesting it, a statement of all costs 
and fees due at any time prior to the sale.
VIII. The effect of the sale will be to de-
prive the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property.
IX. Anyone having any objections to this sale 
on any grounds whatsoever will be afforded 
an opportunity to be heard as to those ob-
jections if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the 
sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130.  Failure to 
bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s sale.
X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS 
-  The purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale is enti-
tled to possession of the property on the 20th 

day following the sale, as against the Grantor 
under the deed of trust (the owner) and any-
one having an interest junior to the deed of 
trust, including occupants and tenants.  After 
the 20th day following the sale the purchaser 
has the right to evict occupants and tenants 
by summary proceedings under the Unlawful 
Detainer Act, Chapter 59.12 RCW.  For ten-
ant-occupied property, the purchaser shall 
provide a tenant with written notice in accor-
dance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE 
IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You 
have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 
the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trust-
ee Sale to be referred to mediation. If this 
is an amended Notice of Trustee Sale pro-
viding a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE - Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission:  Telephone: 1-877-894HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) Web site: http://www.dfi.
wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/ The 
United States Department of Housing and 
Urban Development: Telephone: 1-800-569-
4287 Web site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudpor-
tal/HUD The statewide civil legal aid hotline 
for assistance and referrals to other housing 
counselors and attorneys Telephone: 1-800-
606-4819 Web site: http://www.ocla.wa.gov/ 
This office is enforcing a security interest of 
your creditor. To the extent that your obliga-
tion has been discharged by a bankruptcy 
court or is subject to an automatic stay of 
bankruptcy, this notice is for informational 
purposes only and does not constitute a de-
mand for payment or any attempt to collect 
such obligation. DATED: 06/28/2024 North 
Star Trustee, LLC, as Trustee Lisa Hackney, 
Vice President of Trustee Operations Ad-
dress for service: North Star Trustee, LLC 
6100 219th ST SW, Suite 480 Mountlake 
Terrace, Washington 98043 Trustee Phone 
No: (206) 866-5345 Trustee Fax No: (206) 
374-2252 Beneficiary / Servicer Phone:  
800-450-2010 STATE OF WASHINGTON  
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH ))) ss.
I certify that I know or have satisfactory 
evidence that Lisa Hackney is the person 
who appeared before me, and said person 
acknowledged that (he/she) signed this in-
strument, on oath stated that (he/she) was 
authorized to execute the instrument and ac-
knowledged it as the Vice President of Trust-
ee Operations of North Star Trustee, LLC to 
be the free and voluntary act of such party 
for the uses and purposes mentioned in the 
instrument. Dated: 06/28/2024  Jasmine 
Turner NOTARY PUBLIC in and for the State 
of Washington, residing at Everett, Washing-
ton My commission expires 3/14/2028 EPP 
40524 Pub Dates 10/02 & 10/23/2024 

TS No WA05000049-23-1 TO No 
230432008-WA-MSI NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE PURSUANT TO THE REVISED 
CODE OF WASHINGTON CHAPTER 61.24 
ET. SEQ. Grantor: VANITA S PETER, AN 
UNMARRIED INDIVIDUAL Current Benefi-
ciary of the Deed of Trust: Matrix Financial 
Services Corporation Original Trustee of 
the Deed of Trust: CHICAGO TITLE COM-
PANY Current Trustee of the Deed of Trust: 
MTC Financial Inc. dba Trustee Corps Cur-
rent Mortgage Servicer of the Deed of Trust: 
RoundPoint Mortgage Servicing LLC Refer-
ence Number of the Deed of Trust: Instru-
ment No. 202112070795 Parcel Number: 
00727100100900 I. NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that on November 1, 2024, 09:00 
AM, North Entrance Plaza, Snohomish 
County Superior Courthouse, 3000 Rock-
efeller Avenue, Everett, WA 98201, MTC 
Financial Inc. dba Trustee Corps, the un-
dersigned Trustee, will sell at public auction 
to the highest and best bidder, payable, in 
the form of cash, or cashier’s check or cer-
tified checks from federally or State char-
tered banks,  at the time of sale the follow-
ing described real property, situated in the 
County of Snohomish, State of Washington, 
to-wit: UNIT 9 OF CARIB HOUSE, A CON-
DOMINIUM, ACCORDING TO DECLARA-
TION THEREOF RECORDED UNDER 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY RECORDING NO. 
8402150179, AND ANY AMENDMENTS 
THERETO; SAID UNIT IS LOCATED ON 
SURVEY MAP AND PLANS FILED IN VOL-
UME 45 OF CONDOMINIUMS, AT PAGES 9 
THROUGH 10, IN SNOHOMISH COUNTY, 
WASHINGTON. SITUATE IN THE COUNTY 
OF SNOHOMISH, STATE OF WASHING-
TON. APN: 00727100100900 More com-
monly known as 2619 RUCKER AVE APT 
9, EVERETT, WA 98201 which is subject to 
that certain Deed of Trust dated December 
3, 2021, executed by VANITA S PETER, AN 
UNMARRIED INDIVIDUAL as Trustor(s), to 
secure obligations in favor of MORTGAGE 
ELECTRONIC REGISTRATION SYSTEMS, 
INC. (“MERS”), as designated nominee for 
FAIRWAY INDEPENDENT MORTGAGE 
CORPORATION, Beneficiary of the security 
instrument, its successors and assigns, re-
corded December 7, 2021 as Instrument No. 
202112070795 and the beneficial interest 
was assigned to Matrix Financial Services 
Corporation and recorded September 27, 
2023 as Instrument Number 202309270337 
of official records in the Office of the Record-
er of Snohomish County, Washington. II. No 
action commenced by Matrix Financial Ser-
vices Corporation, the current Beneficiary of 
the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek 
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satisfaction of the obligation in any Court by 
reason of the Borrowers’ or Grantors’ default 
on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust/Mortgage. III. The default(s) for which 
this foreclosure is made is/are as follows: 
FAILURE TO PAY WHEN DUE THE FOL-
LOWING AMOUNTS WHICH ARE NOW 
IN ARREARS: DELINQUENT PAYMENT 
INFORMATION From May 1, 2023 To June 
14, 2024 Number of Payments 14  Total 
$15,843.34 LATE CHARGE INFORMATION 
May 1, 2023 June 14, 2024 $226.30 $226.30 
PROMISSORY NOTE INFORMATION Note 
Dated: December 3, 2021 Note Amount 
$215,000.00 Interest Paid To: April 1, 2023 
Next Due Date: May 1, 2023 Current Benefi-
ciary: Matrix Financial Services Corporation 
Contact Phone No: 877-426-8805 Address: 
446 Wrenplace Road, Fort Mill, SC 29715 
IV. The sum owing on the obligation secured 
by the Deed of Trust is: The principal sum 
of $209,358.55, together with interest as 
provided in the Note or other instrument se-
cured, and such other costs and fees as are 
due under the Note or other instrument se-
cured, and as are provided by statute. V. The 
above described real property will be sold to 
satisfy the expense of sale and the obligation 
secured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute.  Said sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on November 
1, 2024.  The defaults referred to in Para-
graph III must be cured by October 21, 2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a 
discontinuance of the sale.  The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if at any time 
before October 21, 2024 (11 days before the 
sale) the default as set forth in Paragraph 
III is cured and the Trustees’ fees and costs 
are paid.  Payment must be in cash or with 
cashiers’ or certified checks from a State or 
federally chartered bank.  The sale may be 
terminated any time after the October 21, 
2024 (11 days before the sale date) and 
before the sale, by the Borrower or Grantor 
or the holder of any recorded junior lien or 
encumbrance by paying the entire principal 
and interest secured by the Deed of Trust, 
plus costs, fees and advances, if any, made 
pursuant to the terms of the obligation and/
or Deed of Trust, and curing all other de-
faults. VI. A written Notice of Default was 
transmitted by the current Beneficiary, Matrix 
Financial Services Corporation or Trustee to 
the Borrower and Grantor at the following 
address(es): ADDRESS VANITA S PETER 
2619 RUCKER AVE APT 9, EVERETT, WA 
98201 VANITA S PETER 2619 RUCKER 
AVE UNIT 9, EVERETT, WA 98201 UN-
KNOWN SPOUSE OF VANITA S PETER 
2619 RUCKER AVE APT 9, EVERETT, WA 
98201 by both first class and certified mail 
on October 19, 2023, proof of which is in the 
possession of the Trustee; and the Borrower 
and Grantor were personally served with said 
written Notice of Default or the written Notice 
of Default was posted in a conspicuous place 
October 19, 2023 on the real property de-
scribed in Paragraph I above, and the Trust-
ee has possession of proof of such service 
or posting.  VII. The Trustee whose name 
and address are set forth below will provide 
in writing to anyone requesting it, a state-
ment of all costs and fees due at any time 
prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of the sale 
will be to deprive the Grantor and all those 
who hold by, through or under the Grantor 
of all their interest in the above described 
property. IX. Anyone having any objections 
to this sale on any grounds whatsoever will 
be afforded an opportunity to be heard as to 
those objections if they bring a lawsuit to re-
strain the sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130. 
Failure to bring such a lawsuit may result in a 
waiver of any proper grounds for invalidating 
the Trustees’ Sale. X. Notice to Occupants 
or Tenants.  The purchaser at the Trustee’s 
sale is entitled to possession of the property 
on the 20th day following the sale, as against 
the Grantor under the deed of trust (the own-
er) and anyone having an interest junior to 
the deed of trust, including occupants who 
are not tenants. After the 20th day following 
the sale the purchaser has the right to evict 
occupants who are not tenants by summary 
proceedings under chapter 59.12 RCW. For 
tenant-occupied property, the purchaser 
shall provide a tenant with written notice in 
accordance with RCW 61.24.060. Notice 
to Borrower(s) who received a letter under 
RCW 61.24.031: THIS NOTICE IS THE FI-
NAL STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE 
SALE OF YOUR HOME. Mediation MUST 
be requested between the time you receive 
the Notice of Default and no later than 90 cal-
endar days BEFORE the date of sale listed 
in the Notice of Trustee Sale.  If an amended 
Notice of Trustee Sale is recorded provid-
ing a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in the 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUN-
SELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situa-
tion and refer you to mediation if you might 
eligible and it may help you save your home.  
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you.  If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Telephone: (877) 894-4663 
or (800) 606-4819 Website: www.wshfc.org 
The United States Department of Housing 
and Urban Development: Telephone: (800) 
569-4287 Website: www.hud.gov The state-
wide civil legal aid hotline for assistance 
and referrals to other housing counselors 
and attorneys: Telephone: (800) 606-4819 
Website: www.homeownership.wa.gov 
Dated: June  18 , 2024 MTC Financial Inc. 
dba Trustee Corps, as Duly Appointed Suc-
cessor Trustee By: Alan Burton, Vice Presi-

dent MTC Financial Inc. dba Trustee Corps 
606 W. Gowe Street Kent, WA  98032 Toll 
Free Number: (844) 367-8456 TDD: 711 
949.252.8300 For Reinstatement/Pay Off 
Quotes, contact MTC Financial Inc. DBA 
Trustee Corps Order Number 103336, Pub 
Dates: 10/02/2024, 10/23/2024, SNOHOM-
ISH COUNTY TRIBUNE

TS No WA08000010-23-1 TO No 
230013390-WA-MSI NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE PURSUANT TO THE REVISED 
CODE OF WASHINGTON CHAPTER 61.24 
ET. SEQ. Grantor: S. STEPHANIE NOR-
TON-MAGEE AS HER SOLE AND SEPA-
RATE PROPERTY, DAMON T PROPST, 
CARI R. PROPST HUSBAND & WIFE Cur-
rent Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust: Federal 
Home Loan Mortgage Corporation as Trust-
ee for the benefit of the Freddie Mac Sea-
soned Loans Structured Transaction Trust, 
Series 2020-2 Original Trustee of the Deed 
of Trust: TICOR TITLE Current Trustee of the 
Deed of Trust: MTC Financial Inc. dba Trust-
ee Corps Current Mortgage Servicer of the 
Deed of Trust: Select Portfolio Servicing, Inc. 
Reference Number of the Deed of Trust: In-
strument No. 201003240317 Parcel Num-
ber: 27051000101700 I. NOTICE IS HERE-
BY GIVEN that on November 1, 2024, 10:00 
AM, outside The North Plaza Entrance to the 
Snohomish County Courthouse, 3000 Rock-
efeller Ave, Everett, WA, MTC Financial Inc. 
dba Trustee Corps, the undersigned Trustee, 
will sell at public auction to the highest and 
best bidder, payable, in the form of cash, or 
cashier’s check or certified checks from fed-
erally or State chartered banks,  at the time 
of sale the following described real property, 
situated in the County of Snohomish, State 
of Washington, to-wit: PARCEL A: THE 
EASTERLY 707.0 FEET OF THE SOUTH-
ERLY 322.5 FEET OF THE NORTHERLY 
675 FEET OF THE NORTHWEST QUAR-
TER OF THE NORTHEAST QUARTER OF 
SECTION 10, TOWNSHIP 27 NORTH, 
RANGE 5 EAST, W.M., RECORDS OF 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. 
PARCEL B: AN EASEMENT FOR INGRESS, 
EGRESS AND UTILITIES OVER AND 
ACROSS THE SAID NORTHWEST QUAR-
TER OF THE NORTHEAST QUARTER OF 
SAID SECTION 10 AS RECORDED UNDER 
RECORDING NO. 2336210. SITUATE IN 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, STATE OF 
WASHINGTON. APN: 27051000101700 
More commonly known as 16533 61ST AVE 
SE, SNOHOMISH, WA 98296 which is sub-
ject to that certain Deed of Trust dated March 
11, 2010, executed by S. STEPHANIE NOR-
TON-MAGEE AS HER SOLE AND SEPA-
RATE PROPERTY, DAMON T PROPST, 
CARI R. PROPST HUSBAND & WIFE as 
Trustor(s), to secure obligations in favor of 
MORTGAGE ELECTRONIC REGISTRA-
TION SYSTEMS, INC., as designated nomi-
nee for METLIFE HOME LOANS, A DIVI-
SION OF METLIFE BANK, N.A., Beneficiary 
of the security instrument, its successors and 
assigns, recorded March 24, 2010 as Instru-
ment No. 201003240317 and the beneficial 
interest was assigned to Federal Home Loan 
Mortgage Corporation as Trustee for the 
benefit of the Freddie Mac Seasoned Loans 
Structured Transaction Trust, Series 2020-2 
and recorded April 7, 2023 as Instrument 
Number 202304070129 of official records in 
the Office of the Recorder of Snohomish 
County, Washington. II. No action com-
menced by Federal Home Loan Mortgage 
Corporation as Trustee for the benefit of the 
Freddie Mac Seasoned Loans Structured 
Transaction Trust, Series 2020-2, the current 
Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust is now pend-
ing to seek satisfaction of the obligation in 
any Court by reason of the Borrowers’ or 
Grantors’ default on the obligation secured 
by the Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. The 
default(s) for which this foreclosure is made 
is/are as follows: FAILURE TO PAY WHEN 
DUE THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS WHICH 
ARE NOW IN ARREARS: DELINQUENT 
PAYMENT INFORMATION From February 
1, 2021 To June 25, 2024 Number of Pay-
ments 11 $2,723.47 12 $2,818.53 6 
$3,154.22 12 $3,375.82 Total $123,215.69 
LATE CHARGE INFORMATION February 1, 
2021 June 25, 2024 $0.00 PROMISSORY 
NOTE INFORMATION Note Dated: March 
11, 2010 Note Amount $230,000.00 Interest 
Paid To: January 1, 2021 Next Due Date: 
February 1, 2021 Current Beneficiary: Fed-
eral Home Loan Mortgage Corporation as 
Trustee for the benefit of the Freddie Mac 
Seasoned Loans Structured Transaction 
Trust, Series 2020-2 Contact Phone No: 
(888) 349-8955 Address: 3217 S. Decker 
Lake Dr., Salt Lake City, UT 84119 IV. The 
sum owing on the obligation secured by the 
Deed of Trust is: The principal sum of 
$216,018.98, together with interest as pro-
vided in the Note or other instrument se-
cured, and such other costs and fees as are 
due under the Note or other instrument se-
cured, and as are provided by statute. V. The 
above described real property will be sold to 
satisfy the expense of sale and the obligation 
secured by the Deed of Trust as provided by 
statute.  Said sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on November 
1, 2024.  The defaults referred to in Para-
graph III must be cured by October 21, 2024, 
(11 days before the sale date) to cause a 
discontinuance of the sale.  The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if at any time 
before October 21, 2024 (11 days before the 
sale) the default as set forth in Paragraph III 
is cured and the Trustees’ fees and costs are 
paid.  Payment must be in cash or with ca-
shiers’ or certified checks from a State or 
federally chartered bank.  The sale may be 
terminated any time after the October 21, 
2024 (11 days before the sale date) and be-
fore the sale, by the Borrower or Grantor or 
the holder of any recorded junior lien or en-
cumbrance by paying the entire principal and 
interest secured by the Deed of Trust, plus 
costs, fees and advances, if any, made pur-

suant to the terms of the obligation and/or 
Deed of Trust, and curing all other defaults. 
VI. A written Notice of Default was transmit-
ted by the current Beneficiary, Federal Home 
Loan Mortgage Corporation as Trustee for 
the benefit of the Freddie Mac Seasoned 
Loans Structured Transaction Trust, Series 
2020-2 or Trustee to the Borrower and 
Grantor at the following address(es): AD-
DRESS S STEPHANIE NORTON-MAGEE 
16533 61ST AVE SE, SNOHOMISH, WA 
98296 S STEPHANIE NORTON-MAGEE 
10829 42ND DRIVE S.E., EVERETT, WA 
98208 CARI PROPST 16533 61ST AVE SE, 
SNOHOMISH, WA 98296 CARI PROPST 
10829 42ND DRIVE S.E.,EVERETT, WA 
98208 CARI PROPST 16426 67th AVE. W., 
Lynnwood, WA 98037 DAMON T PROPST 
16533 61ST AVE SE, SNOHOMISH, WA 
98296 DAMON T PROPST 10829 42ND 
DRIVE S.E., EVERETT, WA 98208 DAMON 
T PROPST 16426 67th Ave. W., Lynnwood, 
WA 98037 UNKNOWN SPOUSE OF S 
STEPHANIE NORTON-MAGEE 16533 
61ST AVE SE, SNOHOMISH, WA 98296 
UNKNOWN SPOUSE OF S STEPHANIE 
NORTON-MAGEE 10829 42ND DRIVE 
S.E., EVERETT, WA 98208 by both first 
class and certified mail on August 9, 2023, 
proof of which is in the possession of the 
Trustee; and the Borrower and Grantor were 
personally served with said written Notice of 
Default or the written Notice of Default was 
posted in a conspicuous place August 9, 
2023 on the real property described in Para-
graph I above, and the Trustee has posses-
sion of proof of such service or posting. VII. 
The Trustee whose name and address are 
set forth below will provide in writing to any-
one requesting it, a statement of all costs 
and fees due at any time prior to the sale. 
VIII. The effect of the sale will be to deprive 
the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property. IX. Any-
one having any objections to this sale on any 
grounds whatsoever will be afforded an op-
portunity to be heard as to those objections if 
they bring a lawsuit to restrain the sale pur-
suant to RCW 61.24.130. Failure to bring 
such a lawsuit may result in a waiver of any 
proper grounds for invalidating the Trustees’ 
Sale. X. Notice to Occupants or Tenants.  
The purchaser at the Trustee’s sale is enti-
tled to possession of the property on the 20th 
day following the sale, as against the Grantor 
under the deed of trust (the owner) and any-
one having an interest junior to the deed of 
trust, including occupants who are not ten-
ants. After the 20th day following the sale the 
purchaser has the right to evict occupants 
who are not tenants by summary proceed-
ings under chapter 59.12 RCW. For tenant-
occupied property, the purchaser shall pro-
vide a tenant with written notice in 
accordance with RCW 61.24.060. Notice to 
Borrower(s) who received a letter under 
RCW 61.24.031: THIS NOTICE IS THE FI-
NAL STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE 
SALE OF YOUR HOME. Mediation MUST 
be requested between the time you receive 
the Notice of Default and no later than 90 cal-
endar days BEFORE the date of sale listed 
in the Notice of Trustee Sale.  If an amended 
Notice of Trustee Sale is recorded providing 
a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation must 
be requested no later than 25 calendar days 
BEFORE the date of sale listed in the 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUNSEL-
OR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN 
WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situa-
tion and refer you to mediation if you might 
eligible and it may help you save your home.  
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you.  If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Telephone: (877) 894-4663 or 
(800) 606-4819 Website: www.wshfc.org 
The United States Department of Housing 
and Urban Development: Telephone: (800) 
569-4287 Website: www.hud.gov The state-
wide civil legal aid hotline for assistance and 
referrals to other housing counselors and at-
torneys: Telephone: (800) 606-4819 Web-
site: www.homeownership.wa.gov Dated: 
June  25 , 2024 MTC Financial Inc. dba 
Trustee Corps, as Duly Appointed Successor 
Trustee By: Alan Burton, Vice President MTC 
Financial Inc. dba Trustee Corps 606 W. 
Gowe Street Kent, WA  98032 Toll Free 
Number: (844) 367-8456 TDD: 711 
949.252.8300 For Reinstatement/Pay Off 
Quotes, contact MTC Financial Inc. DBA 
Trustee Corps Order Number 103405, Pub 
Dates: 10/02/2024, 10/23/2024, SNOHOM-
ISH COUNTY TRIBUNE

WE ARE A DEBT COLLECTOR.  THIS 
COMMUNICATION IS AN ATTEMPT TO 
COLLECT A DEBT AND ANY INFORMA-
TION OBTAINED WILL BE USED FOR 
THAT PURPOSE
If you filed bankruptcy or have been dis-
charged in bankruptcy, this communication 
is for informational purposes only and is not 
intended as an attempt to collect this debt 
from you personally.
THIS NOTICE IS THE FINAL STEP BE-
FORE THE FORECLOSURE SALE OF 
YOUR HOME.
You have only 20 DAYS from the recording 
date on this notice to pursue mediation.
DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING 
COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LI-
CENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if 
you are eligible and it may help you save 
your home. See below for safe sources of 
help.
SEEKING ASSISTANCE
Housing counselors and legal assistance 
may be available at little or no cost to you. 

If you would like assistance in determining 
your rights and opportunities to keep your 
house, you may contact the following: The 
statewide foreclosure hotline for assistance 
and referral to housing counselors recom-
mended by the Housing Finance Commis-
sion Telephone: 1-877-894-HOME (1-877-
894-4663) Web site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/
consumers/homeownership/post_purchase_
counselors_foreclosure.htm 
The United States Department of Housing 
and Urban Development Telephone: 1-800-
569-4287 Web site: http://www.hud.gov/of-
fices/hsg/sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListActi
on=search&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc
The statewide civil legal aid hotline for as-
sistance and referrals to other housing 
counselors and attorneys Telephone: 1-800-
606-4819 Web site: http://nwjustice.org/
what-clear
NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE
TO: Occupants of the Premises All Other In-
terested Parties
Grantor: MICHAEL J. ANDERSON Cur-
rent beneficiary of the deed of trust: STE-
PHEN BENNETT Current trustee of the 
deed of trust: GALLOWAY LAW GROUP 
PLLC Current mortgage servicer of the 
deed of trust: N/A Reference number of the 
deed of trust: 201905010230 Parcel num-
ber: 31063000203400, 31063000201300, 
31063000201700
I.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the under-
signed Trustee, GALLOWAY LAW GROUP 
PLLC will on NOVEMBER 1, 2024 at the 
hour of 10:00 a.m., outside the Snohomish 
County Superior Court, 3000 Rockefeller 
Avenue, City of Everett, State of Washing-
ton, sell at public auction to the highest and 
best bidder, payable at the time of sale, the 
following described real property, situated in 
the County of Snohomish, State of Washing-
ton, to wit:
See Exhibit A attached hereto and incorpo-
rated herein by this reference
See Exhibit B attached hereto and incorpo-
rated herein by this reference
(commonly known as 16613 MCELROY RD, 
ARLINGTON, WA 98223-7491 and 16521 
MCELROY RD, ARLINGTON, WA 98223-
8945, which is subject to that certain Deed 
of Trust dated April 27, 2019 under Auditor’s 
File No. 201905010230, records of Snohom-
ish County, Washington, from MICHAEL J. 
ANDERSON as Grantor to secure an obli-
gation in favor of STEPHEN BENNETT as 
Beneficiary.
II.
No action commenced by the Beneficiary of 
the Deed of Trust is now pending to seek sat-
isfaction of the obligation in any Court by rea-
son of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default on 
the obligation secured by the Deed of Trust.
III.
The Default for which this foreclosure is 
made is as follows: Failure to pay when due 
the following amounts, which are now in ar-
rears:
See Exhibit C attached hereto and incorpo-
rated herein by this reference
*plus all attorney’s fees and costs and fore-
closure fees and costs incurred
Default other than failure to make monthly 
payments:
a. Failure to Preserve Collateral:
31063000201300 - This collateral property 
became tax foreclosed by your failure to pay 
real property taxes when it went to auction 
12/20/2023.
b. Failure to pay Taxes on Collateral Property 
Collateral Property securing this Promise to 
Pay is tax delinquent. You must immediately 
pay and bring current the real property taxes 
on all remaining collateral property as shown 
below.
31063000203400
Installments Payable
Tax Year Installment   Due Date   Principal  
Interest, Penalties and Costs Total Due Cu-
mulative Due
2021   Delinquent 04/30/2021 $1,772.36  
$797.57                         $2,569.93  $2,569.93
2022   Delinquent 04/30/2022 $2,117.64  
$465.88                         $2,583.52  $5,153.45
2023   Delinquent 04/30/2023 $2,098.56  
$440.70                         $2,539.26  $7,692.71
2024   1                  04/30/2024 $1,105.95  $0.0
0                                         $1,105.95  $8,798.66
31063000201700
Installments Payable
Tax Year Installment Due Date  Principal  In-
terest, Penalties and Costs  Total Due Cu-
mulative Due
2021 Delinquent 04/30/2021 $367.22     
$165.25                    $532.47  $532.47
2022  Delinquent 04/30/2022  $432.71     
$95.19                    $527.90  $1,060.37
2023  Delinquent 04/30/2023  $478.61     
$100.52                    $579.13  $1,639.50
2024  1                  04/30/2024  $232.51     $0
.00                                    $232.51  $1,872.01
OTHER CHARGES, COSTS AND FEES:
In addition to the amounts in arrears as spec-
ified above, you are obliged to pay the follow-
ing charges, costs and fees to reinstate the 
deed of trust if reinstatement is made before 
recording of the Notice of Trustee’s Sale. 
a. Recording fees $327.24
b. Posting of Notices (Estimated) $80.00
c. Photocopying Expenses (Estimated) 
$10.00
d. Postage Expenses (Estimated) $45.00
e. Attorney Fees: $4,123.50
TOTAL CHARGES, COSTS AND FEES: 
$4,585.74
IV.
The sum owing on the obligation secured 
by the Deed of Trust is: Principal Balance 
$45,000 together with interest as provided 
in the note or other instrument secured from 
December 1, 2019, and such other costs 
and fees as are due under the note or other 
instrument secured, and as are provided by 
statute.
V.
The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the 
obligation secured by said Deed of Trust as 

provided by statute. The sale will be made 
without warranty, express or implied, regard-
ing title, possession, or encumbrances on 
the 1st day of November, 2024. The defaults 
referred to in paragraph III must be cured by 
the 21st day of October, 2024 (11 days be-
fore the sale date) to cause a discontinuance 
of the sale. The sale will be discontinued and 
terminated if at any time before the 1st day of 
November 2024 if the default(s) as set forth 
in paragraph III are cured and the Trustee’s 
fees and costs are paid. The sale may be ter-
minated any time before the 1st day of No-
vember 2024 by the Borrower or Grantor or 
the holder of any recorded junior lien or en-
cumbrance paying the principal and interest 
plus costs, fees, and advances, if any, made 
pursuant to the terms of the obligation and/
or deed of trust, and curing all other defaults.
VI.
A written Notice of Default was transmitted 
by the Beneficiary or Trustee to the Borrower 
or Grantor at the following addresses: 
Michael J. Anderson 16613 MCELROY RD, 
Arlington, WA 98223-7491 by both first class 
and certified mail on March 7, 2024, proof 
of which is in the possession of the Trustee; 
and the Borrower and Grantor were person-
ally served on March 10, 2024 with said writ-
ten Notice of Default and/or the Notice of 
Default was posted in a conspicuous place 
on the real property described in paragraph I 
above, and the Trustee has in his possession 
proof of such service or posting.
VII.
The Trustee whose name and address is set 
forth below will provide in writing, to any per-
son requesting it, a statement of all costs and 
fees due at any time prior to the sale.
VIII.
The effect of the sale will be to deprive the 
Grantor and all those who hold by, through 
or under the Grantor of all their interest in the 
above-described property.
IX.
Anyone having any objections to this sale on 
any grounds whatsoever will be afforded an 
opportunity to be heard as to those objec-
tions, if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the 
sale, pursuant to R.C.W. 61.24.130. Failure 
to bring such a lawsuit may result in a waiver 
of any proper grounds for invalidating the 
Trustee’s Sale.
X.
NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS
The purchaser at the trustee’s sale is entitled 
to possession of the property on the 20th day 
following the sale, as against the grantor un-
der the deed of trust (the owner) and anyone 
having an interest junior to the deed of trust, 
including occupants who are not tenants. 
After the 20th day following the sale the pur-
chaser has the right to evict occupants who 
are not tenants by summary proceedings un-
der the unlawful detainer act, chapter 59.12 
RCW.  For tenant-occupied property, the 
purchaser shall provide a tenant with written 
notice in accordance with RCW 61.24.060. 
DATED: May 22, 2024 TRUSTEE Successor 
Trustee By: Peter C. Rudolf, Authorized Sig-
nator Galloway Law Group PLLC 12101 N. 
Lakeshore Dr. (Physical) P.O. Box 425 (Mail) 
Lake Stevens, WA 98258 (425) 334-4400 
(425) 334-2149 (Fax) sarah@glgpllc.com; 
secretary@glgpllc.com 
NOTICE TO GUARANTORS, BORROW-
ERS, AND/OR GRANTORS OF THE COM-
MERCIAL OBLIGATION SECURED BY THE 
DEED OF TRUST:
1. IF YOU ARE A GUARANTOR, YOU MAY 
BE LIABLE FOR A DEFICIENCY JUDG-
MENT TO THE EXTENT THE SALE PRICE 
OBTAINED AT TRUSTEE’S SALE IS LESS 
THAN THE DEBT SECURED BY THE 
DEED OF TRUST.
YOU HAVE THE SAME RIGHT TO REIN-
STATE THE DEBT, CURE THE DEFAULT, 
OR REPAY THE DEBT AS IS GIVEN TO 
THE GRANTOR IN ORDER TO AVOID THE 
TRUSTEE’S SALE.
YOU WILL HAVE NO RIGHT TO REDEEM 
THE PROPERTY AFTER THE TRUSTEE’S 
SALE.
SUBJECT TO SUCH LONGER PERIODS 
AS ARE PROVIDED IN THE WASHINGTON 
DEED OF TRUST ACT, CHAPTER 61.24 
RCW, ANY ACTION BROUGHT TO SEEK A 
DEFICIENCY JUDGMENT MUST BE COM-
MENCED WITHIN ONE YEAR AFTER THE 
TRUSTEE’S SALE, OR THE LAST TRUST-
EE’S SALE UNDER ANY DEED OF TRUST 
GRANTED TO SECURE THE SAME DEBT.
IN ANY ACTION FOR A DEFICIENCY, YOU 
WILL HAVE THE RIGHT TO ESTABLISH 
THE FAIR VALUE OF THE PROPERTY AS 
OF THE DATE OF THE TRUSTEE’S SALE 
LESS PRIOR LIENS AND ENCUMBRANC-
ES, AND TO LIMIT YOUR LIABILITY FOR 
A DEFICIENCY TO THE DIFFERENCE BE-
TWEEN THE DEBT AND THE GREATER 
OF SUCH FAIR VALUE OR THE SALE 
PRICE PAID AT TRUSTEE’S SALE, PLUS 
INTEREST AND COSTS.  
2. If you are a borrower or a grantor, then 
to the extent that the fair value of the prop-
erty sold at trustee’s sale to the beneficiary 
is less than the unpaid obligation secured 
by the deed of trust immediately prior to the 
trustee’s sale, an action for a deficiency judg-
ment may be brought against you for: -any 
decrease in the fair value of the property 
caused by waste to the property committed 
by the borrower or grantor after the deed 
of trust was granted; and -any decrease in 
the fair value of the property caused by the 
wrongful retention of any rents, insurance 
proceeds, or condemnation awards by the 
borrower or grantor that are otherwise owed 
to the beneficiary. The deficiency judgment 
may also include interest, costs and at-
torneys’ fees. Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 2 & 23, 2024
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