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LEGAL NOTICES
File No: 24-00880WA NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE’S SALE Pursuant to RCW 61.24 et seq. 
Grantor(s) of Deed of Trust James R. Shaw 
and Darcine R. Shaw Current Beneficiary Na-
tionstar Mortgage, LLC Current Trustee Affinia 
Default Services, LLC Current Mortgage Ser-
vicer Nationstar Mortgage LLC Deed of Trust 
Recording Number (Ref. #) 200706200032 
Parcel Number(s) 29062300400400 I. NO-
TICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the under-
signed Trustee will on December 27, 2024, 
at 9:00 AM sell at public auction located On 
the Steps in Front of the North Entrance, Sno-
homish County Superior Courthouse, 3000 
Rockefeller Avenue, Everett, WA 98201, to 
the highest and best bidder, payable at the 
time of sale, the following-described real 
property, situated in the County of Snohom-
ish, State of Washington, to wit: THE SOUTH 
HALF OF THE SOUTH HALF OF THE SOUTH 
HALF OF THE NORTHEAST QUARTER OF 
THE SOUTHEAST QUARTER OF SECTION 
32, TOWNSHIP 29 NORTH, RANGE 6 EAST 
W.M. RECORDS OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY, 
WA EXCEPT THAT PORTION THEREOF 
CONVEYED TO SNOHOMISH COUNTY 
BY INSTRUMENTS RECORDED UNDER 
RECORDING NO. 954245 AND 2389822. 
Commonly known as: 1526 Connors Road, 
Snohomish, WA 98290 The above property 
is subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
June 8, 2007, recorded June 20, 2007, under 
Auditor’s File No. 200706200032, records of 
Snohomish County, Washington, from James 
R. Shaw and Darcine R. Shaw, as Grantor, to 
First American Title Insurance Company as 
Trustee, to secure an obligation in favor of 
Mortgage Electronic Registration Systems, 
Inc., as designated nominee for Metrocities 
Mortgage, LLC, beneficiary of the security in-
strument, its successors and assigns, as Ben-
eficiary, the beneficial interest in which was 
assigned to Nationstar Mortgage, LLC, under 
an Assignment recorded under Auditor’s File 
No. 21907160278. II. No action commenced 
by the Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust is now 
pending to seek satisfaction of the obligation 
in any Court by reason of the Borrower’s or 
Grantor’s default on the obligation secured by 
the Deed of Trust. III. The defaults for which 
this foreclosure is made are as follows: 1. 
Failure to pay when due the following amounts 
which are now in arrears: o $19,062.52 which 
included the monthly payments, late charges, 
and accrued fees and costs. IV. The sum ow-
ing on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust is: Principal $155,468.08, together with 
interest as provided in the Note or other instru-
ment secured from September 1, 2023, and 
such other costs and fees as are due under 
the Note or other instrument secured, and 
as are provided by statute. V. The above-de-
scribed real property will be sold to satisfy the 
expense of sale and the obligation secured 
by the Deed of Trust as provided by statute. 
The sale will be made without warranty, ex-
press or implied, regarding title, possession, 
or encumbrances on December 27, 2024. The 
default(s) referred to in paragraph III must be 
cured by December 16, 2024 (11 days before 
the sale date), to cause a discontinuance of 
the sale. The sale will be discontinued and 
terminated if at any time on or before Decem-
ber 16, 2024 (11 days before the sale date), 
the default(s) as set forth in paragraph III are 
cured and the Trustee’s fees and costs are 
paid. The sale may be terminated any time 
after December 16, 2024 (11 days before the 
sale date), and before the sale by the Bor-
rower, Grantor, any Guarantor, or the holder 
of any recorded junior lien or encumbrance 
paying the entire principal and interest se-
cured by the Deed of Trust, plus costs, fees, 
and advances, if any, made pursuant to the 
terms of the obligation and/or Deed of Trust, 
and curing all other defaults. VI. A written no-
tice of default was transmitted by the Trustee 
to the Borrower and Grantor at the following 
addresses: Darcine R. Shaw 1526 Connors 
Road Snohomish, WA 98290 James R. Shaw 
1526 Connors Rd Snohomish, WA 98290 by 
both first class and certified mail on April 08, 
2024; and the notice of default was person-
ally served upon the Borrower and Grantor, 
or was posted in a conspicuous place on the 
real property described in paragraph I above 
on April 02, 2024. The Trustee has possession 
of proof of mailing, and service or posting. VII. 
The Trustee whose name and address are set 
forth below will provide in writing to anyone 
requesting it, a statement of all costs and fees 
due at any time prior to the sale. VIII. The ef-
fect of the sale will be to deprive the Grantor 
and all those who hold by, through or under 
the Grantor of all their interest in the above-
described property. IX. Anyone having an 
objection to the sale on any grounds whatso-
ever are afforded an opportunity to be heard 
as to those objections if they bring a lawsuit 
to restrain the sale pursuant to the RCW 
61.24.130. Failure to bring such a lawsuit may 
result in a waiver of any proper grounds for 
invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. NOTICE TO 
OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS: The purchaser 
at the trustee’s sale is entitled to possession 
of the property on the 20th day following the 
sale, as against the Grantor under the Deed 
of Trust (the owner) and anyone having an 
interest junior to the deed of trust, including 
occupants who are not tenants. After the 20th 
day following the sale, the purchaser has the 
right to evict occupants who are not tenants 
by summary proceedings chapter 59.12 RCW. 
For tenant-occupied property, the purchaser 
shall provide a tenant with written notice in ac-
cordance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE 
IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE FORE-
CLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. You have 
only until 90 calendar days BEFORE the date 
of sale listed in this Notice of Trustee Sale to 
be referred to mediation. If this is an amended 
Notice of Trustee Sale providing a 45-day no-
tice of the sale, mediation must be requested 
no later than 25 calendar days BEFORE the 
date of sale listed in this amended Notice of 

Trustee Sale. DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A 
HOUSING COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY 
LICENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if 
you are eligible and it may help you save your 
home. See below for safe sources of help. 
SEEKING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors 
and legal assistance may be available at little 
or no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counsel-
ors recommended by the Housing Finance 
Commission: Telephone: 1-877-894-HOME 
(1-877-894-4663) Website: http://www.dfi.
wa.gov/consumers/homeownership/post_pur-
chase_counselors_foreclosure.htm The Unit-
ed States Department of Housing and Urban 
Development: Telephone: 1-800-569-4287 
Website: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/sfh/
hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search&sear
chstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The statewide civil 
legal aid hotline for assistance and referrals 
to other housing counselors and attorneys: 
Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 Website: http://
nwjustice.org/what-clear \emspace  PUR-
SUANT TO THE FAIR DEBT COLLECTION 
PRACTICES ACT, YOU ARE ADVISED THAT 
AFFINIA DEFAULT SERVICES, LLC MAY BE 
DEEMED TO BE A DEBT COLLECTOR AND 
ANY INFORMATION OBTAINED MAY BE 
USED FOR THAT PURPOSE. DATED Au-
gust 15, 2024. By: Reina Rivas Name: Reina 
Rivas Title: Foreclosure Specialist of Affinia 
Default Services, LLC 16000 Christensen Rd., 
Suite 310 Tukwila, WA 98188 (425) 800-4703 
STATE OF California) COUNTY OF Los Ange-
les) NPP0463995 To: SNOHOMISH COUNTY 
TRIBUNE 11/27/2024, 12/18/2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter of the Es-
tate of: DOUGLAS W. BELLEW, Deceased. 
Case No.: 24-4-40016-31 PROBATE NOTICE 
TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 PLEASE 
TAKE NOTICE The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing 
to the personal representative or the per-
sonal representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced. The 
claim must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty days after the personal representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) 
four months after the date of first publication of 
the notice. If the claim is not presented within 
this time frame, the claim is forever barred, ex-
cept as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. Date of First Publica-
tion: November 27, 2024 Personal Represen-
tative: Edward Bellew Attorney for the Person-
al Representative: Kelby J. Derenick Address 
for Mailing or Service:  9414 State Ave., Suite 
E, Marysville, WA 99362 Court of proceedings 
and case number:  Snohomish County Supe-
rior Court, 24-4-40016-31 Dated this 18th day 
of November, 2024. Kelby J. Derenick, WSBA 
#42860 Attorney for Personal Representative 
Published in the  Snohomish County Tribune 
November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON, KING COUNTY Estate 
of ANETHA JOY DARLING, Deceased. NO. 
24-4-07791-7 SEA NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REPRE-
SENTATIVE named below has been appoint-
ed as Personal Representative of this estate. 
Any persons having a claim against the de-
cedent must, before the time the claim would 
be barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim, 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
Court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim will be forever barred, ex-
cept as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. DATE OF FIRST 
PUBLICATION: November 27, 2024 PER-
SONAL REPRESENTATIVE: Armandina R. 
Darling ADDRESS FOR MAILING OR SER-
VICE Heather S. de Vrieze, WSBA#28553 
de VRIEZE | CARNEY, PLLC 3909 California 
Avenue SW Seattle, WA  98116-3705 COURT 
OF PROBATE PROCEEDINGS: King County 
Superior Court CAUSE NUMBER: 24-4-
07791-7 SEA Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 27, December 4 & 
11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON, KING COUNTY Estate 
of LYNNE A. MAGIE   Deceased. Case No. 
24-4-07575-2 SEA NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REPRE-
SENTATIVE named below has been appoint-
ed as Personal Representative of this estate. 
Any persons having a claim against the de-
cedent must, before the time the claim would 
be barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-

ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim, 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
Court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim will be forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: November 13, 2024 PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE: Ewan D. Magie AD-
DRESS FOR MAILING OR SERVICE Kailei B. 
Feeney, WSBA#43378 de VRIEZE | CARNEY, 
PLLC 3909 California Avenue SW #101 Se-
attle, WA 98116-3705 COURT OF PROBATE 
PROCEEDINGS: King County Superior Court 
CAUSE NUMBER: 24-4-07575-2 SEA Pub-
lished in the Snohomish County Tribune No-
vember 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON FOR KING COUNTY IN 
THE ESTATE OF LEROY D. HUNTER, De-
ceased. NO. 24-4-07277-0 SEA PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) 
The personal representative named below 
has been appointed as personal representa-
tive of this estate. Any person having a claim 
against the decedent must, before the time the 
claim would be barred by any otherwise appli-
cable statute of limitations, present the claim 
in the manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 
by serving on or mailing to the personal rep-
resentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of (1) thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of first publication: 
November 20, 2024 Date November 15, 2024 
Stacey L. Nickell, Personal Representative 
Presented by: WALL GROUP LAW: By: Chan-
dra M. Lewnau WSBA No. 43570 Attorneys 
for the Personal Representative Address for 
Mailing or Service: Estate of Leroy D. Hunter 
c/o Chandra M. Lewnau Wall Group Law 51 
West Dayton St., Suite 305 Edmonds, WA 
98020. Tel. 425-670-1560. Court of probate 
proceedings and Cause No.: King County Su-
perior Court 24-4-07277-0 SEA Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 20, 
27 & December 4, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR SNOHOM-
ISH COUNTY In the Matter of the Estate of: 
TERRANCE RAY SHERWOOD Deceased. 
No. 24-4-01846-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.020) The personal representative 
named below has been appointed and has 
qualified as personal representative of this 
estate. Any person having a claim against the 
deceased that arose before the decedent’s 
death must, before the time the claim would 
be barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below, a copy of the claim 
and filing the original claim with the Court. The 
claim must be presented within the later of (1) 
thirty (30) days after the personal representa-
tive served or mailed the notice to the creditor 
as provided under RCW 11.40.020(3) or (2) by 
four (4) months after the date of first publica-
tion of the notice. If the claim is not presented 
within this time frame, the claim will be forever 
barred, except as provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. Personal Represen-
tative: Joni J. Sherwood Attorneys for Per-
sonal Representative: Ashley J. Sherwood, 
WSBA 46885 Seyfarth Shaw LLP 999 Third 
Ave, Suite 4700 Seattle, WA 98104-4041 
Phone: (206) 946-4910 Email: asherwood@
seyfarth.com Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR SNOHOM-
ISH COUNTY LAKEVIEW LOAN SERVIC-
ING, LLC, Plaintiff, vs. KRISTIN KUNKLE and 
CHRISTOPHER BLANKENSHIP, a married 
couple; WASHINGTON STATE HOUSING 
FINANCE COMMISSION; SECRETARY OF 
HOUSING AND URBAN DEVELOPMENT; 
INTELLISENSSE CORP DBA COLUMBIA 
FINANCIAL ORGANIZATION; STATE OF 
WASHINGTON, DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 
AND INDUSTRIES; AND OCCUPANTS OF 
THE PREMISES, Defendants. CASE NO.: 24-
2-05837-31 SUMMONS FOR PUBLICATION 
(60 DAYS) TO THE DEFENDANTS KRISTIN 
KUNKLE and CHRISTOPHER BLANKEN-
SHIP, a married couple, and OCCUPANTS OF 
THE PREMISES: You are hereby summoned 
to appear within sixty days after the date of the 
first publication of this summons, to wit, within 
sixty days after the 20th day of November, 
2024, and defend the above entitled action 
in the above entitled court, and answer the 
complaint of the plaintiff  LAKEVIEW LOAN 
SERVICING, LLC and serve a copy of your 
answer upon the undersigned attorneys for 
plaintiff, ZBS Law, LLP, at their office below 

stated; and in case of your failure so to do, 
judgment will be rendered against you accord-
ing to the demand of the complaint, which has 
been filed with the clerk of said court.  This is 
a Complaint for Judicial Foreclosure of Deed 
of Trust. DATED: November 8, 2024 ZBS 
LAW, LLP By:/s/ Tom B. Pierce Tom B. Pierce, 
WSBA# 26730 Attorney for Plaintiff ZBS Law, 
LLP 11335 NE 122nd Way, Suite 105 Kirk-
land, WA 98034 Ph. 206-209-0375 Fax 206-
260-8870 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune November 20, 27, December 4, 11, 18 
& 25, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF KING In re the Estate of CHARLES 
GLAISYER Deceased. Case No.: 24-4-07618-
0 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing 
to the personal representative or the per-
sonal representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which 
the probate proceedings were commenced. 
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the personal repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the dece-
dent’s probate and nonprobate assets. Date 
of First Publication: November 20, 2024 Per-
sonal Representative: Jane Simpson Attorney 
for the Personal Representative: Michael 
Biesheuvel Address for Mailing or Service: 
114 Second Ave. S., Suite 101, Edmonds, 
WA 98020 Court of probate proceedings and 
case number: King County, WA Law Offices of 
Kyle G. Ray, P.S. 114 Second Ave. S., Suite 
101 Edmonds, WA 98020 (425) 712-0279 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 20, 27 & December 4, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF KING In re the Estate of JOANNE 
DREBAUM Deceased. Case No.: 24-4-07569-
8 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
personal representative or the personal repre-
sentative’s attorney at the address stated be-
low a copy of the claim and filing the original 
of the claim with the court in which the probate 
proceedings were commenced. The claim 
must be presented within the later of: (1) Thirty 
days after the personal representative served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as pro-
vided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
November 13, 2024 Personal Representative: 
Debra Jo Fine Attorney for the Personal Rep-
resentative: Michael Biesheuvel Address for 
Mailing or Service: 114 Second Ave. S., Suite 
101, Edmonds, WA 9802 Court of probate pro-
ceedings and case number: King County, WA 
Law Offices of Kyle G. Ray, P.S. 114 Second 
Ave. S., Suite 101 Edmonds, WA 98020 (425) 
712-0279 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF KING In re the Estate of MI-
CHAEL CHARLES PRICE, Deceased. NO. 
24-4-07699-6 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) PLEASE 
TAKE NOTICE The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing 
to the personal representative or the per-
sonal representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which 
the probate proceedings were commenced. 
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the personal repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: November 27, 2024 
Personal Representative: Marisa J. Samu-
elson Attorney for PR: Dianlyn G. Cenidoza, 
Llewellyn & Shafer, PLLC Service Address: 
4847 California Ave SW, Ste 100, Seattle, WA 
98116 Court of Probate/Cause #: King County 
Superior Court, 24-4-07699-6 SEA Published 
in the Snohomish County Tribune November 
27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF KING In re the Estate of: DO-
RIS LORENE EAKER, Deceased. Case No. 
24-4-07658-9 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS RCW 11.40.010 et seq. Mary-
ellen Young has been appointed and has 
qualified as Personal Representative of the 
above-captioned estate. Any person having a 
claim against the Decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any other-
wise applicable statute of limitations, present 
the claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the Per-
sonal Representative or the Personal Repre-
sentative’s attorney at the address stated be-
low, a copy of the claim and filing the original 
of the claim with the court. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. DATED: November 18, 2024 
FIRST PUBLICATION: November 27, 2024 
Katrina B. Durkin, WSBA No. 47761 Attorney 
for the Personal Representative Address for 
Mailing or Service: BROTHERS & HENDER-
SON, P.S. 936 N. 34TH STREET, SUITE 200 
SEATTLE, WASHINGTON 98103 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF KING In re the Estate of: Rebekah E. 
Silva deceased. Case No. 24-4-06636-2 SEA 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) 
Bruce Bolin has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate.  Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent that arose 
before the decedent’s death must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any other-
wise applicable statute of limitations, present 
the claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the per-
sonal representative or the personal represen-
tative’s attorney at the address stated below a 
copy of the claim and filing the original of the 
claim with the court.  The claim must be pre-
sented within the later of: (a) Thirty days after 
the personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim will be forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
November 27, 2024 Personal Representative: 
Bruce Bolin Attorney for Estate: Date: Novem-
ber 24, 2024 /s/ Jason Giesler, WSBA No. 
44390 Address for Mailing or Service: Mad-
eline Gauthier Gauthier and Associates, 2223 
112th Avenue N.E., Suite 202 Bellevue, WA 
98004 Phone: 425-637-3019 and King County 
Courthouse Clerk of the Superior Court Room 
E 609 516 Third Avenue Seattle, WA 98104-
2363 Published in the Snohomish County Tri-
bune November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH AARON SCHUSTER, in-
dividually, Plaintiff, vs. THEODORE W. HAM-
PLE, as an estate; PAULINE A. HAMPLE, 
as an estate; and ALL OTHER PERSONS 
OR PARTIES UNKNOWN CLAIMING ANY 
RIGHT, TITLE, ESTATE, LIEN OR INTER-
EST IN THE REAL ESTATE DESCRIBED IN 
THE COMPLAINT HEREIN, Defendants. NO. 
24-2-01666-31 SUMMONS (60 DAYS) TO: 
THEODORE W. HAMPLE, as an estate; and 
TO: PAULINE A. HAMPLE, as an estate; and 
TO: ALL OTHER PERSONS OR PARTIES 
UNKNOWN CLAIMIMNG ANY RIGHT, TITLE, 
ESTATE, LIEN OR INTEREST IN THE REAL 
ESTATE DESCRIBED IN THE COMPLAINT 
HEREIN. You are hereby summoned to ap-
pear within sixty (60) days after the date of 
the first publication of this summons, to wit, 
within sixty (60) days after the 20th day of No-
vember, 2024, and defend the above-entitled 
action in the above-entitled court, and answer 
the complaint of the plaintiff, AARON SCHUS-
TER, and serve a copy of your answer upon 
the undersigned attorneys for plaintiff, Dexter 
N. Bradford and Beresford Booth PLLC, at his 
office below stated; and in case of your failure 
to do so, judgment will be rendered against 
you according to the demand of the complaint, 
which has been filed with the clerk of said 
court. The object of the action is to quiet title 
to the property legally described as follows in 
favor of the plaintiff and to clear title to said 
property of Defendants’ claims: Lot 41, Plat 
of Silver Acres 7, according to plat thereof, 
recorded in Volume 19 of Plats, on page 62, 
records of Snohomish County, Washington. 
Parcel Number: 00574200004100 Counsel 
for Plaintiffs are: Joshua G.R. Curtis Dexter 
N. Bradford Beresford Booth PLLC 145 3rd 
Avenue S. Edmonds, WA 98020 joshuac@
beresfordlaw.com dexterb@beresfordlaw.
com DATED this 12th day of November, 2024. 
BERESFORD BOOTH PLLC By: Joshua G.R. 
Curtis, WSBA No. 42034 Dexter N. Bradford, 
WSBA No. 59859 Attorneys for Plaintiff Pub-
lished in the Snohomish County Tribune No-
vember 20, 27, December 4, 11, 18 & 25, 2025

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH In re Estate of: DAVID 
A. JUSTICE, Deceased. NO.  24-4-40028-31 
NONPROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.42.030) The notice agent named 
below has elected to give notice to creditors 
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of the above-named decedent.  As of the date 
of the filing of a copy of this notice with the 
court, the notice agent has no knowledge of 
any other person acting as notice agent or of 
the appointment of a personal representative 
of the decedent’s estate in the state of Wash-
ington.  According to the records of the court 
as are available on the date of the filing of this 
notice with the court, a cause number regard-
ing the decedent has not been issued to any 
other notice agent and a personal represen-
tative of the decedent’s estate has not been 
appointed.
Any person having a claim against the dece-
dent must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.42.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the notice agent or the notice 
agent’s attorney at the address stated below 
a copy of the claim and filing the original of 
the claim with the court in which the notice 
agent’s declaration and oath were filed.  The 
claim must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty (30) days after the notice agent served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.42.020(2)(c); or (2) four (4) 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.42.050 and 
11.42.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of first publication: 
November 13, 2024 Certificate The notice 
agent declares under penalty of perjury under 
the laws of the state of Washington on No-
vember 5, 2024, at Everett, Washington, that 
the foregoing is true and correct. /s/ JODY L. 
CALKINS Notice Agent: Jody L. Calkins Attor-
ney for the Notice Agent: Maren Benedetti Ad-
ams & Duncan, Inc., P.S. Address for Mailing 
or Service: Jody L. Calkins, Notice Agent c/o 
Maren Benedetti, Attorney for Estate Adams & 
Duncan, Inc., P.S. 3128 Colby Avenue Ever-
ett, WA 98201 425-339-8556 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune November 13, 20 
& 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Estate 
of HERBERT R. METZ, Deceased. No. 24-
4-02259-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS The 
Personal Representative named below has 
been appointed and has qualified as personal 
representatives of this estate.  Persons hav-
ing claims against the deceased must, prior 
to the time such claims would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
serve their claims on the personal representa-
tive or on the attorney of record at the address 
stated below and must file an executed copy 
of the claim with the Clerk of this Court within 
four months after the date of first publication 
of this Notice or within four months after the 
date of filing of the copy of this Notice with 
the Clerk of the Court, whichever is the later, 
or except under those provisions included in 
RCW 11.40.011 or 11.40.013, the claim will be 
forever barred. Date of filing copy of Notice 
to Creditors: November 5, 2024 Date of first 
publication: November 13, 2024 /s/ Herbert R. 
Metz, Personal Representative /s/ W. Mitchell 
Cogdill Attorney for Personal Representative 
c/o Cogdill Nichols Rein Wartelle Andrews 
3232 Rockefeller Avenue Everett, WA  98201 
(425) 259-6111 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Estate 
of: BARBARA GUERRERO, Deceased. Case 
No. 24-4-01981-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS RCW 11.40.010 et seq. Private 
Client Representatives has been appointed 
and has qualified as Administrator of the 
above-captioned estate. Any person having a 
claim against the Decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any other-
wise applicable statute of limitations, present 
the claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the Ad-
ministrator or the Administrator’s attorney at 
the address stated below, a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court. The claim must be presented within the 
later of: (1) Thirty days after the Administrator 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. DATED: November 12, 2024 
FIRST PUBLICATION: November 20, 2024 
Katrina B. Durkin, WSBA No. 47761 Attorney 
for the Administrator Address for Mailing or 
Service: BROTHERS & HENDERSON, P.S. 
936 N. 34TH STREET, SUITE 200 SEATTLE, 
WASHINGTON 98103 Published in the Sno-
homish County Tribune November 20, 27 & 
December 4, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Estate 
of: GARY LEE WERNER, Deceased. NO.   
24-4-40004-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The Personal Represen-
tative named below has been appointed as 
Personal Representative of this estate.  Any 
person having claims against decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing 
the original of the claim with the court.  The 
claim must be presented within the later of:  
(1) Thirty days after the Personal Representa-
tive served or mailed the notice to the creditor 
as provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) 
four months after the date of first publication of 

the notice.  If the claim is not presented within 
this time frame, the claim is forever barred, ex-
cept as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and non-probate assets. Date of first publi-
cation: November 13, 2024 HEATHER ANN 
FOSTH, Personal Representative c/o Bryn 
Wells-Edwards, Attorney 3128 Colby Avenue 
Everett, WA 98201 425-339-8556 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 13, 
20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In Re the Estate 
of: ROBIN D. MILLER, Decedent. Case No.: 
24-4-40099-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
The Personal Representative named below 
has been appointed and has qualified as 
the personal representative of this estate. 
Persons having claims against the deceased 
must, prior to the time such claims would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, serve their claims on the personal 
representative or on the attorney of record 
at the address stated below and must file an 
executed copy of the claim with the Clerk of 
this Court within four months after the date 
of first publication of this Notice or within four 
months after the date of filing of the copy of 
this Notice with the Clerk of the Court, which-
ever is the later, or except under those provi-
sions included in RCW 11.40.060, the claim 
will be forever barred. Date of filing copy of 
Notice to Creditors: 11-20-2024 Date of first 
publication: 11-27-2024 /s/ Diane E. Miller 
Personal Representative COGDILL NICHOLS 
REIN WARTELLE ANDREWS /s/ Douglas M. 
Wartelle, WSBA 25267 Attorney for Personal 
Representative c/o Cogdill Nichols Rein War-
telle Andrews 3232 Rockefeller Avenue Ever-
ett, WA 98201 (425) 259-6111 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH In re the Estate of: SHA-
RON M. KIRK, Deceased. No. 23-4-01631-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS Date of 
Death: June 29, 2023 The Personal Repre-
sentative named below has been appointed 
as the personal representative of this estate.  
Any person having a claim against the dece-
dent must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced.  The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed the 
notice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months after the 
date of first publication of this Notice.  If the 
claim is not presented within this time frame, 
the claim is forever barred, except as other-
wise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and RCW 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. Date of first publication: NO-
VEMBER 27, 2024 Co-Personal Represen-
tatives: DANA M. STARFIRE, KIMBERLY L. 
BARRY Attorney for Co-Personal Represen-
tative Dana M. Starfire: JOEL P. NICHOLS of 
DENO MILLIKAN LAW FIRM, PLLC Attorney 
for Co-Personal Representative Kimberly L. 
Barry: ALISSON H. WALL of KHBB Law PLLC 
DATED this 12th day of November, 2024. 
DENO MILLIKAN LAW FIRM, PLLC /s/ Joel P. 
Nichols JOEL P. NICHOLS, WSBA #23353 At-
torney for Co-Personal Representative, Dana 
M. Starfire Address for Mailing or Service: 
3411 Colby Avenue Everett, WA 98201 Court 
of Probate Proceedings: Snohomish County 
Superior Court 3000 Rockefeller Avenue Ev-
erett WA 98201 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 27,  December 4 
& 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter of the 
Estate of: ARLENE J. BARLEY, Deceased. 
No. 24-4-40036-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS The Personal Representative 
named below has been appointed and has 
qualified as the Personal Representatives of 
this estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by (a) 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Repre-
sentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and (b) filing the original of the 
claim with the court.  The claim must be pre-
sented within the latter of: (1) thirty days after 
the Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of this notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. DATE OF FILING COPY OF 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS with Clerk of Court: 
November 19, 2024. DATE OF FIRST PUBLI-
CATION: November 27, 2024. Personal Rep-
resentative: Gary Meissner 22105 42nd Ave. 
W Mountlake Terrace, WA 98043 Attorney for 
the Personal Representative: Ceth D. Hickey 
Address for Mailing or Service: Ceth D. Hickey 
Hickman Menashe, P.S. 4211 Alderwood Mall 
Blvd., Ste 202 Lynnwood, WA 98036 DATED:  
November 13, 2024. HICKMAN MENASHE, 
P.S. /s/ Ceth D. Hickey, WSBA #55590 Attor-
ney for Personal Representative Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE MATTER 
OF THE ESTATE OF: BETTY ELIZABETH 
LEARY, Deceased. No. 24 4 40122 31 PRO-
BATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11. 
40. 030) The personal representative named 
below has been appointed as personal repre-
sentative of this estate. Any person having a 
claim against the decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any other-
wise applicable statute of limitations, present 
the claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the per-
sonal representative or the personal repre-
sentative’s attorney at the address stated be-
low a copy of the claim and must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed the 
notice to the creditor as provided under RCW 
11.40.020(3); or (2) four months after the date 
of first publication of the notice. If the claim is 
not presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise provid-
ed in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar 
is effective as to claims against both  he dece-
dent’s probate and non-probate assets. Date 
of filing of Notice to Creditors: November 21, 
2024 Date of first publication: November 27, 
2024 LINDA SUE PLAUTZ Personal Repre-
sentative of the Estate of BETTY ELIZABETH 
LEARY ATTORNEY FOR ESTATE: PATRICK 
M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 LAW OFFICES 
OF P. TRIVETT, PLLC 1031 State Avenue, 
Suite 103 Marysville, Washington 98270 
Phone: (360) 653-2525 Fax: (360) 653-6860 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE MAT-
TER OF THE ESTATE OF: BYRON MASAMI 
WAKUMOTO, Deceased. No. 24 4 02230 31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) The administrator/personal repre-
sentative named below has been appointed 
as personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty days after the personal representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. Date of filing copy of Notice to 
Creditors: October 28, 2024 Date of first pub-
lication: November 13, 2024 WAYNE M. WA-
KUMOTO Administrator ATTORNEY FOR ES-
TATE: PATRICK M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 
Law Offices of Patrick M. Trivett, PLLC 1031 
State Avenue, Suite 103 Marysville, Washing-
ton, USA, 98270 Phone: 360-653-2525 360-
659-8282 Fax: 360-653-6860 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune November 13, 20 
& 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH In the Matter of 
the Estate of: DONALD BLAKE WORTHLEY, 
Deceased. NO. 24-4-40022-31 PROBATE 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 
The Personal Representative named below 
has been appointed as Personal Represen-
tative of this estate.  Any person having a 
claim against the decedent must, before the 
time the claim would be barred by any oth-
erwise applicable statute of limitations, pres-
ent the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced.  The 
claim must be presented within the later of: 
(1) Thirty (30) days after the Personal Rep-
resentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four (4) months after the date of first 
publication of the notice.  If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060.  This bar 
is effective as to claims against both the de-
cedent’s probate and non-probate assets. 
Date of first publication: November 13, 2024 
TERESA GRIGGS a.k.a. TERRI GRIGG Per-
sonal Representative Attorneys for Personal 
Representative/ Address for mailing or ser-
vice: Mark A. Jelsing, WSBA #46398 JELS-
ING TRI WEST & ANDRUS PLLC 2926 Colby 
Avenue Everett, WA  98201 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune November 13, 20 
& 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE MATTER OF 
THE ESTATE OF: RUSSELL R. WHITE, De-
ceased. No. 24 4 02229 31 PROBATE NO-
TICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The 
personal representative named below has 
been appointed as personal representative of 
this estate. Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the personal repre-
sentative or the personal representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below a copy 
of the claim and must be presented within the 
later of: (1) Thirty days after the personal rep-
resentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); 
or (2) four months after the date of first pub-

lication of the notice. If the claim is not pre-
sented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the dece-
dent’s probate and non-probate assets. Date 
of filing of Notice to Creditors: October 28, 
2024 Date of first publication: November 13, 
2024 /s/ DAWN L. ENDERLY-WHITE Personal 
Representative of the Estate of RUSSELL R. 
WHITE ATTORNEY FOR ESTATE: PATRICK 
M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 LAW OFFICES 
OF P. TRIVETT, PLLC 1031 State Avenue, 
Suite 103 Marysville, Washington 98270 
Phone: (360) 653-2525 Fax: (360) 653-6860 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATES OF: TERRY RAYMOND GOULD 
and MARTI MARIE GOULD, Deceased. No. 
24 4 40121 31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CRED-
ITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The personal repre-
sentative named below has been appointed 
as personal representative of these estates. 
Any person having a claim against the dece-
dents must, before the time the claim would 
be barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-
ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty days after the personal representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of filing of Notice 
to Creditors: November 21, 2024 Date of first 
publication: November 27, 2024 APRIL RENE 
GOULD Personal Representative of the Es-
tates of TERRY RAYMOND GOULD and 
MARTI MARIE GOULD ATTORNEY FOR ES-
TATE: PATRICK M. TRIVETT, WSBA #38906 
LAW OFFICES OF P. TRIVETT, PLLC 1031 
State Avenue, Suite 103 Marysville, Washing-
ton 98270 Phone: (360) 653-2525 Fax: (360) 
653-6860 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH MT. INDEX RIVERSITES 
COMMUNITY CLUB, a Washington state non-
profit corporation, Plaintiff, vs. UNKNOWN 
HEIRS OF TIM WATKINS; and ALSO ALL 
OTHER PERSONS OR PARTIES UNKNOWN 
CLAIMING ANY RIGHT, TITLE, STATE, LIEN, 
OR INTEREST IN THE REAL ESTATE DE-
SCRIBED IN THE COMPLAINT HEREIN, 
Defendants. NO. 24-2-06284-31 SUMMONS 
BY PUBLICATION TO DEFENDANT: ALL 
UNKNOWN HEIRS AND DEVISEES OF 
TIM WATKINS AND ALL OTHER PERSONS 
OR PARTIES UNKNOWN CLAIMING ANY 
RIGHT, TITLE, ESTATE, LIEN, OR INTER-
EST IN THE REAL ESTATE DESCRIBED 
HEREIN, You are hereby summoned to ap-
pear within sixty (60) days after the date of 
the first publication of this summons, to wit, 
within sixty (60) days after the day of Novem-
ber 20, 2024, and defend the above entitled 
action in the above entitled Court, and answer 
the Complaint of Plaintiff Mt. Index Riversites 
Community Club, Inc., and serve a copy of 
your answer upon the undersigned attorney 
for Plaintiff Mt. Index Riversites Community 
Club, Inc., at his (or their) office below stated; 
and in case of your failure so to do, judgment 
will be rendered against you according to the 
demand of the Complaint, which has been 
filed with the Clerk of said Court. The object of 
the above-entitled action and the relief sought 
to be obtained therein is fully set forth in said 
Complaint and is briefly stated as follows: lien 
foreclosure action for failure to pay for ser-
vices provided for road dues for Tax Parcel 
No. 027103000101500; 27103000101600. 
Date of first publication: November 20, 2024. 
DATED this 13th day of November, 2024. IN-
SLEE, BEST, DOEZIE & RYDER, P.S. By s/ 
Christopher W. Pirnke Christopher W. Pirnke, 
WSBA #44378 10900 NE 4th Street, Suite 
1500 Bellevue, WA 98004 Tel: (425) 455-1234 
Email: cpirnke@insleebest.com Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 20, 
27, December 4, 11, 18 & 25, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON IN AND FOR THE COUN-
TY OF SNOHOMISH Wells Fargo Bank, 
N.A., Plaintiff, vs. GARY OLSON AKA GARY 
DEAN OLSON AKA GARY D. OLSON; UN-
KNOWN HEIRS AND DEVISEES OF LORI 
J. OLSON AKA LORI JEAN OLSON; GARY 
DEAN OLSON, JR; SHEILA OLSON; JEN-
NIFER OLSON; TYLER OLSON; MAKAYLA 
OLSON; DAPHNE JONES; UNITED STATES 
OF AMERICA; HOME SOLUTIONS NORTH-
WEST LLC; JOHN AND/OR JANE DOE, UN-
KNOWN OCCUPANTS/CO-HABITANTS OF 
THE SUBJECT PREMISES Defendants. No. 
24-2-01532-31 CIVIL SUMMONS THE STATE 
OF WASHINGTON TO: Unknown Heirs & De-
visees of Lori J. Olson aka Lori Jean Olson, 
Gary Dean Olson Jr. and Makayla Olson You 
are hereby summoned to appear within sixty 
days after the date of the first publication of 
this summons, to wit, within sixty days after 
the 23rd Day of October, 2024 , and defend 
the above entitled action in the above en-
titled court, and answer the complaint of the 
Plaintiff, Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., and serve a 
copy of your answer upon the undersigned at-
torneys for Plaintiff, LOGS Legal Group LLP, 
their office below stated; and in case of your 
failure so to do, judgment will be rendered 
against you according to the demand of the 
complaint, which has been filed with the clerk 
of said court.
The object of the complaint is to foreclose a 

deed of trust dated March 26, 2010 and re-
corded as Instrument No. 201005100147 
given by Lori J. Olson and Gary D. Olson, wife 
and husband on property commonly known 
as 219 135th Street SE, Everett, WA 98208 
and legally described as: LOT 12 OF SUNSET 
WEST NO. 3, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT 
THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 27 OF 
PLATS, PAGE 75, IN SNOHOMISH COUNTY, 
WASHINGTON.
The complaint seeks to foreclose and termi-
nate all interest of Unknown Heirs & Devisees 
of Lori J. Olson aka Lori Jean Olson, Gary 
Dean Olson Jr. and Makayla Olson and all 
other interests in the property.
If you are in the active military service of the 
United States, or believe that you may be enti-
tled to protection of the SCRA, please contact 
our office.  If you do not contact us, we will 
report to the court that we do not believe that 
you are protected under the SCRA.
If you have questions, you should see an at-
torney immediately. If you need help in finding 
an attorney, you may contact the Washington 
State Bar’s Lawyer Referral Service online at 
www.wsba.org or by calling (206) 443-9722 
(in the Seattle metropolitan area) or toll-free 
elsewhere in Washington at (800) 945-9722. 
Attorneys for Plaintiff, LOGS LEGAL GROUP 
LLP By: /s/ James A. Craft James A Craft 
WSBA#47763 [jcraft@logs.com] 1499 SE 
Tech Center Place, Suite 255, Vancouver, WA 
98683 (360) 260-2253; Fax (360) 260-2285 
COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, WASHINGTON 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
October 23, 30, November 6, 13, 20 & 27, 
2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR KING COUNTY Estate of HOWARD 
E.A. TINSLEY, Deceased. NO. 24-4-08000-4 
SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
RCW 11.40.030 LAUREL JEANNE TINSLEY, 
the Personal Representative (PR), has been 
appointed as PR of this estate. Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent that 
arose before the Decedent’s death must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
PR or the PR’s attorney at the address stated 
below a copy of the claim and filing the origi-
nal of the claim with the court. The claim must 
be presented within the later of: (1) 30 days 
after the PR served or mailed the Notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the Notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 or RCW 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
Decedent’s probate and non-probate assets. 
Date of first publication of Notice to Creditors: 
November 27, 2024 Name of Personal Rep-
resentative: Laurel Jeanne Tinsley Attorney 
for Personal Representative: Sandra Lynn 
Perkins, WSBA No. 15993 Address for Mailing 
or Service: Sandra Lynn Perkins, PLLC 1325 
Fourth Avenue - Suite 940 Seattle WA 98101-
2509 Published in the Snohomish County Tri-
bune November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR KING COUNTY Estate of LINDA JO 
O’CONNELL, Deceased. NO. 24-4-07436-5 
SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
BRIDGET VERHEI has been appointed as 
Personal Representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the Decedent 
that arose before the Decedent’s death must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
Personal Representative or the Personal Rep-
resentative’s attorney at the address stated 
below a copy of the claim and filing the original 
of the claim with the court. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) 30 days after 
the Personal Representative served or mailed 
the Notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four months af-
ter the date of first publication of the Notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 or RCW 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. Date of first publication of No-
tice to Creditors: November 13, 2024 Name 
of Personal Representative: Bridget Verhei 
Address for Mailing or Service: Bridget Verhei 
312 Sydney Ave N. North Bend, WA 98045 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR KING COUNTY In re the Estate 
of: BRETT W. MEEKS, Deceased. NO. 24-4-
07953-7 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS RCW 11.40 The Administrator named 
below has been appointed as Administrator of 
this Estate. Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Administrator or 
their attorney at the address stated below a 
copy of the claim and filing the original of the 
claim with the court in which the probate pro-
ceedings were commenced. The claim must 
be presented within the later of: (1) Thirty (30) 
days after the Administrator served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Dated this 18th day of 
November, 2024. Chantelle R. Foss, Admin-
istrator Court of Probate Proceedings and 
Cause No:  See Caption Above Date of First 
Publication:  11/27/2024 Attorney for Admin-
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istrator: Linda E. Naish, WSBA No. 56326 
Address for Service and Mailing: COGDILL 
NICHOLS REIN WARTELLE ANDREWS 3232 
Rockefeller Ave. Everett, WA 98201 425-259-
6111 Snohomish County Tribune November 
27, December 4 & 11, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON FOR KING COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of STELLA MCGOLDRICK, Deceased. 
In the Matter of the Estate of DENNIS S. 
MCGOLDRICK, Deceased. Cause No.: 24-4-
07548-5 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS RCW 11.40.030 The Personal Repre-
sentative (hereinafter, “PR”) named below has 
been appointed as Personal Representative 
of the above-mentioned estates.  Any person 
having a claim against the Decedents must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
Personal Representative or the Personal Rep-
resentative’s attorney of record at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced.  The 
claim must be presented within the later of: (1) 
thirty days after the Personal Representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) 
four months after the date of first publication of 
the notice.  If the claim is not presented within 
this time frame, the claim is forever barred, ex-
cept as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and RCW 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as 
to claims against both the Decedents’ pro-
bate and nonprobate assets. Date of Filing: 
November 5, 2024 Date of First Publication: 
November 13, 2024 Personal Representative: 
TIMOTHY JAMES MCGOLDRICK Attorney: 
LAURA M. ZEMAN WSBA No. 30221 Attor-
neys for PR Address for mailing or service be-
low: Zeman Law Group, PLLC 3006 Northup 
Way, Suite 100 Bellevue, WA  98004 Court 
of probate proceedings and cause number: 
King County Superior Court Cause No. 24-
4-07548-5 SEA Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHING-
TON IN AND FOR KING COUNTY Nonprobate 
Estate of: KAREN MILLER, Deceased. No. 
24-4-07945-6 SEA NON-PROBATE NOTICE 
TO CREDITORS (RCW 11.42.030) (NTCRD) 
The notice agent named below has elected to 
give notice to creditors of the above-named 
Decedent. As of the date of the filing of a copy 
of this notice with the court, the notice agent 
has no knowledge of any other person acting 
as notice agent or of the appointment of a per-
sonal representative of the Decedent’s Estate 
in the state of Washington. According to the 
records of the court as are available on the 
date of the filing of this notice with the court, 
a cause number regarding the Decedent has 
not been issued to any other notice agent and 
a personal representative of the Decedent’s 
estate has not been appointed. Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.42.070 by serving on or mailing 
to the notice agents or the notice agents’ at-
torney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) Thirty days after the no-
tice agents served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.42.020(2)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.42.050 and 11.42.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the Dece-
dent’s probate and nonprobate assets. DATE 
OF FIRST PUBLICATION: November 20, 
2024. The notice agent declares under pen-
alty of perjury under the laws of the state of 
Washington on this 31st day of October 2024, 
at Federal Way, Washington that the foregoing 
is true and correct. /s/ Julie Sharples, Notice 
Agent Bis Pierce, WSBA #56755 Attorney 
for the Notice Agent Address for Mailing or 
Service 32649 39th Pl SW Federal Way, WA 
98023 (206) 930-8819 Published in the Sno-
homish County Tribune November 20, 27 & 
December 4, 2024

LEGAL NOTICE Snohomish County Sale of 
Fleet SURPLUS Vehicles And Misc. 

Equipment
Surplus Vehicles / Misc. Equipment are being 
offered for sale by Murphy Auction.  
Information about the sale items can be 
viewed at http://murphyauction.com/Auction/
List
ONLINE AUCTION Dates: DECEMBER 5-12, 
2024
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 20 & 27, 2024

Loan No: ******9396 TS No: 24-10945 NO-
TICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE PURSUANT TO 
THE REVISED CODE OF WASHINGTON 
CHAPTER 61.24 RCW Grantor: HEINZ JUR-
GEN GEHNER III and HEATHER GENE 
GEHNER Current Beneficiary of Deed of 
Trust: PREMIER MORTGAGE RESOURCES, 
L.L.C. Current Mortgage Servicer for the Deed 
of Trust: Servbank Current Trustee for the 
Deed of Trust: MICHELLE R. GHIDOTTI, 
ESQ. Trustee’s address is 144 Railroad Ave-
nue, Suite 236, Edmonds, WA 98020-4100 
(206) 331-3280 Trustee’s agent for service is 
Gary Krohn, Reg. Agent, whose address is 
144 Railroad Avenue, Suite 236 Edmonds, 
WA 98020-4100 Phone: (206) 525-1925 If 
there are any questions regarding this Notice, 
please contact (206) 331-3280 Reference 
Number of Deed of Trust: 202111220219 Par-
cel Number(s): 00625300001300 Abbr. Legal 
Description: Lot 13, Plat of Green Velvet, Vol 
29, PGS 1-3, Snohomish County THIS NO-
TICE IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE 
FORECLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. 
You have only until 90 calendar days BEFORE 

the date of sale listed in this Notice of Trustee 
Sale to be referred to mediation. If this is an 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale providing a 
45-day notice of the sale, mediation must be 
requested no later than 25 calendar days BE-
FORE the date of sale listed in this amended 
Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT DELAY. 
CONTACT A HOUSING COUNSELOR OR AN 
ATTORNEY LICENSED IN WASHINGTON 
NOW to assess your situation and refer you to 
mediation if you are eligible and it may help 
you save your home. See below for safe 
sources of help. SEEKING ASSISTANCE 
Housing counselors and legal assistance may 
be available at little or no cost to you. If you 
would like assistance in determining your 
rights and opportunities to keep your house, 
you may contact the following: The statewide 
foreclosure hotline for assistance and referral 
to housing counselors recommended by the 
Housing Finance Commission Telephone: 
1-877-894-HOME(1-877-894-4663) . Web 
site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/home-
ownership/post_purchase_counselors_fore-
closure.htm The United States Department of 
Housing and Urban Development Telephone: 
1-800-569-4287 Web site: http://www.hud.
gov/offices/hsg/sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webList
Action=search&searchstate=WA&filterSvc=d
fc The statewide civil legal aid hotline for as-
sistance and referrals to other housing coun-
selors and attorneys Telephone: 1-800-606-
4819 Web site: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear 
I. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the under-
signed Trustee will on 12/6/2024, at 10:00 AM 
at Outside The North Plaza Entrance to the 
Snohomish County Courthouse, 3000 Rocke-
feller Ave, Everett, WA 98201 sell at public 
auction to the highest and best bidder, pay-
able, in the form of cash, or cashier’s check or 
certified checks from federally or State char-
tered banks, at the time of sale the following 
described real property, situated in the County 
of Snohomish, State of Washington, to-wit: 
LOT 13, PLAT OF GREEN VELVET, AC-
CORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RE-
CORDED IN VOLUME 29 OF PLATS, PAGES 
1 THROUGH 3, INCLUSIVE, RECORDS OF 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON; SIT-
UATE IN THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, 
STATE OF WASHINGTON. Commonly known 
as: 714 N CARPENTER RD SNOHOMISH 
WASHINGTON 98290 which is subject to that 
certain Deed of Trust dated 11/12/2021, re-
corded 11/22/2021, under Auditor’s File No. 
202111220219, in Book , Page records of 
Snohomish County, Washington, from HEINZ 
JURGEN GEHNER III AND HEATHER GENE 
GEHNER A MARRIED COUPLE, as 
Grantor(s), to RAINIER TITLE & ESCROW, as 
Trustee, to secure an obligation in favor of 
MORTGAGE ELECTRONIC REGISTRATION 
SYSTEMS, INC. AS NOMINEE FOR PRE-
MIER MORTGAGE RESOURCES, LLC, ITS 
SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS, as Beneficia-
ry, the beneficial interest in which was as-
signed to PREMIER MORTGAGE RESOURC-
ES, L.L.C.. II. No action commenced by the 
Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust is now pend-
ing to seek satisfaction of the obligation in any 
Court by reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s 
default on the obligation secured by the Deed 
of Trust. III. The default(s) for which this fore-
closure is made is/are as follows: Failure to 
pay when due the following amounts which 
are now in arrears: PAYMENT INFORMA-
TION: FROM THRU NO.PMT AMOUNT TO-
TAL 8/1/2023 12 $4,175.85 $50,110.26 BEN-
EFICIARY’S ADVANCES, COSTS AND 
EXPENSES: DESCRIPTION ADVANCE 
AMOUNT 4/5/2024 Suspense Amount 
($2,654.61) 4/5/2024 Recoverable Corp Adv 
Amount $3,500.00 4/5/2024 Accrued Late 
Charge Amount $731.94 4/5/2024 Forecasted 
Late Charge Amount $121.99 ESTIMATED 
FORECLOSURE FEES & COSTS 03/14/2024 
Mailing Service Fee $3.20 03/14/2024 Trust-
ee’s Fees $510.00 03/18/2024 NOD Posting 
Fee $125.00 03/18/2024 Record Assignment 
of Deed of Trust $18.00 03/18/2024 Record 
Substitution of Trustee $18.00 03/18/2024 
T.S.G. Fee $1,613.00 04/05/2024 Mailing Ser-
vice Fee $8.40 07/25/2024 Trustee’s Fees 
$935.00 03/14/2024 Post Referral Solicitation 
Mailings $8.00 03/18/2024 Notice of Default 
Mailings $16.96 TOTAL DUE AS OF: 
7/25/2024 $55,065.14 IV. The sum owing on 
the obligation secured by the Deed of Trust is: 
The principal sum of $518,916.38, together 
with interest as provided in the Note or other 
instrument secured from 7/1/2023, and such 
other costs and fees as are due under the 
Note or other instrument secured and as are 
provided by statute. V. The above described 
real property will be sold to satisfy the ex-
pense of sale and the obligation secured by 
the Deed of Trust as provided by statute. The 
sale will be made without warranty, expressed 
or implied, regarding title, possession or en-
cumbrances on 12/6/2024. The defaults re-
ferred to in Paragraph III must be cured by 
11/25/2024, (11 days before the sale date) to 
cause a discontinuance of the sale. The sale 
will be discontinued and terminated if at any 
time before 11/25/2024 (11 days before the 
sale) the default as set forth in Paragraph III, 
together with any subsequent payments, late 
charges, advances, costs and fees thereafter 
due, is/are cured and the Trustee’s fees and 
costs are paid. Payment must be in cash or 
with cashiers or certified checks from a State 
or federally chartered bank. The sale may be 
terminated any time after the 11/25/2024 (11 
days before the sale date) and before the 
sale, by the Borrower, or Grantor or any Guar-
antors or the holder of any recorded junior lien 
or encumbrance by paying the entire principal 
and interest secured by the Deed of Trust, 
plus costs, fees and advances, if any, made 
pursuant to the terms of the obligation and/or 
Deed of Trust and curing all other defaults. VI. 
A written Notice of Default was transmitted by 
the Beneficiary or Trustee to the Borrower(s) 
and Grantor(s) at the following address(es): 
NAME ADDRESS HEATHER GENE GEHNER 
714 N CARPENTER RD SNOHOMISH, WA 
98290-9619 HEINZ JURGEN GEHNER III 714 
N CARPENTER RD SNOHOMISH, WA 
98290-9619 by both first class and certified 

mail on 4/8/2024, proof of which is in the pos-
session of the Trustee; and on 4/8/2024 the 
Borrower and Grantor were personally served, 
if applicable, with said written Notice of De-
fault or the written Notice of Default was post-
ed in a conspicuous place on the real property 
described in Paragraph I above, and the 
Trustee has possession of proof of such ser-
vice or posting. VII. The Trustee whose name 
and address are set forth below will provide in 
writing to anyone requesting it, a statement of 
all costs and fees due at any time prior to the 
sale. VIII. The effect of the sale will be to de-
prive the Grantor and all those who hold by, 
through or under the Grantor of all their inter-
est in the above described property. IX. Any-
one having any objections to this sale on any 
grounds whatsoever will be afforded an oppor-
tunity to be heard as to those objections if they 
bring a lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant to 
RCW 61.24.130. Failure to bring such a law-
suit may result in a waiver of any proper 
grounds for invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. 
NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS- 
The purchaser at the trustee’s sale is entitled 
to possession of the property on the 20th day 
following the sale, as against the grantor un-
der the Deed of Trust (the owner) and anyone 
having an interest junior to the Deed of Trust, 
including occupants who are not tenants. After 
the 20th day following the sale the purchaser 
has the right to evict occupants who are not 
tenants by summary proceedings under chap-
ter 59.12 RCW. For tenant-occupied property, 
the purchaser shall provide a tenant with writ-
ten notice in accordance with RCW 61.24.060. 
If you are a servicemember or a dependent of 
a servicemember, you may be entitled to cer-
tain protections under the federal Service-
members Civil Relief Act and any comparable 
state laws regarding the risk of foreclosure. If 
you believe you may be entitled to these pro-
tections, please contact our office immediate-
ly. Additional disclaimers provided by the 
Trustee: If you have previously been dis-
charged through bankruptcy, you may have 
been released of personal liability for this loan 
in which case this letter is intended to exercise 
the noteholders rights against the real prop-
erty only. Service of Process should be sent 
to: Michelle Ghidotti, Esq., c/o Gary Krohn, 
Reg. Agent, 144 Railroad Avenue, Suite 236, 
Edmonds, WA 98020-4100 and faxed to (949) 
427-2732. If there are any questions regard-
ing this Notice, please contact (206) 331-
3280. SALE INFORMATION CAN BE OB-
TAINED ONLINE AT www.nationwideposting.
com FOR AUTOMATED SALES INFORMA-
TION PLEASE CALL: (916) 939-0772 THIS IS 
AN ATTEMPT TO COLLECT A DEBT AND 
ANY INFORMATION OBTAINED WILL BE 
USED FOR THAT PURPOSE. DATED: 
07/25/2024 Michelle Ghidotti, Esq. 144 Rail-
road Avenue, Suite 236 Edmonds, WA 98020-
4100 Phone: (206) 331-3280 Fax: (949) 427-
2732 Michelle R. Ghidotti, Esq., as Trustee A 
notary public or other officer completing this 
certificate verifies only the identity of the indi-
vidual who signed the document, to which this 
certificate is attached, and not the truthful-
ness, accuracy, or validity of that document. 
State of California ) )ss County of Orange ) On 
07/25/2024 before me, Tina Suihkonen, Nota-
ry Public personally appeared Michelle Ghi-
dotti-Gonsalves, Esq who proved to me on the 
basis of satisfactory evidence to be the 
person(s) whose name(s) is/are subscribed to 
the within instrument and acknowledged to me 
that he/she/they executed the same in his/her/
their authorized capacity(ies), and that by his/
her/their signature(s) on the instrument the 
person(s), or the entity upon behalf of which 
the person(s) acted, executed the instrument. 
I certify under PENALTY OF PERJURY under 
the laws of the State of California that the fore-
going paragraph is true and correct. WIT-
NESS my hand and official seal. Signature 
Tina Suihkonen (Seal) TINA SUIHKONEN 
Notary Public California Orange County Com-
mission # 2453258 My Comm. Expires Jul 15, 
2027 NPP0463564 To: SNOHOMISH COUN-
TY TRIBUNE 11/06/2024, 11/27/2024

NO. 24-4-01193-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) IN THE SU-
PERIOR COURT OF THE STATE OF WASH-
INGTON IN AND FOR SNOHOMISH COUN-
TY In the matter of the estate of ELIZABETH 
JEAN NIELSEN, Deceased. PLEASE TAKE 
NOTICE The Administrator named below has 
been appointed as Administrator of this estate. 
Any person having a claim against the dece-
dent must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the personal representative or the 
personal representative’s attorney at the ad-
dress stated below a copy of the claim and 
filing the original of the claim with the court 
in which the probate proceedings were com-
menced. The claim must be presented within 
the later of: (1) Thirty days after the Adminis-
trator served or mailed the notice to the credi-
tor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c) or 
(2) four months after the date of first publica-
tion of the notice. If the claim is not presented 
within this time frame, the claim is forever 
barred, except as otherwise provided in RCW 
11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is effec-
tive as to claims against both the decedent’s 
probate and nonprobate assets. Date of first 
publication: November 13, 2024 Administra-
tor: Lance Martin Hudson Dated this 7th day 
of November, 2024 BENJAMIN GOODWIN, 
WSBA #56705 Attorney for the Representa-
tive Address for Mailing or Service: Estate 
of  Elizabeth Jean Nielsen C/O Goodwin Le-
gal, PLLC 1709 124th Ave NE, #218, Lake 
Stevens, WA, 98258 Court of Probate Pro-
ceedings: Snohomish County Superior Court 
Cause No. 24-4-01193-31 Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune November 13, 20 
& 27, 2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursuant to 
the Revised Code of Washington 61.24, et 
seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 Seattle, WA 
98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-19-857335-BF 

Title Order No.: 8787952 Reference Number 
of Deed of Trust: Instrument No. 
200809190430 Parcel Number(s): 010105-
000-008-00 Grantor(s) for Recording Purpos-
es under RCW 65.04.015: WALLACE 
GREENE AND MARY JESS GREENE, HUS-
BAND AND WIFE Current Beneficiary of the 
Deed of Trust and Grantee (for Recording 
Purposes under RCW 65.04.015): Wells Far-
go Bank, N.A. Current Trustee of the Deed of 
Trust: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORA-
TION Current Loan Mortgage Servicer of the 
Deed of Trust: Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. I.NO-
TICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that QUALITY 
LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION, the under-
signed Trustee, will on 12/6/2024, at 10:00 AM 
Outside The North Plaza Entrance to the Sno-
homish County Courthouse, located at 3000 
Rockefeller Ave, Everett, WA 98201 sell at 
public auction to the highest and best bidder, 
payable in the form of credit bid or cash bid in 
the form of cashier’s check or certified checks 
from federally or State chartered banks, at the 
time of sale the following described real prop-
erty, situated in the County of SNOHOMISH, 
State of Washington, to-wit: LOT 8, ECHO 
FALLS ESTATES, ACCORDING TO THE 
PLAT THEREOF RECORDED UNDER SNO-
HOMISH COUNTY RECORDING NO. 
200405125136. SITUATE IN THE COUNTY 
OF SNOHOMISH, STATE OF WASHINGTON. 
More commonly known as: 23309 148TH AVE 
SE, SNOHOMISH, WA 98296-0000 Subject to 
that certain Deed of Trust dated 9/11/2008, 
recorded 9/19/2008, under Instrument No. 
200809190430 records of SNOHOMISH 
County, Washington, from WALLACE 
GREENE AND MARY JESS GREENE, HUS-
BAND AND WIFE, as grantor(s), to WELLS 
FARGO FINANCIAL NATIONAL BANK, as 
original trustee, to secure an obligation in fa-
vor of EDWARD JONES MORTGAGE, LLC, 
as original beneficiary, the beneficial interest 
in which was subsequently assigned to Wells 
Fargo Bank, N.A., the Beneficiary, under an 
assignment recorded under Auditors File 
Number 200812160409 II. No action com-
menced by the Beneficiary of the Deed of 
Trust as referenced in RCW 61.21.030(4) is 
now pending to seek satisfaction of the obliga-
tion in any Court by reason of the Borrower’s 
or Grantor’s default on the obligation secured 
by the Deed of Trust/Mortgage. III. The 
default(s) for which this foreclosure is made 
is/are as follows: Failure to pay the remaining 
balances due, including principal and interest, 
along with late charges and/or any accrued 
fees and costs as due pursuant to the terms of 
the loan documents on the maturity date of 
9/11/2018, as specified in the promissory note 
dated 9/11/2008. Nothing in this notice shall 
be construed as a waiver of any fees owing to 
the Beneficiary under the Deed of Trust pursu-
ant to the terms of the loan documents. IV. 
The sum owing on the matured obligation se-
cured by the Deed of Trust is: $246,282.22 V. 
The above-described real property will be sold 
to satisfy the expense of sale and the obliga-
tion secured by the Deed of Trust as provided 
by statute. The sale will be made without war-
ranty, expressed or implied, regarding title, 
possession or encumbrances on 12/6/2024. 
The defaults referred to in Paragraph III must 
be cured prior to the foreclosure sale to cause 
a discontinuance of the sale. The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if at any time be-
fore the foreclosure sale the default as set 
forth in Paragraph III is cured and the Trust-
ee’s fees and costs are paid. Payment must 
be in cash or with cashiers or certified checks 
from a State or federally chartered bank. The 
sale may be terminated any time before the 
sale, by the Borrower or Grantor or the holder 
of any recorded junior lien or encumbrance by 
paying the amount referenced in Paragraph 
IV, along with late charges, foreclosure fees 
and costs, any legal fees, and/or advances 
that have become due pursuant to the terms 
of the obligation and/or Deed of Trust, and 
curing all other defaults. VI. A written Notice of 
Default was transmitted by the Beneficiary or 
Trustee to the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) by 
both first class and certified mail proof of 
which is in the possession of the Trustee. The 
written Notice of Default was posted in a con-
spicuous place on the real property described 
in Paragraph I above, or the Borrower and 
Grantor were personally served, where appli-
cable, with said written Notice of Default, and 
the Trustee has possession of proof of such 
posting or service. The list of recipients of the 
Notice of Default is listed within the Notice of 
Foreclosure provided to the Borrower(s) and 
Grantor(s). These requirements were com-
pleted as of 5/10/2019. VII. The Trustee 
whose name and address are set forth below 
will provide in writing to anyone requesting it, 
a statement of all costs and fees due at any 
time prior to the sale. VIII. The effect of the 
sale will be to deprive the Grantor and all 
those who hold by, through or under the 
Grantor of all their interest in the above-de-
scribed property. IX. Anyone having any ob-
jections to this sale on any grounds whatso-
ever will be afforded an opportunity to be 
heard as to those objections if they bring a 
lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant to RCW 
61.24.130. Failure to bring such a lawsuit may 
result in a waiver of any proper grounds for 
invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. NOTICE TO 
OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS -  The purchaser 
at the Trustee’s Sale is entitled to possession 
of the property on the 20th day following the 
sale, as against the Grantor under the deed of 
trust (the owner) and anyone having an inter-
est junior to the deed of trust, including occu-
pants who are not tenants. After the 20th day 
following the sale the purchaser has the right 
to evict occupants who are not tenants by 
summary proceedings under Chapter 59.12 
RCW. For tenant-occupied property, the pur-
chaser shall provide a tenant with written no-
tice in accordance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS 
NOTICE IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE 
FORECLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. 
You may be eligible for mediation. You have 
only until 90 calendar days BEFORE the date 
of sale listed in this Notice of Trustee Sale to 
be referred to mediation. If this is an amended 

Notice of Trustee Sale providing a 45-day no-
tice of the sale, mediation must be requested 
no later than 25 calendar days BEFORE the 
date of sale listed in this amended Notice of 
Trustee Sale. DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A 
HOUSING COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY 
LICENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if you 
are eligible and it may help you save your 
home. See below for safe sources of help. 
SEEKING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors 
and legal assistance may be available at little 
or no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities to 
keep your house, you may contact the follow-
ing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for as-
sistance and referral to housing counselors 
recommended by the Housing Finance Com-
mission: Toll-free: 1-877-894-HOME (1-877-
894-4663) or Web site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/
consumers/homeownership/post_purchase_
counselors_foreclosure.htm The United 
States Department of Housing and Urban De-
velopment: Toll-free: 1-800-569-4287 or Na-
tional Web Site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudpor-
tal/HUD or for Local counseling agencies in 
Washington: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/
sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search&
searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The statewide 
civil legal aid hotline for assistance and refer-
rals to other housing counselors and attor-
neys: Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 or Web 
site: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear Additional 
information provided by the Trustee: If you 
have previously been discharged through 
bankruptcy, you may have been released of 
personal liability for this loan in which case 
this letter is intended to exercise the notehold-
ers rights against the real property only. The 
Trustee’s Sale Number is WA-19-857335-BF. 
Dated: 7/25/2024 QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION, as Trustee By: Tianah 
Schrock, Assistant Secretary Trustee’s Ad-
dress: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORA-
TION 108 1 st Ave South, Suite 450, Seattle, 
WA 98104 For questions call toll-free: (866) 
925-0241 Trustee Sale Number: WA-19-
857335-BF Sale Line: 916-939-0772 or Login 
to: http://www. qualityloan.com IDSPub 
#0213509 11/6/2024 11/27/2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursuant to 
the Revised Code of Washington 61.24, et 
seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 Seattle, 
WA 98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-24-988850-
BF Title Order No.: 240208743-WA-MSI 
Reference Number of Deed of Trust: Instru-
ment No. 200705090059 Parcel Number(s): 
01014300000900 Grantor(s) for Recording 
Purposes under RCW 65.04.015: OLGA NAZ-
AROVE, AS HER SOLE AND SEPARATE 
PROPERTY Current Beneficiary of the Deed 
of Trust and Grantee (for Recording Purposes 
under RCW 65.04.015): HSBC Bank USA, 
National Association, as Trustee for the Hold-
ers of the Deutsche Alt-A Securities, Inc. Mort-
gage Loan Trust, Mortgage Pass-Through 
Certificates Series 2007-OA4 Current Trustee 
of the Deed of Trust: QUALITY LOAN SER-
VICE CORPORATION Current Loan Mort-
gage Servicer of the Deed of Trust: NewRez 
LLC, d/b/a Shellpoint Mortgage Servicing 
I.NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that QUALITY 
LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION, the under-
signed Trustee, will on 12/27/2024, at 9:00 AM 
On the Steps in Front of the North Entrance to 
the Snohomish County Superior Courthouse, 
located at 3000 Rockefeller Avenue, Everett, 
WA 98201 sell at public auction to the highest 
and best bidder, payable in the form of credit 
bid or cash bid in the form of cashier’s check 
or certified checks from federally or State 
chartered banks, at the time of sale the fol-
lowing described real property, situated in the 
County of SNOHOMISH, State of Washington, 
to-wit: LOT 9, CHESWICK LANE, ACCORD-
ING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED 
UNDER SNOHOMISH COUNTY AUDITOR’S 
FILE NUMBER 200407205004, RECORDS 
OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY WASHINGTON. 
SITUATE IN THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, 
STATE OF WASHINGTON. More commonly 
known as: 8601 45TH PL W, MUKILTEO, 
WA 98275-3401 Subject to that certain Deed 
of Trust dated 5/3/2007, recorded 5/9/2007, 
under Instrument No. 200705090059 records 
of SNOHOMISH County, Washington, from 
OLGA NAZAROVE, AS HER SOLE AND SEP-
ARATE PROPERTY, as grantor(s), to LS TI-
TLE OF WASHINGTON, as original trustee, to 
secure an obligation in favor of MORTGAGE 
ELECTRONIC REGISTRATION SYSTEMS, 
INC., AS BENEFICIARY AS NOMINEE FOR 
COUNTRYWIDE HOME LOANS, INC., ITS 
SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS, as original 
beneficiary, the beneficial interest in which 
was subsequently assigned to HSBC Bank 
USA, National Association, as Trustee for 
the Holders of the Deutsche Alt-A Securities, 
Inc. Mortgage Loan Trust, Mortgage Pass-
Through Certificates Series 2007-OA4, the 
Beneficiary, under an assignment recorded 
under Auditors File Number 201408110202 
II. No action commenced by the Beneficiary 
of the Deed of Trust as referenced in RCW 
61.21.030(4) is now pending to seek satisfac-
tion of the obligation in any Court by reason 
of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s default on 
the obligation secured by the Deed of Trust/
Mortgage. III. The default(s) for which this 
foreclosure is made is/are as follows: Failure 
to pay when due the following amounts which 
are now in arrears: $43,151.10. IV. The sum 
owing on the obligation secured by the Deed 
of Trust is: The principal sum of $608,465.21, 
together with interest as provided in the Note 
from 9/1/2023 on, and such other costs, fees, 
and charges as are due under the Note, Deed 
of Trust, or other instrument secured, and as 
are provided by statute. V. The above-de-
scribed real property will be sold to satisfy the 
expense of sale and the obligation secured by 
the Deed of Trust as provided by statute. Said 
sale will be made without warranty, expressed 
or implied, regarding title, possession or encum-
brances on 12/27/2024. The defaults referred to 
in Paragraph III must be cured by 12/16/2024 
(11 days before the sale date), or by other date 
as permitted in the Note or Deed of Trust, 
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to cause a discontinuance of the sale. The 
sale will be discontinued and terminated if 
at any time before 12/16/2024 (11 days be-
fore the sale), or by other date as permitted 
in the Note or Deed of Trust, the default as 
set forth in Paragraph III is cured and the 
Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. Payment 
must be in cash or with cashiers or certified 
checks from a State or federally chartered 
bank. The sale may be terminated any time 
after the 12/16/2024 (11 days before the sale 
date) and before the sale, by the Borrower or 
Grantor or the holder of any recorded junior 
lien or encumbrance by paying the principal 
and interest, plus costs, fees and advances, 
if any, made pursuant to the terms of the ob-
ligation and/or Deed of Trust, and curing all 
other defaults. VI. A written Notice of Default 
was transmitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee 
to the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) by both first 
class and certified mail, proof of which is in the 
possession of the Trustee; and the Borrower 
and Grantor were personally served, if appli-
cable, with said written Notice of Default or the 
written Notice of Default was posted in a con-
spicuous place on the real property described 
in Paragraph I above, and the Trustee has 
possession of proof of such service or post-
ing. The list of recipients of the Notice of De-
fault is listed within the Notice of Foreclosure 
provided to the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s). 
These requirements were completed as of 
5/30/2024. VII. The Trustee whose name 
and address are set forth below will provide 
in writing to anyone requesting it, a statement 
of all costs and fees due at any time prior to 
the sale. VIII. The effect of the sale will be to 
deprive the Grantor and all those who hold 
by, through or under the Grantor of all their 
interest in the above-described property. IX. 
Anyone having any objections to this sale 
on any grounds whatsoever will be afforded 
an opportunity to be heard as to those objec-
tions if they bring a lawsuit to restrain the sale 
pursuant to RCW 61.24.130. Failure to bring 
such a lawsuit may result in a waiver of any 
proper grounds for invalidating the Trustee’s 
sale. X. NOTICE TO OCCUPANTS OR TEN-
ANTS -  The purchaser at the Trustee’s Sale 
is entitled to possession of the property on 
the 20th day following the sale, as against the 
Grantor under the deed of trust (the owner) 
and anyone having an interest junior to the 
deed of trust, including occupants who are not 
tenants. After the 20th day following the sale 
the purchaser has the right to evict occupants 
who are not tenants by summary proceedings 
under Chapter 59.12 RCW. For tenant-occu-
pied property, the purchaser shall provide a 
tenant with written notice in accordance with 
RCW 61.24.060. THIS NOTICE IS THE FINAL 
STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE SALE 
OF YOUR HOME. You may be eligible for me-
diation. You have only until 90 calendar days 
BEFORE the date of sale listed in this Notice 
of Trustee Sale to be referred to mediation. If 
this is an amended Notice of Trustee Sale pro-
viding a 45-day notice of the sale, mediation 
must be requested no later than 25 calendar 
days BEFORE the date of sale listed in this 
amended Notice of Trustee Sale. DO NOT 
DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING COUNSEL-
OR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED IN WASH-
INGTON NOW to assess your situation and 
refer you to mediation if you are eligible and it 
may help you save your home. See below for 
safe sources of help. SEEKING ASSISTANCE 
Housing counselors and legal assistance may 
be available at little or no cost to you. If you 
would like assistance in determining your 
rights and opportunities to keep your house, 
you may contact the following: The statewide 
foreclosure hotline for assistance and refer-
ral to housing counselors recommended by 
the Housing Finance Commission: Toll-free: 
1-877-894-HOME (1-877-894-4663) or Web 
site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/consumers/home-
ownership/post_purchase_counselors_fore-
closure.htm The United States Department of 
Housing and Urban Development: Toll-free: 
1-800-569-4287 or National Web Site: http://
portal.hud.gov/hudportal/HUD or for Local 
counseling agencies in Washington: http://
www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/sfh/hcc/fc/index.cf
m?webListAction=search&searchstate=WA
&filterSvc=dfc The statewide civil legal aid 
hotline for assistance and referrals to other 
housing counselors and attorneys: Telephone: 
1-800-606-4819 or Web site: http://nwjustice.
org/what-clear Additional information provided 
by the Trustee: If you have previously been 
discharged through bankruptcy, you may have 
been released of personal liability for this loan 
in which case this letter is intended to exer-
cise the noteholders rights against the real 
property only. The Trustee’s Sale Number is 
WA-24-988850-BF. Dated: 8/22/2024 QUAL-
ITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORATION, as 
Trustee By: Jeff Stenman, President Trustee’s 
Address: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE COR-
PORATION 108 1 st Ave South, Suite 450, 
Seattle, WA 98104 For questions call toll-free: 
(866) 925-0241 Trustee Sale Number: WA-
24-988850-BF Sale Line: 800-280-2832 or 
Login to: http://www. qualityloan.com IDSPub 
#0224041 11/27/2024 12/18/2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE Pursuant to 
the Revised Code of Washington 61.24, et 
seq.108 1st Ave South, Suite 450 Seattle, WA 
98104 Trustee Sale No.: WA-24-991960-SW 
Title Order No.: FIN-24005781 Reference 
Number of Deed of Trust: Instrument No. 
202104280388 Parcel Number(s): 010939-
002-204-00 Grantor(s) for Recording Purpos-
es under RCW 65.04.015: JACOB MORAN, 
AN UNMARRIED MAN Current Beneficiary of 
the Deed of Trust and Grantee (for Recording 
Purposes under RCW 65.04.015): Guild Mort-
gage Company LLC Current Trustee of the 
Deed of Trust: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION Current Loan Mortgage Ser-
vicer of the Deed of Trust: Guild Mortgage 
Company LLC I.NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 
that QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORA-
TION, the undersigned Trustee, will on 
12/27/2024, at 9:00 AM On the Steps in Front 
of the North Entrance to the Snohomish Coun-
ty Superior Courthouse, located at 3000 

Rockefeller Avenue, Everett, WA 98201 sell at 
public auction to the highest and best bidder, 
payable in the form of credit bid or cash bid in 
the form of cashier’s check or certified checks 
from federally or State chartered banks, at the 
time of sale the following described real prop-
erty, situated in the County of SNOHOMISH, 
State of Washington, to-wit: UNIT 204, BUILD-
ING B, PHASE 2, MCKENDREE PARK, A 
CONDOMINIUM, ACCORDING TO THE DEC-
LARATION RECORDED UNDER RECORD-
ING NO. 200802120367 AND ANY AMEND-
MENTS THERETO, AND IN SURVEY MAP 
AND PLANS RECORDED UNDER RECORD-
ING NUMBER 200802125180, RECORDS OF 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. 
More commonly known as: 5012 146TH PL 
NE, UNIT B204, MARYSVILLE, WA 98271 
Subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
4/20/2021, recorded 4/28/2021, under Instru-
ment No. 202104280388 records of SNO-
HOMISH County, Washington, from JACOB 
MORAN, AN UNMARRIED MAN , as 
grantor(s), to FIDELITY NATIONAL TITLE 
COMPANY OF WASHINGTON, A WASHING-
TON CORP., as original trustee, to secure an 
obligation in favor of MORTGAGE ELEC-
TRONIC REGISTRATION SYSTEMS, INC., 
AS DESIGNATED NOMINEE FOR GUILD 
MORTGAGE COMPANY LLC, BENEFICIARY 
OF THE SECURITY INSTRUMENT, ITS SUC-
CESSORS AND ASSIGNS, as original benefi-
ciary, the beneficial interest in which was sub-
sequently assigned to Guild Mortgage 
Company LLC, the Beneficiary, under an as-
signment recorded under Auditors File Num-
ber 202407010350 II. No action commenced 
by the Beneficiary of the Deed of Trust as ref-
erenced in RCW 61.21.030(4) is now pending 
to seek satisfaction of the obligation in any 
Court by reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s 
default on the obligation secured by the Deed 
of Trust/Mortgage. III. The default(s) for which 
this foreclosure is made is/are as follows: Fail-
ure to pay when due the following amounts 
which are now in arrears: $7,935.11. IV. The 
sum owing on the obligation secured by the 
Deed of Trust is: The principal sum of 
$170,606.97, together with interest as provid-
ed in the Note from 1/1/2024 on, and such 
other costs, fees, and charges as are due un-
der the Note, Deed of Trust, or other instru-
ment secured, and as are provided by statute. 
V. The above-described real property will be 
sold to satisfy the expense of sale and the ob-
ligation secured by the Deed of Trust as pro-
vided by statute. Said sale will be made with-
out warranty, expressed or implied, regarding 
title, possession or encumbrances on 
12/27/2024. The defaults referred to in Para-
graph III must be cured by 12/16/2024 (11 
days before the sale date), or by other date as 
permitted in the Note or Deed of Trust, to 
cause a discontinuance of the sale. The sale 
will be discontinued and terminated if at any 
time before 12/16/2024 (11 days before the 
sale), or by other date as permitted in the Note 
or Deed of Trust, the default as set forth in 
Paragraph III is cured and the Trustee’s fees 
and costs are paid. Payment must be in cash 
or with cashiers or certified checks from a 
State or federally chartered bank. The sale 
may be terminated any time after the 
12/16/2024 (11 days before the sale date) and 
before the sale, by the Borrower or Grantor or 
the holder of any recorded junior lien or en-
cumbrance by paying the principal and inter-
est, plus costs, fees and advances, if any, 
made pursuant to the terms of the obligation 
and/or Deed of Trust, and curing all other de-
faults. VI. A written Notice of Default was 
transmitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee to 
the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s) by both first 
class and certified mail, proof of which is in the 
possession of the Trustee; and the Borrower 
and Grantor were personally served, if appli-
cable, with said written Notice of Default or the 
written Notice of Default was posted in a con-
spicuous place on the real property described 
in Paragraph I above, and the Trustee has 
possession of proof of such service or posting. 
The list of recipients of the Notice of Default is 
listed within the Notice of Foreclosure provid-
ed to the Borrower(s) and Grantor(s). These 
requirements were completed as of 7/12/2024. 
VII. The Trustee whose name and address are 
set forth below will provide in writing to any-
one requesting it, a statement of all costs and 
fees due at any time prior to the sale. VIII. The 
effect of the sale will be to deprive the Grantor 
and all those who hold by, through or under 
the Grantor of all their interest in the above-
described property. IX. Anyone having any 
objections to this sale on any grounds whatso-
ever will be afforded an opportunity to be 
heard as to those objections if they bring a 
lawsuit to restrain the sale pursuant to RCW 
61.24.130. Failure to bring such a lawsuit may 
result in a waiver of any proper grounds for 
invalidating the Trustee’s sale. X. NOTICE TO 
OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS -  The purchaser 
at the Trustee’s Sale is entitled to possession 
of the property on the 20th day following the 
sale, as against the Grantor under the deed of 
trust (the owner) and anyone having an inter-
est junior to the deed of trust, including occu-
pants who are not tenants. After the 20th day 
following the sale the purchaser has the right 
to evict occupants who are not tenants by 
summary proceedings under Chapter 59.12 
RCW. For tenant-occupied property, the pur-
chaser shall provide a tenant with written no-
tice in accordance with RCW 61.24.060. THIS 
NOTICE IS THE FINAL STEP BEFORE THE 
FORECLOSURE SALE OF YOUR HOME. 
You may be eligible for mediation. You have 
only until 90 calendar days BEFORE the date 
of sale listed in this Notice of Trustee Sale to 
be referred to mediation. If this is an amended 
Notice of Trustee Sale providing a 45-day no-
tice of the sale, mediation must be requested 
no later than 25 calendar days BEFORE the 
date of sale listed in this amended Notice of 
Trustee Sale. DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A 
HOUSING COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY 
LICENSED IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess 
your situation and refer you to mediation if you 
are eligible and it may help you save your 
home. See below for safe sources of help. 

SEEKING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors 
and legal assistance may be available at little 
or no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities to 
keep your house, you may contact the follow-
ing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for as-
sistance and referral to housing counselors 
recommended by the Housing Finance Com-
mission: Toll-free: 1-877-894-HOME (1-877-
894-4663) or Web site: http://www.dfi.wa.gov/
consumers/homeownership/post_purchase_
counselors_foreclosure.htm The United 
States Department of Housing and Urban De-
velopment: Toll-free: 1-800-569-4287 or Na-
tional Web Site: http://portal.hud.gov/hudpor-
tal/HUD or for Local counseling agencies in 
Washington: http://www.hud.gov/offices/hsg/
sfh/hcc/fc/index.cfm?webListAction=search&
searchstate=WA&filterSvc=dfc The statewide 
civil legal aid hotline for assistance and refer-
rals to other housing counselors and attor-
neys: Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 or Web 
site: http://nwjustice.org/what-clear Additional 
information provided by the Trustee: If you 
have previously been discharged through 
bankruptcy, you may have been released of 
personal liability for this loan in which case 
this letter is intended to exercise the notehold-
ers rights against the real property only. The 
Trustee’s Sale Number is WA-24-991960-SW. 
Dated: 8/22/2024 QUALITY LOAN SERVICE 
CORPORATION, as Trustee By: Rodica M 
Cirstioc, Assistant Secretary Trustee’s Ad-
dress: QUALITY LOAN SERVICE CORPORA-
TION 108 1 st Ave South, Suite 450, Seattle, 
WA 98104 For questions call toll-free: (866) 
925-0241 Trustee Sale Number: WA-24-
991960-SW Sale Line: 800-280-2832 or Login 
to: http://www. qualityloan.com IDSPub 
#0224033 11/27/2024 12/18/2024

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE TS No. 
174019   Grantor: Raul Caballero, unmarried 
man, as his sole and separate property Cur-
rent beneficiary of the deed of trust: UNITED 
WHOLESALE MORTGAGE, LLC. Current 
trustees of the deed of trust: Prime Recon LLC 
Current mortgage servicer of the deed of trust: 
Nationstar Mortgage, LLC Reference num-
ber of the deed of trust: 202003310911 and 
Modified by Modification recorded 9/22/2021 
by Instrument No. 202109220035 Parcel 
number(s): 00903800007000 I.   NOTICE IS 
HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned Trustee 
will, on 12/27/2024, at the hour of 10:00 AM 
On the steps in front of the North entrance 
to the Snohomish County Courthouse, 3000 
Rockefeller Avenue, Everett, WA 98201 in 
the City of Everett, State of Washington, sell 
at public auction to the highest and best bid-
der, payable at the time of sale, the following 
described real property, situated in the County 
of Snohomish, State of Washington, to-wit: 
LOT 70, KELLOGG VILLAGE DIVISION 
III, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF 
RECORDED UNDER RECORDING NO. 
199912225002, RECORDS OF SNOHOM-
ISH COUNTY, WASHINGTON. SITUATE IN 
THE COUNTY OF SNOHOMISH, STATE 
OF WASHINGTON. The postal address of 
which is more commonly known as: 10101 
62nd Dr NE, Marysville, WA 98270. which is 
subject to that certain Deed of Trust dated 
March 31, 2020, recorded March 31, 2020, 
under Auditor’s File No. 202003310911 and 
Modified by Modification recorded 9/22/2021 
by Instrument No. 202109220035, records 
of Snohomish County, Washington, from 
Raul Caballero, unmarried man, as his sole 
and separate property, as Grantor, to Wil-
liam L. Bishop, Esq, as Trustee, to secure 
an obligation in favor of Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems Inc. as designated 
nominee for United Wholesale Mortgage, a 
division of United Shore Financial Services, 
LLC., as Beneficiary, the beneficial interest 
in which was assigned, under an Assignment 
recorded 03/07/2023, under Auditor’s File No. 
202303070124 of official records in the Office 
of the Auditor of Snohomish County, Washing-
ton. II.   No action commenced by the Benefi-
ciary of the Deed of Trust is now pending to 
seek satisfaction of the obligation in any Court 
by reason of the Borrower’s or Grantor’s de-
fault on the obligation secured by the Deed of 
Trust.&emsp; III.   The default(s) for which this 
foreclosure is made is/are as follows: Failure 
to pay when due the following amounts which 
are now in arrears: $25,658.63; IV.   The sum 
owing on the obligation secured by the Deed 
of Trust is: Principal Balance of $361,855.21, 
together with interest as provided in the note 
or other instrument secured from 11/01/2023, 
and such other costs and fees as are due un-
der the Note or other instrument secured, and 
as are provided by statute. V. The above-de-
scribed real property will be sold to satisfy the 
expense of sale and the obligation secured by 
the Deed of Trust as provided by statute. The 
sale will be made without warranty, express or 
implied, regarding title, possession, or encum-
brances on the 27th day of December, 2024. 
The default(s) referred to in paragraph III 
must be cured by the 16th day of December, 
2024 (11 days before the sale date), to cause 
a discontinuance of the sale. The sale will be 
discontinued and terminated if at any time on 
or before the 16th day of December, 2024 (11 
days before the sale date), the default(s) as 
set forth in paragraph III is/are cured and the 
Trustee’s fees and costs are paid. The sale 
may be terminated any time after the 16th day 
of December, 2024 (11 days before the sale 
date), and before the sale by the Borrower, 
Grantor, any Guarantor, or the holder of any 
recorded junior lien or encumbrance paying 
the entire principal and interest secured by the 
Deed of Trust, plus costs, fees, and advances, 
if any, made pursuant to the terms of the ob-
ligation and/or Deed of Trust, and curing all 
other defaults. VI.   A written notice of default 
was transmitted by the Beneficiary or Trustee 
to the Borrower and Grantor at the following 
addresses: Current Occupant 10101 62nd 
Dr NE Marysville, WA 98270 All Unknown 
Persons, Parties, or Occupants 10101 62nd 
Dr NE Marysville, WA 98270 Raul Caballero 
10101 62nd Dr NE Marysville, WA 98270 Raul 
A. Caballero 10101 62nd Dr NE Marysville, 

WA 98270 by both first-class and certified mail 
on the 10th day of May, 2024, proof of which 
is in the possession of the Trustee; and the 
Borrower and Grantor were personally served 
on the 10th day of May, 2024, with said written 
notice of default or the written notice of default 
was posted in a conspicuous place on the real 
property described in paragraph I above, and 
the Trustee has possession of proof of such 
service or posting. VII.   The Trustee whose 
name and address are set forth below will 
provide in writing to anyone requesting it, a 
statement of all costs and fees due at any time 
prior to the sale. VIII.   The effect of the sale 
will be to deprive the Grantor and all those 
who hold by, through or under the Grantor 
of all their interest in the above-described 
property. IX.   Anyone having any objection 
to the sale on any grounds whatsoever will 
be afforded an opportunity to be heard as 
to those objections if they bring a lawsuit to 
restrain the sale pursuant to RCW 61.24.130. 
Failure to bring such a lawsuit may result in a 
waiver of any proper grounds for invalidating 
the Trustee’s sale. Prime Recon LLC 1330 N. 
Washington Street, Suite 3575 Spokane, WA 
99201 Phone: (888) 725-4142 COMPLIANCE 
WITH RCW 61.24.031, RCW 61.24.040 AND 
RCW 61.24.163, IF APPLICABLE: For owner-
occupied residential real property, before the 
Notice of Trustee’s Sale is recorded, transmit-
ted, or served, the beneficiary has complied 
with RCW 61.24.031, RCW 61,24.040, and if 
applicable, RCW 61.24.163 Prime Recon LLC 
Dated: 8/19/24 Devin Ormonde, Assistant 
Vice President  THIS NOTICE IS THE FINAL 
STEP BEFORE THE FORECLOSURE SALE 
OF YOUR HOME. You have only until 90 days 
BEFORE the date of sale listed in this Notice 
of Trustee’s Sale to be referred to mediation. 
It this is an Amended Notice of Trustee’s Sale 
providing a 45-day notice of the sale, media-
tion must be requested no later than 25 cal-
endar days BEFORE the date of sale listed 
in this Amended Notice of Trustee’s Sale. 
DO NOT DELAY. CONTACT A HOUSING 
COUNSELOR OR AN ATTORNEY LICENSED 
IN WASHINGTON NOW to assess your situ-
ation and refer you to mediation if you are 
eligible and it may help you save your home. 
See below for safe sources of help. SEEK-
ING ASSISTANCE Housing counselors and 
legal assistance may be available at little or 
no cost to you. If you would like assistance 
in determining your rights and opportunities 
to keep your house, you may contact the fol-
lowing: The statewide foreclosure hotline for 
assistance and referral to housing counselors 
recommended by the Housing Finance Com-
mission. Telephone: 1-877-894-HOME (4663)  
Website: https://dfi.wa.gov/homeownership/
mortgage-assistance-programs The United 
States Department of Housing and Urban De-
velopment. Telephone: 1-800-225-5342 Web-
site: https://www.hud.gov/program offices/
housing/sfh/fharesourcectr The statewide civil 
legal aid hotline for assistance and referrals 
to other housing counselors and attorneys. 
Telephone: 1-800-606-4819 Website: https://
nwiustice.org/get-legal-help X. NOTICE TO 
OCCUPANTS OR TENANTS  The purchaser 
at the trustee’s sale is entitled to possession 
of the property on the 20th day following the 
sale, as against the grantor under the deed 
of trust (the owner) and anyone having an 
interest junior to the deed of trust, includ-
ing occupants who are not tenants. After the 
20th day following the sale the purchaser has 
the right to evict occupants who are not ten-
ants by summary proceedings under chapter 
59.12 RCW. For tenantoccupied property, the 
purchaser shall provide a tenant with written 
notice in accordance with RCW 61.24.060. 
A-4823391 11/27/2024, 12/18/2024

Service by Publication
In the District court of the State of Washing-
ton for the county of Snohomish. Columbia 
Collectors, Inc. Plaintiff vs. Joshua Winter, 
Defendant Case No. C23-2501 The State of 
Washington to the said Joshua Winter; You 
are hereby summoned to appear within six 
weeks of the first publication of this summons, 
to wit, within six weeks after the October 23, 
2024, and defend the above entitled action 
in the above entitled court, and answer the 
complaint of the plaintiff, Columbia Collectors, 
Inc, and serve a copy of your answer upon 
the undersigned attorney for plaintiff, John 
Holtmann, at his office below stated; and in 
case of your failure to do so, judgment will be 
rendered against you according the demand 
of the complaint, which has been filed with 
the clerk of the court. The nature of the action 
for services rendered. John Holtmann WBN: 
17186 1014 Franklin St Vancouver, WA 98660 
(360) 750-7547 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23, 30, November 6, 
13, 20 & 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
COUNTY OF KING Estate of: GRETCHEN 
G. WHITNEY, Deceased. No. 24-4-07196-0 
SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
RCW 11.40.030 The Personal Representative 
named below Personal Representative has 
been appointed and has qualified as the Per-
sonal Representative of this estate. Any per-
son having a claim against the decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by: (1) serving on or mailing 
to the Personal Representative or the Person-
al Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim; and (2) filing 
the original of the claim with the court in which 
the probate proceedings were commenced. 
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) thirty days after the Personal Repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is 
effective as to claims against both the dece-
dent’s probate and nonprobate assets. Date of 

publication in Snohomish County: November 
13, 2024 Personal Representative: Elizabeth 
H. Whitney Attorney for the Personal Repre-
sentative: Denelle G. Reilly Address for Mail-
ing or Service: Denelle G. Reilly Macey-Cush-
man & Reilly, PLLC 320 Dayton Street, Suite 
112 Edmonds, Washington 98020 DATED: 
November 7, 2024 at Edmonds, Washing-
ton. MACEY-CUSHMAN & REILLY, PLLC s/ 
Denelle G. Reilly Denelle G. Reilly WSBA No 
38372 Attorney for Personal Representative 
Macey-Cushman & Reilly, PLLC 320 Day-
ton Street, Suite 112 Edmonds, Washington 
98020 Telephone: (206) 340-2200 E-mail: 
denelle@mcrlawfirm.com Published in the 
Snohomish County Tribune November 13, 20 
& 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
COUNTY OF KITSAP IN THE MATTER OF 
THE ESTATE OF JONATHAN JAMES NICH-
OLAS STANFIELD, DECEASED NO. 24-4-
01144-18 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS THE PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate.  Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
personal representative or the personal repre-
sentative’s attorney at the address stated be-
low a copy of the claim and filing the original 
of the claim with the court.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of:  (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
RCW 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. DATE OF FIRST 
PUBLICATION: November 13, 2024 STEPHA-
NIE WARD STANFIELD, Personal Represen-
tative By: AMANDA E. GROSSMAN, WSBA 
#40278 Attorney for Personal Representative 
ADDRESS FOR MAILING AND SERVICE: 
18925 Front Street NE PO Box 851 Poulsbo, 
WA 98370 Published in the Snohomish Coun-
ty Tribune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of HELEN A. 
FUNSTON, Deceased. NO. 24-4-40039-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) THE ADMINISTRATOR NAMED 
BELOW has been appointed as Administra-
tor of this estate. Any person having a claim 
against the decedent must, before the time 
the claim would be barred by any otherwise 
applicable statute of limitations, present the 
claim in the manner as provided in RCW 
11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
Administrator or the Administrator’ attorney 
at the address stated below a copy of the 
claim and filing the original of the claim with 
the court. The claim must be presented within 
the later of: (1) Thirty days after the Admin-
istrator served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and RCW 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: November 13, 2024 
/s/ BARBARA J. OGAARD Administrator of the 
Estate of HELEN A. FUNSTON Attorney for 
Administrator: Jody K. Reich, WSBA #29069 
Address for Mailing or Service: J. Reich Law, 
PLLC 209 4th Avenue South, Suite 101-A Ed-
monds, WA 98020 Jody Reich Law, PLLC 209 
4th Avenue South, Suite 101-A Edmonds, WA 
98020 Ph: (425) 940-0808 Fax: (425) 245-
5948 Published in the Snohomish County Tri-
bune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of KRIS S. 
REDDING, Deceased. NO. 24-4-40106-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE NAMED BELOW have been appointed 
as Personal Representative of this estate. 
Any person having a claim against the dece-
dent must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the Personal Representative or the 
Personal Representative’ attorney at the ad-
dress stated below a copy of the claim and 
filing the original of the claim with the court. 
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the Personal Repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and RCW 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: November 27, 2024 
/s/ Kellie R. Redding Personal Representative 
of the Estate of KRIS S. REDDING Attorney 
for Personal Representative: Jody K. Reich, 
WSBA #29069 Address for Mailing or Service: 
J. Reich Law, PLLC 209 4th Avenue South, 
Suite 101-A Edmonds, WA 98020 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of MI-
CHAEL C. PATNEAUDE, Deceased. No. 
24-4-02256-31 NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
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otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing 
to the personal representative or the per-
sonal representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which 
the probate proceedings were commenced. 
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the personal repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim 
is forever barred, except as otherwise pro-
vided in RCW 11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
DATE OF FIRST PUBLICATION: November 
13, 2024 Personal Representative: Jeffrey J. 
Patneaude Matthew R. Hendricks - Attorney 
for Personal Representative 402 5th Avenue 
South Edmonds, WA 98020 Phone (425) 775-
2751 Court of probate proceedings and cause 
number: Snohomish County Cause No. 24-4-
02256-31 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of REGINALD 
EVANS, Deceased. NO. 24-4-40108-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE NAMED BELOW have been appointed 
as Personal Representative of this estate. 
Any person having a claim against the dece-
dent must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the Personal Representative or the 
Personal Representative’ attorney at the ad-
dress stated below a copy of the claim and 
filing the original of the claim with the court.  
The claim must be presented within the later 
of: (1) Thirty days after the Personal Repre-
sentative served or mailed the notice to the 
creditor as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)
(c); or (2) four months after the date of first 
publication of the notice. If the claim is not 
presented within this time frame, the claim is 
forever barred, except as otherwise provided 
in RCW 11.40.051 and RCW 11.40.060. This 
bar is effective as to claims against both the 
decedent’s probate and nonprobate assets. 
Date of First Publication: November 27, 2024 
/s/ Simon J. Evans Personal Representative 
of the Estate of REGINALD EVANS Attorney 
for Personal Representative: Jody K. Reich, 
WSBA #29069 Address for Mailing or Service: 
J. Reich Law, PLLC 209 4th Avenue South, 
Suite 101-A Edmonds, WA 98020 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of: DENNIS 
DELMAINE PETERSEN, Deceased. NO. 24-
4-02238-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS RCW 11.40.030 The person named 
below has been appointed as Personal Rep-
resentative of this Estate.  Any person having 
a claim against the Decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below, a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the Court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced.  The 
claim must be presented within the later of: (i) 
thirty days after the Personal Representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (ii) 
four months after the date of first publication of 
this notice.  If the claim is not presented within 
this time frame, the claim is forever barred, ex-
cept as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and RCW 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as 
to claims against both the Decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. /S/ MARTIN CHAN-
DLER PETERSEN, Personal Representative 
Court of Probate Proceedings and Cause No: 
See Caption Above Date of First Publication: 
NOVEMBER 13, 2024. Attorney for Personal 
Representative: MICHAEL P. JACOBS, WSBA 
#22855 Riach Gese Jacobs, PLLC 7331 196th 
Street SW / PO Box 1067 Lynnwood, Wash-
ington 98046-1067 Telephone (425) 776-3191 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 13, 20 & 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of: GARY E. 
THOMAS, Deceased. NO. 24-4-40095-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS RCW 
11.40.030 The person named below has been 
appointed as Personal Representative of this 
Estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below, a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (i) thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as pro-
vided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (ii) four 
months after the date of first publication of this 
notice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
RCW 11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the Decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. DAVID A. THOMAS, 
Personal Representative Court of Probate 
Proceedings and Cause No:  See Caption 
Above Date of First Publication: November 27, 
2024 Attorney for Personal Representative: 
MICHAEL P. JACOBS, WSBA #22855 Riach 
Gese Jacobs, PLLC 7331 196th Street SW / 

PO Box 1067 Lynnwood, Washington 98046-
1067 Telephone (425) 776-3191 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY Estate of: KRIS-
TINA BORG, Deceased. NO. 24-4-00293-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS RCW 
11.40.030 The person named below has been 
appointed as Personal Representative of this 
Estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the Personal Rep-
resentative or the Personal Representative’s 
attorney at the address stated below, a copy 
of the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the Court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (i) thirty days 
after the Personal Representative served 
or mailed the notice to the creditor as pro-
vided under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (ii) four 
months after the date of first publication of this 
notice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, ex-
cept as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 
and RCW 11.40.060.  This bar is effective 
as to claims against both the Decedent’s 
probate and nonprobate assets. NANCY G. 
EDWARDS, Personal Representative Court 
of Probate Proceedings and Cause No: See 
Caption Above Date of First Publication:  No-
vember 27, 2024 Attorney for Personal Rep-
resentative: MICHAEL P. JACOBS, WSBA 
#22855 Riach Gese Jacobs, PLLC 7331 196th 
Street SW / PO Box 1067 Lynnwood, Wash-
ington 98046-1067 Telephone (425) 776-3191 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of BARBARA MYRLE OLSEN, De-
ceased.  No. 24-4-01871-31 PROBATE NO-
TICE TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 The 
personal representative named below has 
been appointed as personal representative of 
this estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the personal repre-
sentative or the personal representative’s at-
torney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced. The claim must be 
presented within the later of:  (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four (4) 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. DATE OF FILING COPY OF 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS with Clerk of Court: 
November 19, 2024 DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: November 27, 2024. PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE: TAMARA L. MONSON 
ATTORNEY FOR PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE: KRISTA MACLAREN, WSBA No. 27550 
ANDERSON HUNTER LAW FIRM, P.S. 2707 
Colby Ave., Suite 1001 Everett, WA  98201 
COURT OF PROBATE PROCEEDINGS: Sno-
homish County Superior Court AND CAUSE 
NUMBER: No. 24-4-01871-31 Published in 
the Snohomish County Tribune November 27, 
December 4 & 11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of GARY S. JESSOP, Deceased. 
No.  24-4-02234-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 The personal 
representative named below has been ap-
pointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the personal repre-
sentative or the personal representative’s at-
torney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of First Publication: 
November 20, 2024 Personal Representative: 
Gary S. Jessop, II Attorney for the Personal 
Representative: Tracie D. Paul Address for 
Mailing or Service: Antipolo & Paul Law Firm, 
P.S. 2825 Colby Ave., Ste. 203 Everett, WA 
98201 Court of probate proceedings: Sno-
homish County Superior Court Cause No.: 
24-4-02234-31 Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 20, 27 & December 
4, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of JAMES AUBREY FIELDER AND 
SHARON ANN FIELDER, Deceased. No. 24-
4-02274-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS RCW 11.40.030 The personal repre-
sentative named below has been appointed 
as personal representative of this estate.  Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute 
of limitations, present the claim in the man-

ner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving 
on or mailing to the personal representative 
or the personal representative’s attorney at 
the address stated below a copy of the claim 
and filing the original of the claim with the 
court in which the probate proceedings were 
commenced. The claim must be presented 
within the later of:  (1) Thirty days after the 
personal representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four (4) months 
after the date of first publication of the notice.  
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. DATE OF FILING COPY OF 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS with Clerk of Court: 
November 18, 2024. DATE OF FIRST PUB-
LICATION: November 20, 2024. PERSONAL 
REPRESENTATIVE: Michael Duane Birindelli, 
Jr. ATTORNEY FOR PERSONAL REPRE-
SENTATIVE: KRISTA MACLAREN, WSBA No. 
27550 ANDERSON HUNTER LAW FIRM, P.S. 
2707 Colby Avenue, Suite 1001 Everett, WA  
98201 COURT OF PROBATE PROCEED-
INGS: Snohomish County Superior Court 
CAUSE NUMBER: 24-4-02274-31 Published 
in the Snohomish County Tribune November 
20, 27 & December 4, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of: GEORGE MELVIN VAUGHN, De-
ceased. NO. 24-4-40026-31 PROBATE NO-
TICE TO CREDITORS RCW 11.40.030 The 
individual named below has been appointed 
as Personal Representative of this Estate. 
Any person having a claim against the Dece-
dent must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the Personal Representative or the 
Personal Representative’s attorney at the ad-
dress stated below, a copy of the claim and 
filing the original of the claim with the Clerk 
of this Court. The claim must be presented 
within the later of: (1) thirty (30) days after 
the Personal Representative served or mailed 
the notice to the creditor as provided under 
RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four (4) months after 
the date of the first publication of this notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
RCW 11.40.060. This bar is effective as to 
claims against both the Decedent’s probate 
and nonprobate assets. /s/ Michelle Faye 
Swanson, Personal Representative Date: 
11/7/24 Date of Filing Notice to Creditors with 
Clerk of the Court: November 13, 2024 Date 
of First Publication: November 20, 2024 Ad-
dress for Mailing or Service: GEORGE MEL-
VIN VAUGHN ESTATE c/o Hermes Law Firm, 
PS 1812 Hewitt Avenue, Suite 102 Everett, 
Washington 98201 Attorney for PR: Russel J. 
Hermes, WSBA #19276 Hermes Law Firm, PS 
1812 Hewitt Avenue, Suite 102 Everett, Wash-
ington, 98201 Telephone (425) 339-0990 Fac-
simile (425) 339-0960 E-mail: russh@herme-
slawfirm.com Court or Probate Proceedings: 
Snohomish County Superior Court, Everett, 
Washington Cause Number: 24-4-40026-31 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 20, 27 & December 4, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY TAIH, LLC, a Wash-
ington limited liability company, Plaintiff, vs. 
JERRY HAUGSTAD, ROBERT HAUGSTAD, 
and KENNETH HAUGSTAD, as the named 
heirs and devisees of ORVILLE EDWARD 
HAUGSTAD and BERNICE M. HAUGSTAD, 
deceased, and UNKNOWN HEIRS and DE-
VISEES OF ORVILLE EDWARD HAUGSTAD, 
deceased, Defendants. No. 24-2-08282-31 
SUMMONS BY PUBLICATION The State of 
Washington to the said UNKNOWN HEIRS 
AND DEVISEES OF ORVILLE EDWARD 
HAUGSTAD: You are hereby summoned to 
appear within sixty days after the date of the 
first publication of this summons, to wit, within 
sixty days after the 23rd day of October, 2024, 
and defend the above entitled action in the 
above entitled court, and answer the complaint 
of the plaintiff TAIH, LLC, and serve a copy of 
your answer upon the undersigned attorneys 
for plaintiff TAIH, LLC, at her (or their) office 
below stated; and in case of your failure so to 
do, judgment will be rendered against you ac-
cording to the demand of the complaint, which 
has been filed with the clerk of said court. This 
matter involves a Complaint to Quiet Title to 
Real Property. Dated this 18th day of Octo-
ber 2024. CARSON LAW GROUP, PLLC /s/
Holly Shannon Holly Shannon, WSBA #44957 
Attorney for Plaintiff CARSON LAW GROUP, 
PLLC 3113 ROCKEFELLER AVE EVERETT, 
WASHINGTON 98201 (425) 493-5000 (425) 
493-5004 (FAX) Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune October 23, 30, November 6, 
13, 20, 27, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR KING COUNTY IN THE MATTER 
OF THE ESTATE OF EVERARDO J. ESPI-
NOSA, Deceased. Probate No.  24-4-07813-
1 SEA PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
(RCW 11.40.030) THE PERSONAL REP-
RESENTATIVE NAMED BELOW has been 
appointed as personal representative of this 
estate.  Any person having a claim against 
the Decedent must, before the time the claim 
would be barred by any otherwise applicable 
statute of limitations, present the claim in the 
manner as provided in RCW 11.40.070 by 
serving on or mailing to the personal repre-
sentative or the personal representative’s at-
torney at the address stated below a copy of 
the claim and filing the original of the claim 
with the court in which the probate proceed-
ings were commenced.  The claim must be 
presented within the later of:  (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(1)(c); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 

notice.  If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060.  This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the Decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of first publication: 
November 27, 2024 Personal Representa-
tive:  Andre Everardo Espinosa Attorney for 
Personal Representative: John S. McMas-
ters, WSBA #17026, Mullavey, Prout, Grenley 
& Foe, LLP, 2401 NW 65th St., Seattle, WA  
98117 Published in the Snohomish County 
Tribune November 27, December 4 & 11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY IN THE 
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF DIANA I. 
OLSON, DECEASED.  No. 24-4-40047-31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
personal representative or the personal repre-
sentative’s attorney at the address stated be-
low a copy of the claim and filing the original 
of the claim with the court. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
nonprobate assets. Date of first publication: 
November 20, 2024 PERSONAL REPRESEN-
TATIVE Roger Thorson Attorney for Personal 
Representative: Gary L. Baker Baker Law 
Firm, P.S. (360) 659-7800 Address for Mail-
ing or Service: Baker Law Firm, P.S. 1802 
Grove Street Marysville, Washington 98270 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 20, 27 & December 4, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY IN THE 
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF JOAN H. SE-
VERSON HUBBARD, DECEASED. No. 24 
4 40055 31 PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDI-
TORS (RCW 11.40.030) The personal repre-
sentative named below has been appointed 
as personal representative of this estate. Any 
person having a claim against the decedent 
must, before the time the claim would be 
barred by any otherwise applicable statute of 
limitations, present the claim in the manner as 
provided in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or 
mailing to the personal representative or the 
personal representative’s attorney at the ad-
dress stated below a copy of the claim and fil-
ing the original of the claim with the court. The 
claim must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty days after the personal representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. Date of first publication: No-
vember 20, 2024 PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE Jerry M. Hubbard Attorney for Personal 
Representative: Gary L. Baker Baker Law 
Firm, P.S. (360) 659-7800 Address for Mail-
ing or Service: Baker Law Firm, P.S. 1802 
Grove Street Marysville, Washington 98270 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 20, 27 & December 4, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON IN 
AND FOR SNOHOMISH COUNTY IN THE 
MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF MARY N. 
FAHLEY, DECEASED. No. 24 4 40056 31 
PROBATE NOTICE TO CREDITORS (RCW 
11.40.030) The personal representative 
named below has been appointed as personal 
representative of this estate. Any person hav-
ing a claim against the decedent must, before 
the time the claim would be barred by any 
otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided in 
RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to the 
personal representative or the personal repre-
sentative’s attorney at the address stated be-
low a copy of the claim and filing the original 
of the claim with the court. The claim must be 
presented within the later of: (1) Thirty days 
after the personal representative served or 
mailed the notice to the creditor as provided 
under RCW 11.40.020(3); or (2) four months 
after the date of first publication of the notice. 
If the claim is not presented within this time 
frame, the claim is forever barred, except as 
otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and non-
probate assets. Date of first publication: No-
vember 20, 2024 PERSONAL REPRESENTA-
TIVE Michele R. Fahley Attorney for Personal 
Representative: Gary L. Baker Baker Law 
Firm, P.S. (360) 659-7800 Address for Mail-
ing or Service: Baker Law Firm, P.S. 1802 
Grove Street Marysville, Washington 98270 
Published in the Snohomish County Tribune 
November 20, 27 & December 4, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON SNO-
HOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the Estate 
of LEANN CAMPBELL SCHURR, Deceased. 
No. 24-4-40081-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The person 
named below has been appointed as Person-
al Representative of this estate. Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 

stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced. The 
claim must be presented within the later of: (1) 
Thirty days after the Personal Representative 
served or mailed the notice to the creditor as 
provided under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) four 
months after the date of first publication of the 
notice. If the claim is not presented within this 
time frame, the claim is forever barred, except 
as otherwise provided in RCW 11.40.051 and 
11.40.060. This bar is effective as to claims 
against both the decedent’s probate and 
non-probate assets. Date of first publication 
November 27, 2024 Personal Representative 
Michael Scott Adair Attorney for the Personal 
Representative Jeffrey E. Pratt Address for 
Mailing or Service 4220 132nd Street SE. 
Suite 201 Mill Creek, WA 98012 Court of 
probate proceedings and cause no. Snohom-
ish County Superior Court Cause No. 24-4-
40081-31 /s/ Michael Scott Adair Personal 
Representative MARSH MUNDORF PRATT 
SULLIVAN + McKenzie, P.S.C. JEFFREY E. 
PRATT, WSBA 10702 Attorneys for Personal 
Representative Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 27, December 4 & 
11, 2024

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON 
SNOHOMISH COUNTY In the Matter of the 
Estate of STEPHEN VAUGHAN, Deceased. 
No. 24-4-01875-31 PROBATE NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS (RCW 11.40.030) The person 
named below has been appointed as Person-
al Representative of this estate. Any person 
having a claim against the Decedent must, 
before the time the claim would be barred by 
any otherwise applicable statute of limitations, 
present the claim in the manner as provided 
in RCW 11.40.070 by serving on or mailing to 
the Personal Representative or the Personal 
Representative’s attorney at the address 
stated below a copy of the claim and filing the 
original of the claim with the court in which the 
probate proceedings were commenced. The 
claim must be presented within the later of: 
(1) Thirty days after the Personal Representa-
tive served or mailed the notice to the creditor 
as provided under RCW 11.40.020(1); or (2) 
four months after the date of first publication 
of the notice. If the claim is not presented 
within this time frame, the claim is forever 
barred, except as otherwise provided in RCW 
11.40.051 and 11.40.060. This bar is effec-
tive as to claims against both the decedent’s 
probate and non-probate assets. Date of first 
publication November 20, 2024 Personal 
Representative Michael Vaughan Attorney for 
the Personal Representative Danielle U. Pratt 
Address for Mailing or Service 4220 132nd 
Street SE. Suite 201 Mill Creek. WA 98012 
Court of probate proceedings and cause no. 
Snohomish County Superior Court Cause No. 
24-4-01875-31 /s/ Michael Vaughan Personal 
Representative MARSH MUNDORF PRATT 
SULLIVAN + McKENZIE P.S.C. /s/ Danielle 
U. Watt. WSBA #44129 Attorney for Personal 
Representative Published in the Snohomish 
County Tribune November 20, 27 & December 
4, 2024

Superior Court of Washington, County of 
Snohomish In re: Guardianship of Saphira 
Navarro Respondent (minors/children) No. 
24-4-00182-31 Summons Served by Publica-
tion (SMPB) Summons Served by Publication 
To (other party’s name/s): Unknown father 
of Saphira Navarro I have started a court 
case by filing a petition. The name of the 
Petition is: Guardianship of Saphira Navarro 
You must respond in writing if you want the 
court to consider your side. Deadline! Your 
Response must be filed and served within 60 
days of the date this Summons is published: 
October 30, 2024. If you do not file and serve 
your Response or a Notice of Appearance 
by the deadline: •  No one has to notify you 
about other hearings in this case, and •  The 
court may approve the requests in the Peti-
tion without hearing your side (called a default 
judgment). Follow these steps: 1. Read the 
Petition and any other documents that were 
filed at court with this Summons. Those docu-
ments explain what the other party is asking 
for. 2. Fill out a Response on this form (check 
the Response that matches the Petition): [X] 
Other (specify):GDN M 301 Objection to Mi-
nor Guardianship You can get the Response 
form and other forms you may need at: •  The 
Washington State Courts’ website: www.
courts.wa.gov/forms •  Washington LawHelp: 
www.washingtonlawhelp.org, or •  The Supe-
rior Court Clerk’s office or county law library 
(for a fee). 3. Serve (give) a copy of your Re-
sponse to the person who filed this Summons 
at the address below, and to any other parties. 
You may use certified mail with return receipt 
requested. For more information on how to 
serve, read Superior Court Civil Rule 5. 4. File 
your original Response with the court clerk at 
this address: Superior Court Clerk, Snohom-
ish County 3000 Rockefeller M/S 605 Everett 
WA 98201 5. Lawyer not required: It is a good 
idea to talk to a lawyer, but you may file and 
serve your Response without one. Person 
filing this Summons or his/her lawyer fills 
out below: /s/ Gabrielle Wesson 10/21/2024 
I agree to accept legal papers for this case 
at (check one): [x] the following address (this 
does not have to be your home a address): 
P.O. Box 802 Darrington, WA  98241 (If this 
address changes before the case ends, you 
must notify all parties and the court in writing. 
You may use the Notice of Address Change 
form (FL All Family 120). You must also up-
date your Confidential Information Form (FL 
All Family 001) if this case involves parent-
age or child support.) Note: You and the other 
party/ies may agree to accept legal papers by 
email under Superior Court Civil Rule 5 and 
local court rules. This Summons is issued ac-
cording to Rule 4.1 of the Superior Court Civil 
Rules of the state of Washington. Published 
in the Snohomish County Tribune October 30, 
November 6, 13, 20, 27 & December 4, 2024


